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Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office 





Purchasing Department 

P.O. Box 3371








Jock McGlathery, Buyer

Tampa, FL  33601 







(813) 247-8048


	Bid Number: 14-02

Bid Title: Inmate Clothing-other

Opened: 06-13-02  @ 3:00 PM

Awarded: 

Part 1 of 2

Page 1 of 4

SHADED ITEM INDICATES AN AWARD
	PACK/QUANTITY.
	Acme Supply Co.

44 South Bayles Avenue #210

Port Washington, NY 11050

Suwanda Gordon

800-338-2425  PH

800-338-9868  FX
	Leslee Scott Inc.

1631 W. 2550 South

Ogden, UT 84401

David Fullmer

801-622-5741 PH

801-622-5895 FX 
	Hamilton Uniforms

5 Chesterfield Road

Crosswicks, NJ 08515

S. Fenick

609-393-4000 PH

609-298-3541 FX
	 Murray & Co.

P. O. Box 6010

Charlotte, NC 28207

Not Given

No phone number given

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4

	1.  Panties, women’s, white, black color 1” stenciled garment size on left front area, 100% cotton, elastic leg, brief style, sizes range from 5 to 13.  (Stenciled)
	2400 dz
	Note 1

Sz  5-13   12.95/dz
	Note 2, 3, 4, 6

Sz 5-7          9.34/dz

Sz 8-10        9.84/dz

Sz 11-13      10.84/dz
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Brand/Stock No.:
	
	166AA-SN
	PT6040WH
	
	

	2.  Brassieres, white, black colored 1” stenciled garment size on left front area, elastics inserts & adjustable straps, 100% cotton of cotton blend, sizes range from 32A to 48D.  (Stenciled)
	1200 dz
	Note 1

32A-48D 27.00/dz


	Note 2, 3, 4, 8

A-C Cups     25.95/dz

D Cups         29.95/dz
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Brand/Stock No.:
	
	97311-SN
	Elsie BR6040
	
	

	3. Undershorts, mens, boxer type, white, black color 1” stenciled garment size on left front on boxer, 60/40 cotton/polyester blend, 60% cotton minimum, sizes range from small to 15X.  (Stenciled)


	3600 dz
	Note 1

Sm-15X     2.00/ea
	Note 2, 3, 4

S-XL         16.91/dz

2XL           17.91/dz

3XL           18.91/dz

4XL           19.91/dz

5XL           20.91/dz

6XL           22.91/dz

7XL           24.91/dz

8XL           24.91/dz

9XL           29.91/dz

10XL         34.91/dz

11XL         39.91/dz

12XL         42.91/dz

13XL         46.91/dz

14XL         50.91/dz

15XL         54.91/dz

	No Bid
	No Bid

	Brand/Stock No.:
	
	961AA-SN
	BX6040
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	Acme Supply
	Leslee Scott Inc.
	Hamilton Uniforms
	Murray & Co.

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4

	4. Panties, women, cotton/polyester blend, 60% cotton minimum, elastic leg, brief style, sizes range from 5 to 13.  (Non-stenciled)
	2400

dz.
	Sz 5-13  12.00/dz
	Note 6

Sz 5-7            6.89/dz

Sz 8-10          7.39/dz

Sz 11-13        8.39/dz
	Note 2, 8

Sz 5-8             11.69/dz

Sz 9-10           12.29/dz

Sz  11-13        17.29/dz
	Note 7

No size/price given

	Brand/Stock No.:
	
	16AA
	PT6040WH
	Carole #625
	631

	5. Brassieres, white, elastic inserts & adjustable straps, 60/40 cotton polyester blend, 60% cotton minimum, sizes range from 32A to 48D.

(Non-stenciled)
	1200

dz
	Note 2, 8

Sz 32A-48D 25.80/dz
	Note 2, 8

A-C Cups     18.49/dz

D Cups         21.49/dz
	Note 2, 8

Sz 32A-36A, 32B-38B, 32C-40C    23.41/dz

Sz  40B-52B, 42C-52C, 34D-52D    28.31/dz


	Note 7

No size/price given

	Brand/Stock No.:
	
	97311
	Elsie BR6040
	QT #1166
	1300

	6. Undershorts, men, boxer type, white, 60/40 cotton/ polyester blend, 60% cotton minimum, sizes range from small to 15X. (Non-stenciled)
	3600

dz
	Sz sm-15X  1.90/ea
	Sm-XL             14.91/dz

2XL                  15.91/dz

3XL                  16.91/dz

4XL                   17.91/dz

5XL                   18.91/dz

6XL                   20.91/dz

7XL                   22.91/dz

8XL                   22.91/dz

9XL                   27.91/dz

10XL                 32.91/dz

11XL                 37.91/dz

12XL                 40.91/dz

13XL                 44.91/dz

14XL                 48.91/dz

15XL                 52.91/dz
	Note 2, 8

SM-XL 
1.25/ea

2X-5X
 1.46/ea

6X-10X
1.63/ea

11X-15X 
1.80/ea
	Note 7

No size/price given

	Brand/Stock No.:
	
	961AA
	BX6040
	FM Champion #KBXR
	BXR

	Exceptions:
	
	NO
	Note 3, 6
	NO
	NA

	Samples:
	
	YES
	YES
	YES
	YES








NOTE 1: No stenciled sample submitted 

NOTE 2:  Does not meet specs

NOTE 3: Boxer short stenciling offered on an all or none basis

NOTE 4: Does not have 1” black stenciling

NOTE 5: Samples have holes from vendor’s supplier

NOTE 6: Sizes 14-16 available in panties

NOTE 7: No bid documents forwarded

NOTE 8: Less than 60% cotton minimum
NOTE 1: No stenciled sample submitted 

NOTE 2:  Does not meet specs

NOTE 3: Boxer short stenciling offered on an all or none basis

NOTE 4: Does not have 1” black stenciling

NOTE 5: Samples have holes from vendor’s supplier

NOTE 6: Sizes 14-16 available in panties

NOTE 7: No bid documents forwarded

NOTE 8: Less than 60% cotton minimum

