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 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1
 18-02 BID TABULATION

	BID  NUMBER: 18-02

Port Patrol Vessel

Opened: August 9, 2002 @ 3:00 PM

Awarded: 9/30/2002

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
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	SILVER SHIPS INC

9243 BELLINGRATH RD

THEODORE, AL

36582

PHONE: 251-973-0000

FAX: 251-973-2711  

CONTACT: JASON POWERS
	DESIGN CONCEPTS

265 BOEING AVE 

CHICO, CA

95973

PHONE: 530-343-2232

FAX: 530-343-7415

CONTACT: DAVID W NEFF
	BOSTON WHALER

420 MEGAN AVENUE

EDGEWATER , FL

32132

PHONE: 850-539-9191

FAX: 850-539-7714

CONTACT: DON ELLINGSON
	SEA ARK

PO BOX 210

MONTICELLO, AR

71657

PHONE: 870-367-9755

FAX: 870-367-2120

CONTACT: KEN McFALLS

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4

	Boat, Trailer & Accessories

24 ft Propeller Stern Drive

24 ft Water Propulsion Drive
	
	NO BID

NO BID
	$100,950.00

$135,950.00
	NO BID

NO BID
	$153,143.00

NO BID

	Boat, Trailer & Accessories

25 ft Propeller Stern Drive

25 ft Water Propulsion Drive
	
	NO BID

NO BID
	$101,950.00

$136,950.00
	NO BID

NO BID
	$154,871.00

NO BID

	Boat, Trailer & Accessories

26 ft Propeller Stern Drive

26 ft Water Propulsion Drive
	
	NO BID

NO BID
	$102,950.00

$137,950.00
	NO BID

NO BID
	$157,079.00

NO BID

	Boat, Trailer & Accessories

27 ft Propeller  Stern Drive

27 ft Water Propulsion Drive
	
	$179,750.00 YANMAR MOTOR

$206,750.00
	$104,950.00 MERCRUISER MOTOR

          $117,600.00 YANMAR MOTOR      

$139,950.00
	$181.232.00 MERCRUISER MOTOR

         $193,232.00 YANMAR MOTOR

NO BID
	     $161,902.00 MERCRUISER MOTOR

          $177,051.00 YANMAR MOTOR

NO BID

	Boat, Trailer & Accessories

28 ft Propeller Stern Drive

28 ft Water Propulsion Drive
	
	$182,750.00

$209,750.00
	$106,950.00

$141,950.00
	NO BID

NO BID
	$212,604.00

NO BID


	BID  NUMBER: 18-02

Port Patrol Vessel

Opened: August 9, 2002 @ 3:00 PM

Awarded: 
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	SILVER SHIPS INC

9243 BELLINGRATH RD

THEODORE, AL

36582

PHONE: 251-973-0000

FAX:251-973-2711  

CONTACT: JASON POWERS
	DESIGN CONCEPTS

265 BOEING AVE 

CHICO, CA

95973

PHONE: 530-343-2232

FAX: 530-343-7415

CONTACT: DAVID W NEFF
	BOSTON WHALER

420 MEGAN AVENUE

EDGEWATER , FL

32132

PHONE: 850-539-9191

FAX: 850-539-7714

CONTACT: DON ELLINGSEN
	SEA ARK

PO BOX 210

MONTICELLO, AR

71657

PHONE: 870-367-9755

FAX: 870-367-2120

CONTACT: KEN McFALLS

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4

	Boat, Trailer & Accessories

29 ft Propeller Stern Drive

29 ft Water Propulsion Drive
	
	$185,750.00

$212,750.00
	$108,950.00

$143,950.00
	NO BID

NO BID
	$216,648.00

NO BID

	Boat, Trailer & Accessories

30 ft Propeller Stern Drive

30 ft Water Propulsion Drive
	
	$188,750.00

$215,750.00
	$110,950.00

$145,950.00
	NO BID

 NO BID
	$220,538.00

NO BID

	EXCEPTIONS
	
	STANDARD VESSEL 200 HP   INBOARD OUTBOARD  TWIN DIESELS 

MOTOR MFG: MERCRUISER-YANMAR

315 HP WATERJET  ADD $27,000.00

ALUMINUM HULL-STD-8FT 6IN BEAM
	STANDARD VESSEL 200 HP INBOARD OUTBOARD  TWIN DIESELS

MOTOR MFG:  YANMAR

315 HP WATER JET ADD $35,000.00

ALUMINIUM HULL- 8FT 6IN BEAM
	STANDARD VESSEL 250 HP INBOARD OUTBOARD TWIN DIESELS

MOTOR MFG:  MERCRUISER

NO BID ON WATER JET

FIBERGLASS  HULL-10FT BEAM
	STD VESSEL 24-27FT 200 HP 26-30FT 270 HP INBOARD OUTBOARD TWIN DIESELS

4 MAN CABIN / TWO TONE PAINT JOB

MOTOR MFG:  MERCRUISER-YANMAR

NO BID ON WATER JET

ALUMINIUM HULL- 8FT 6IN 24-27FT

ALUMINUM HULL – 10FT 28-35FT

	LIMITED WARRANTY:
	
	1- YEAR BOAT WILL BE FREE FROM DEFECTS CAUSED BY FAULTY WORKMANSHIP

5- YEAR HULL, DECK AND CONSOLE OF THE COVERED BOAT FROM STRUCTURAL DEFECTS FROM FAULTY WORKMANSHIP OR MATERIALS
	10-YEAR HULL AGAINST DEFECTS OF ENGINEERING, WORKMANSHIP, AND MATERIALS.

ENGINE: FULL MANUFACTURES WARRANTY

COMPONENT PARTS: RESPECTIVE MFG WARRANTY
	LIMITED COMMERCIAL WARRANTY:

5- YEAR PRO-RATA BASIS

HULL- UN-SINKABLE

PRICE INCLUDES SHIPPING $950.00


	1- YEAR HULL STRUCTURE

1- YEAR ACCESSORIES INSTALLED BY SEA ARC

10- YEAR HULL PUNCTURE WARRANTY




18-02 BID TABULATION

Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office


P.O. Box 3371


Tampa, FL  33601							
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Purchasing Unit


Bill Moyer, Buyer


(813) 247-8053
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