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BID TABULATION
	Bid Number: 22-02

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened:  October 24, 2002 @ 3:00 PM

Awarded: 12/05/02 


Page 1 of 5
	Bob Wilson Dodge Inc                      

11945 N Florida Ave                      

Tampa, Fl 33612

George Mcnally                         

PH: 813-933-6343

FX: 813-933-6508 
	Bill Currie Ford

5815 N. Dale Mabry Hwy.

Tampa, Fl 33614

Jeff Adelman

PH: 813-357-6785

FX: 813-554-5363
	Jerry Ulm Dodge

2966 N. Dale Mabry Hwy.

Tampa, Fl 33622

Frank Mangano

PH: 813-872-6645

FX: 813-875-0132
	Maroone Dodge, LLC 

21151 N.W. 2 nd Avenue

Miami, Fl 33169

Steven Henry

PH: 305-653-6343

FX: 305-653-8250
	Hill Kelly Dodge

6171 Pensacola Blvd.

Pensacola, Fl  32505

Paul Fiveash

PH: 800-633-8591

FX: 850-478-5392
	Whiteside Chevrolet Olds Inc.

50714 National Road

St. Clairsville, OH 43950

Brian McCulley

PH: 800-610-0211

FX: 740-699-2475

	Spec #01 - Full Size 4-Door Ford P71 Police Package
	No Bid
	20,042.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Brand/Model
	  
	Ford Crown Victoria P71 720A Police Package
	
	
	
	

	Spec #02 - Full Size 4-Door Administrative Vehicle
	14,152.00
	19,527.00


	14,528.00
	14,166.00
	14,978.00


	16,980.00

	Brand/Model
	Dodge Intrepid SE LHDH41
	Ford Crown Victoria     P73-100B
	Dodge Intrepid LHDH41
	Dodge Intrepid LHDH41
	Dodge Intrepid LHDH41
	Chevrolet Impala 1WF19

	Bid Number: 22-02

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: October 24, 2002 @ 3:00 PM

Awarded:  


Page 2 of 5
	Bob Wilson Dodge Inc                      

11945 N Florida Ave                      

Tampa, Fl 33612

George Mcnally                         

PH: 813-933-6343

FX: 813-933-6508
	Bill Currie Ford

5815 N. Dale Mabry Hwy.

Tampa, FL 33614  

Jeff Adelman

PH: 813-357-6785

FX: 813-554-5363
	Jerry Ulm Dodge

2966 N. Dale Mabry Hwy.

Tampa, Fl 33622

Frank Mangano

PH: 813-872-6645

FX: 813-875-0132
	Maroone Dodge, LLC 

21151 N.W. 2 nd Avenue

Miami, Fl 33169

Steven Henry

PH: 305-653-6343

FX: 305-653-8250
	Hill Kelly Dodge

6171 Pensacola Blvd.

Pensacola, Fl  32505

Paul Fiveash

PH: 800-633-8591

FX: 850-478-5392
	Whiteside Chevrolet Olds Inc.

50714 National Road

St. Clairsville, OH 43950

Brian McCulley

PH: 800-610-0211

FX: 740-699-2475

	Spec #03 - Mid Size 4-Door Administrative Vehicle


	No Bid
	14,365.00
	13,108.00
	12,178.00
	13,896.00
	15,460.00

	Brand/Model
	
	Ford Taurus P52110A
	Dodge Stratus JRDM41
	Dodge Stratus JRDM41
	Dodge Stratus JRDM41
	Chevrolet Malibu 1ND69


AWARD: Award to the lowest responsible and responsive bidder meeting specifications by manufacturer. The prices shown above are for the base unit vehicle as specified in the bid. Please reference following pages for additional add and delete options.

Copies of the bidders response are available upon request, contact the Buyer.

	Bid Number: 22-02 Pg 3 of 5 

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: October 24, 2002 @ 3:00 P.M.
	Bob Wilson Dodge

George McNally

933-6343
	Bill Currie Ford

Jeff Adelman

813-357-6785
	Maroone Dodge LLC

Steven Henry

305-653-6343
	Jerry Ulm Dodge

Frank Mangano

872-6645
	Hill Kelly Dodge

Paul Fiveash

800-633-8591
	Whiteside Chevrolet Olds

Brian McCulley

800-610-0211

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
1
	
                         2
	
           3
	
      4
	
	
            5

	Spec #01- Full Size 4-Door Ford Crown Vic P71Police Package
	No Bid
	20,042.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Model Order Code:
	
	P71 720A Crown Victoria
	
	
	
	

	Engine Size:
	
	4.6L V8
	
	
	
	

	List options required to equal base bid:
	
	Cloth front seat/Vinyl rear seat, deck release ,ignigtion powered, ABS brakes
	
	
	
	

	Delivery Time /  Warranty Period:
	
	NA         3/36,000
	
	
	
	

	Safety flashing lights mounted under deckled:
	
	80.00
	
	
	
	

	Roof - reinforcement
	
	70.00
	
	
	
	

	Rear Deck Warning lights R/B dealer inst.
	
	80.00
	
	
	
	

	Accessory feed wires for Police equipment
	
	Included
	
	
	
	

	Limited slip
	
	95.00
	
	
	
	

	Wiring for roof mounted lightbar L or R
	
	95.00
	
	
	
	

	Roof w/hole
	
	105.00
	
	
	
	

	Left side pillar mounted 6" spotlight Fty inst
	
	Included
	
	
	
	

	Left side pillar mounted 6" spotlight Dealer
	
	NA
	
	
	
	

	Rear door locks inoperative
	
	20.00
	
	
	
	

	Rear door handles inoperative
	
	20.00
	
	
	
	

	Rear windows inoperative
	
	20.00
	
	
	
	

	Safety bumper guards
	
	360.00
	
	
	
	

	Complete set of service manuals
	
	150.00
	
	
	
	

	Third key
	
	18.00
	
	
	
	

	AM/FM cassette radio
	
	185.00
	
	
	
	

	Extended Warranties:
	
	None Listed
	
	
	
	

	Additional Add Options
	
	None listed
	
	
	
	

	Exceptions
	
	None listed
	
	
	
	

	Bid Number:  22-02 Pg 4 of 5

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: October 24, 2002  @ 3:00 P.M.
	Bob Wilson Dodge

George McNally

933-6343
	Bill Currie Ford

Jeff Adelman

813-357-6785
	Maroone Dodge LLC

Steven Henry

305-653-6343
	Jerry Ulm Dodge

Frank Mangano

872-6645
	Hill Kelly Dodge

Paul Fiveash

800-633-8591
	Whiteside Chevrolet Olds

Brian McCulley

800-610-0211

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
1
	
                     2
	
      3
	
             4
	5
	
            6

	Spec. #02 - Full size 4-door

Administrative Vehicle
	14,152.00
	19,527.00
	14,166.00
	14,528.00
	14,978.00
	16,980.00

	Model Order Code:
	LHDH41
	P73-100B
	LHDH41
	LHDH41
	LHDH41
	1WF19

	Delivery time:
	90-120 days
	NA
	60-90 days
	90-120 days
	60-120 Days
	90 Days

	Engine Size:
	2.7L  V-6  200 H.P.
	4.6 Liter V-8
	2.7L V6
	2.7L DOHC 24 valve V6
	2.7L  V6
	3.4 Liter /  6 cyl

	Wheelbase:
	113"
	114.7”
	113”
	113”
	113"
	110.5”

	List options required to equal base bid:
	Anti lock Brakes

Speed Control
	NA
	NA
	Speed control, Anti Lock Brakes
	Anti-Lock brakes

Speed Control
	ABS 4whl disc brakes

Floormats

Cruise Control

	Warranty statement:
	3/36,000 miles- 7/70 powertrain
	3/36,000 miles
	NA
	3/36,000, 7/70,000 powertrain
	3/36,000, 7/70,000 drive train
	3/36,000

	2-dr vehicle
	NA
	NA
	N/A
	NA
	NA
	NA

	Engine
	NA
	NA
	N/A
	NA
	3.5L V6       2,556.00
	3..8 Liter / 6 Cylinder

	Full size spare tire
	147.00
	105.00
	147.00
	142.59
	160.00
	238.00

	Complete set service manuals
	77.00
	150.00
	125.00
	90.00
	185.00
	190.00

	Keyless entry
	179.00
	240.00
	225.00
	215.00
	225.00
	310.00

	Ford P74 package
	NA
	2,995.00
	NA
	NA
	NA
	NA

	Ext Warranties:
	7/70,000-1,335.00 +Tax
	NA
	5/70,000      895.00

5/85,000     1,140.00
	5/85,000 (Ext. care)    1,245.00

5/70,000 (Max care)   1,245.00
	5/85,000                      1,590.00

6/100,000                    2,400.00
	GMPP Majorguard         1,960.00

GMPP Valueguard         1,760.00

	Additional Options:
	NA
	NA
	None listed
	None listed
	Power seats                     380.00

Smoker’s Group                 30.00
	None Listed

	Delete Options:
	NA
	NA
	Speed Control      197.00

ABS                     490.00   
	ABS 535.44

Speed Control 209.52
	ABS brakes                    484.00

Speed control                 198.00
	Floormats                     34.40

ABS Brakes                 516.00

Speed Control             215.00

	Exceptions to Bid:
	None listed
	None listed
	None listed
	No sound insulation package available
	None listed
	None listed


	Bid Number: 22-02
Pg 5 of 5

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: October 24, 2002 @ 3:00 P.M.
	Bob Wilson Dodge

George McNally

933-6343
	Bill Currie Ford

Jeff Adelman

813-357-6785
	Maroone Dodge LLC

Steven Henry

305-653-6343
	Jerry Ulm Dodge

Frank Mangano

872-6645
	Hill Kelly Dodge

Paul Fiveash

800-633-8591
	Whiteside Chevrolet

Brian McCulley

800-610-0211

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
1
	
                     2
	
     3
	
             4
	
          5
	6

	Spec #03 - Mid Size 4-door 

Administrative Vehicle
	No Bid
	14,365.00
	12,178.00
	13,108.00
	13,896.00
	15,460.00

	Model Order Code:
	
	P52110A
	JRDM41
	JRDM41
	JRDM41 
	1ND69

	Delivery Time:
	
	NA
	60 – 90 days
	90-120 days
	60-120 days
	75 Days

	Engine Size/HP:
	
	3.0 Liter  155 H.P.
	2.7 200 H.P.
	2.7L V6 
	2.7L V6 200H.P.
	3.1 Liter V6

	Wheel Base:
	
	108.5”
	108”
	108”
	108"
	107”

	List Options required to Equal base bid:
	
	ABS, Speed Control
	None Given
	2.7 Eng, 4-whl ABS, 

Smokers group
	ABS-4Whl Disc Brakes         Smokers Group 
	Cruise Control

Power Mirrors

Power windows

Power locks

Keyless entry

	Warranty statement:
	
	3/36,000
	None Given
	3/36,000
	3/36,000
	3/36,000

	Additional Option:
	
	Third Key                        28.00

Complete Manuals        150.00
	Full Size Spare            250.00

Power Seats                380.00

Aluminum Wheels        425.00

Third Key                        35.00

Complete Manuals       125.00

5/70,000 warranty         895.00

5/85,000 warranty      1,140.00
	Full Size Spare              142.20

Third  key                          3.00

Service Manuals             90.00

AM/FM cassette             89.00   

Aluminum wheels        378.25 

5/85,000  (Ext. care)  1,245.00

5/75,000  (Max. care) 1,245.00


	Power seats
          380.00                     Full size spare tire
160.00

Aluminum Wheels                 425.00     

Service manual
185.00

5/85000                           1590.00

6/100,000                        2,400.00
	GMPP Majorguard    1,960.00

GMPP Valueguard    1,760.00

Third key                   12.00

Complete manuals   190.00

Aluminum Wheels     375.00

Whitewall Tires         410.00

Full size spare tire    380.00

Power seats              655.00

AM/FM Cassette       150.00

	Delete Options:
	
	Cruise Control-215.00
	NA
	ABS Brakes                  503.05
	ABS Brakes                     520.00

Smoker’s Group                  28.00
	ABS brakes-348.00 credit if deleted from quote

	Exceptions to Bid:
	
	None listed
	None listed
	None listed
	None listed
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