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 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1
BID TABULATION SHEET

	BID NUMBER: 1-03

Bid Title:  Whelen Strobe Light Products

Opened: 11/12/02 @ 3:00 P.M.

Awarded:  11/21/02 

Award Period: 11/21/02 – 11/20/03

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
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	L & L Distributors Inc.

1511 N. Powerline Road

Pompano Beach,  FL

33069-1690

(800) 327-3408

Paul Brick
	Central Public Safety Equipment Co.

3810-A West Osborne Ave.

Tampa,  FL

33614

(800) 749-1889

Todd Coburn
	Ten-8 Fire Equipment Company

2904 59th Avenue Drive East

Bradenton,  FL

34203

(800) 228-8368

Edward A. Voss
	Metro One Police Supply

120 International Parkway – Suite 262

Heathrow,  FL

32746

(407) 333-4703

Roberta M. Stafford
	Law Enforcement Supply

1814 Beck Avenue

Panama City,  FL

32405

(800) 637-6307

A.D. Russo

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5

	1. Whelen Dash-Miser Remote Model #DM2SLRB
	36 ea.
	88.00
	72.65
	102.00
	72.77
	79.00

	2.  Whelen Hide-A-Way Strobe Power Supply #S6600CCCC
	50 ea.
	194.00
	152.99
	NOTE 1

189.00
	147.73
	145.50

	3.  Whelen Flatlighter Compact, Strobe Light, Model #FL220RB
	54 ea.
	104.00
	86.05
	120.00
	87.74
	88.00

	4.  Whelen Dash King 2000, #DKPSSRB, dual strobe
	19 ea.
	196.00
	168.90
	219.00
	167.43
	153.00

	5.  Whelen Dash King 2000 , #DKPSR, single strobe
	3 ea.
	110.40
	95.05
	125.00
	94.47
	85.00

	6.  Whelen Dash-King 2000 , #DKRSSRB, dual duplex, over/under strobe
	2 ea.
	109.80
	91.95
	125.00
	93.10
	82.00

	7.  Whelen 52 Series Linear Strobe Tube, #52FBTUBE
	2 ea.
	69.00
	51.65
	70.00
	NO BID
	48.00

	8.  Whelen Sealed Beam alternating lights, #17-804RB
	2 ea.
	NO BID
	30.95
	NOTE 2

37.25
	NO BID
	NOTE 2

30.00

	TOTAL: ITEM # 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6
	
	802.20
	667.59
	880.00
	663.24
	632.50

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	TOTAL: ITEM # 7, 8
	
	NOTE 3

69.00
	82.60
	107.25
	NO BID
	78.00

	
	
	
	
	
	
	


Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office


P.O. Box 3371


Tampa, FL  33601							
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Purchasing Unit


Christopher G. Back, Senior Buyer


(813) 247-8023





NOTE 1: Strobe System #S660CCC which includes a power supply and four (4) #HA239C

NOTE 2: Able #17-804RB, one red, one blue – Part No. not Whelen – Per user Dept.

NOTE 3: No Bid Item #8


