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BID TABULATION

	BID NUMBER: 12-03

Various Audio & Video Tapes

Opened:  3/14/03 @ 3:00pm

Awarded:  3/21/03 for the period of, 3/21/03 thru 3/21/04 with two (2) additional one (1) year renewals

1st RENEWAL: 3/21/04 thru 3/21/05
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
	P

A
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K

/

Q

U

A

N

T

I

T

Y
	Colamco, Inc

975 Florida Central Pkwy – Suite 1100

Longwood, FL 

32750

(PH) 407-331-3737

(FX) 407-331-8953

J. D. Bitler
	 Burlington Audio Tapes

106 Mott Street

Oceanside, NY

11572

(PH) 800-331-3191 x122

(FX) 516-678-8959

Jim Chiofolo
	Video Service Of 

America

6929 Seward Ave

Lincoln, NE

68507

(PH) 800-888-2140

(FX) 402-467-3780

Marty Shrader
	AFP Industries, Inc

P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 

33243-0747

(PH) 800-962-4041

(FX) 305-665-1800

Donald Sprague
	Northern Video Syst.

4467 Granite Dr.,

Suite 200

Rocklin, CA 

95677

(PH) 916-630-4700

(FX) 916-630-4800

Diane Flissinger
	Northern Video Syst.

4467 Granite Dr.,

Suite 200

Rocklin, CA 

95677

(PH) 916-630-4700

(FX) 916-630-4800

Harriet Cravey
	Office Depot

1990 US Hwy 301

Suite 100

Tampa, FL 

33619

(PH) 621-1389

(FX) 621-1245

Jim Olsen
	Focus Camera, Inc

905 McDonald Ave

Brooklyn, N.Y.

11218

(PH) 718-437-8855

(FX) 718-437-8860

Mark Silber

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7
	8

	Maxell 30 Min Cassette Tape
	3000
	.60
	.46 / .34
	.46
	.46
	.65
	.60
	.62
	.59

	Maxell 60 Min Cassette Tape
	2000
	.55
	.34
	.52
	.53
	.72
	.68
	.45 / 2.70 (6pk)
	.69

	Maxell 90 Min Cassette Tape
	500
	.60
	.39
	.68
	.70
	.92
	.84
	.54 / 2.70 (5pk)
	.78

	Maxell 120 Min Cassette Tape
	500
	1.05
	.83
	1.02
	1.04
	1.35
	1.25
	.89 / 3.56 (4pk)
	.98

	Sony 60 Min Micro Cassette Tape
	100
	.95
	.77
	.71
	.75
	.89
	NO BID
	1.18 / 3.54 (3pk)
	.98

	Sony 90 Min Micro Cassette Tape
	100
	.95
	.87
	.77
	DISCONTINUED
	.95
	NO BID
	1.41
	1.09

	Sony Digital Micro Cassette NTC60
	200
	10.65
	7.52
	7.92
	7.88
	8.75
	8.00
	NOTE 1

16.56
	13.89

	Sony 8mm 60 Min Video Tape
	100
	2.10
	1.46
	1.39
	1.58
	1.69
	1.49
	2.67
	1.69

	Sony 8mm 120 min Video Tape
	100
	2.35
	1.82
	1.68
	1.84
	1.99
	1.83
	2.39
	1.98

	Maxell 30 Min VHS Tape
	10m
	2.05
	1.03
	1.41
	1.32
	1.95
	1.76
	2.08
	1.79

	Maxell 60 Min VHS Tape
	500
	2.25
	1.20
	1.53
	1.46
	1.99
	1.90
	2.24
	1.89

	Maxell 120 Min VHS Tape
	3000
	1.75
	1.05
	1.61
	1.58
	1.95
	1.88
	1.29
	1.98

	Sony DVM 60R Video
	100
	5.10
	4.25 / 3.25
	3.24
	4.38
	4.50
	5.00
	6.28
	4.99

	BID NUMBER: 12-03

Various Audio & Video Tapes

Opened:  3/14/03 @ 3:00pm

Awarded:  3/

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
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	Colamco, Inc

975 Florida Central Pkwy – Suite 1100

Longwood, FL 

32750

(PH) 407-331-3737

(FX) 407-331-8953

J. D. Bitler
	 Burlington Audio Tapes

106 Mott Street

Oceanside, NY

11572

(PH) 800-331-3191 x122

(FX) 516-678-8959

Jim Chiofolo
	Video Service Of 

America

6929 Seward Ave

Lincoln, NE

68507

(PH) 800-888-2140

(FX) 402-467-3780

Marty Shrader
	AFP Industries, Inc

P.O. Box 43-0747

South Miami, FL 

33243-0747

(PH) 800-962-4041

(FX) 305-665-1800

Donald Sprague
	Northern Video Syst.

4467 Granite Dr.,

Suite 200

Rocklin, CA 

95677

(PH) 916-630-4700

(FX) 916-630-4800

Diane Flissinger
	Northern Video Syst.

4467 Granite Dr.,

Suite 200

Rocklin, CA 

95677

(PH) 916-630-4700

(FX) 916-630-4800

Harriet Cravey
	Office Depot

1990 US Hwy 301

Suite 100

Tampa, FL 

33619

(PH) 621-1389

(FX) 621-1245

Jim Olsen
	Focus Camera, Inc

905 McDonald Ave

Brooklyn, N.Y.

11218

(PH) 718-437-8855

(FX) 718-437-8860

Mark Silber

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7
	8

	 
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	EXCEPTIONS
	
	NONE
	SUBSTITUTIONS
	SUBSTITUTIONS
	$100 min order
	NONE
	SUBSTITUTIONS
	SEE NOTE 1
	NONE

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	TOTAL BID
	
	$33,875.00
	$19,141.00
	$25,328.00
	$24,411.00
	$33,622.00
	$30,827.00
	$33,970.00
	$32,666.00

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


	BID NUMBER: 12-03

Various Audio & Video Tapes

Opened:  3/14/03 @ 3:00pm

Awarded:  3/

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
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	Long’s Electronics

Special Markets

2630 5th Ave So

Irondale, AL

35210

(PH) 800-633-4984

(FX) 877-633-4984

Dana Askew
	The Tape Company

325 West Lake Street

Unit A

Elmhurst, IL 

60126

(PH) 888-808-8820

(FX) 630-834-1135

Michael Costa
	Total Media Inc

71 Schrieffer St.

South Hackensak, NJ

07606

(PH) 800-355-4400

(FX) 201-489-7322

Michael Annunziata
	
	
	
	
	

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	9
	10
	11
	
	
	
	
	

	Maxell 30 Min Cassette Tape
	3000
	.60
	.42
	.55
	
	
	
	
	

	Maxell 60 Min Cassette Tape
	2000
	.69
	.49
	.59
	
	
	
	
	

	Maxell 90 Min Cassette Tape
	500
	.96
	.65
	.45
	
	
	
	
	

	Maxell 120 Min Cassette Tape
	500
	1.44
	.96
	.89
	
	
	
	
	

	Sony 60 Min Micro Cassette Tape
	100
	NO BID
	.69
	.75
	
	
	
	
	

	Sony 90 Min Micro Cassette Tape
	100
	NO BID
	.82
	.85
	
	
	
	
	

	Sony Digital Micro Cassette NTC60
	200
	NO BID
	7.86
	8.00
	
	
	
	
	

	Sony 8mm 60 Min Video Tape
	100
	NO BID
	1.44
	1.50
	
	
	
	
	

	Sony 8mm 120 min Video Tape
	100
	1.94
	1.80
	1.90
	
	
	
	
	

	Maxell 30 Min VHS Tape
	10m
	1.91
	1.35
	1.29
	
	
	
	
	

	Maxell 60 Min VHS Tape
	500
	2.18
	1.45
	1.39
	
	
	
	
	

	Maxell 120 Min VHS Tape
	3000
	3.29
	1.56
	1.05
	
	
	
	
	

	Sony DVM 60R Video
	100
	4.69
	4.26
	4.25
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 


	BID NUMBER: 12-03

Various Audio & Video Tapes

Opened:  3/14/03 @ 3:00pm

Awarded:  3/

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
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	Long’s Electronics

Special Markets

2630 5th Ave So

Irondale, AL

35210

(PH) 800-633-4984

(FX) 877-633-4984

Dana Askew
	The Tape Company

325 West Lake Street

Unit A

Elmhurst, IL 

60126

(PH) 888-808-8820

(FX) 630-834-1135

Michael Costa
	Total Media Inc

71 Schrieffer St.

South Hackensak, NJ

07606

(PH) 800-355-4400

(FX) 201-489-7322

Michael Annunziata
	
	
	
	
	

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	9
	10
	11
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 EXCEPTIONS
	
	SEE NOTE 2
	 NONE
	 SUBSTITUTIONS
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	TOTAL BID
	
	$35,103.00
	$24,423.00
	$22,770.00
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	AWARD TOTAL
	
	
	$24,423.00
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Award is based on lowest “ALL OR NONE” meeting specs. 
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office


P.O. Box 3371


Tampa, FL  33601							





�





Purchasing Unit


Violet Bachmann, Senior Buyer


(813) 247-8029
































NOTE 1: NTC60 not available, price is for NTC 120

NOTE 2: Pricing is based on orders greater than $50.00. Any order’s less will be charged freight charges


