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                                                                                                                                                          BID TABULATION

	Bid Number: 16-03

Bid Title: Portable Radio Batteries

Opened: 04/28/03 @ 3:00 PM

Awarded:  05/09/03

Award Period: 05/09/03 – 05/08/04
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SHADED ITEM INDICATES AN AWARD
	PK./QTY.
	Martronics, Inc.

P.O. Box 870607

Morrow, GA

30287-0607

(800) 334-0342

Carolyn Hobbs
	Houston Communications, Inc.

5205 Telephone Rd.

Houston, TX

77087

(713) 845-1404

Joel Mills
	Batteries Plus

1703 W. Fletcher Ave.

Tampa, FL

33612-1816

(813) 960-5667

Bob Stowers
	Jan Communications And Electronics Co., Inc.

6630 South Crescent Blvd.

Pennsauken, NJ

08109-1403

(856) 663-4800

Norman J. Levine 
	SAT Radio Commun.

dba Industrial Communications

1019 E. Euclid St.

San Antonio, TX

78212

(210) 226-3682

Henry Witek
	Holzberg Communications, Inc.

P.O. Box 322

Totowa, NJ

07511

(800) 654-9550

Andy Holzberg
	Communications International, Inc.

4801 George Road, Suite 150

Tampa, FL

33634

(813) 887-1888

Herschel T. Dean
	Diversified Electronics Inc.

309 Agnew Drive

Forest Park, GA

30297

(404) 361-4840 #146

Dennis Ingram

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7
	8

	1. MPA Radio Battery, 7.5 volts, 1700 MAH, NICAD, #CII-MPA-XHC
	1000 ea.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	67.50
	72.87
	NO BID
	65.00
	50.00
	NO BID

	2. Jaguar Radio Battery, 7.5 volts, 1600 MAH, NICAD, M/A COM Part #BKB191210/3
	600

ea.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NOTE 1

114.90
	83.47
	NO BID
	98.00
	50.00
	NO BID

	3. Motorola HT1000 Radio Battery, 7.5 volts, 1200 MAH, NICAD, M/A COM part #NTN7143CR
	150 ea.
	NO BID
	35.00
	61.15
	35.60
	32.25
	35.00
	62.00
	35.00

	4. Motorola HT1250 Radio Battery, 7.5 volts, 1500 MAH, NICAD, Motorola Part #HNN9008AR
	150

ea.
	NO BID
	35.00
	52.18
	36.15
	32.25
	35.00
	55.00
	35.00

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Exceptions:
	
	
	NONE
	YES
	NONE
	NONE
	NONE
	NONE
	NONE
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NOTE 1:  Size Small – 13Xlarge                               

  NOTE 9:  No stenciled pant size or Jail on right hip



NOTE 19: Stencil size not 1”
  
NOTE 2:  Orange only                                     
                                                          NOTE 10: Size appears smaller than normal scale


                                    NOTE 20: 1st line stencil on back is 3”         
NOTE 3:  Samples received; (1) white pant               
                                               NOTE 11: Pants have 2” vertical stripe                               


                  NOTE 21: Inseam length 32”

and (1) orange shirt; factory closed, exact                  
                                                NOTE 12: Shirt has pocket                                     
                  
                                    NOTE 22: Black stencil                  

spec samples available on request                              

                        NOTE 13: Sleeve length is shorter than normal scale

   
                  NOTE 23: Size stenciled on both hips

NOTE 4:  No Bid on Sizes 7XL & 9XL                     
                                               NOTE 14: Inseam length 28”



                  NOTE 24: No stenciling
NOTE 5:  Inseam length - 34”                                    
                                               NOTE 15: Some stitching unraveling



                  NOTE 25: No samples submitted

NOTE 6:  Pants have mock fly                                    
                                              NOTE 16: Vendor will adjust size scale if awarded




NOTE 26: Garment does not indicate fabric blend
NOTE 7:  Stitching separating on vertical stripe      
                                                 NOTE 17: Stencil fades after washing
NOTE 8:  No 1” stenciled letter shirt size                 

                        NOTE 18: Continual fabric bleed after 9 washing color  
                                       
NOTE 1: MA/COM Vendor will only guarantee price for 30 days
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