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	A.T.C Uniforms Inc. – Image First

4358 11th Street

Long Island City, NY

11101

(718) 392-0755

Giora Perry
	J.H. Churchwell Co.

301 E. Bay St.

Jacksonville, FL

32202

(904) 356-5721

L.R. Pavelka
	Hummingbird Graphics Inc.

5919 N. Armenia Ave.

Tampa, FL

33603

(813) 871-5566

Katie Nickerson
	Designlab Inc.

3429 Rutherford Rd. Ext.

Taylors, SC

29687

(864) 313-7083

Jim Maloof
	Designlab Inc.  - ALTERNATE BID
3429 Rutherford Rd. Ext.

Taylors, SC

29687

(864) 313-7083

Jim Maloof

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5

	1. Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, embroidered Sheriff’s star and Logo over left pocket, embroidered SHERIFF on back of  shirt, 3 button front (SEE ATTACHMENT “A”)  Sizes Small – 4Xlarge * Red Kap # SK26 or equivalent

Colors:  Gray and White
	.
	15.95
	NO BID
	NOTE 2

23.95
	NOTE 3 & 5 & 6

S – XL: 18.70

2XL: 20.50

3XL: 22.85

4XL: N/A
	NOTE 7 & 8

S – XL: 21.75

2X – 3XL: 23.75

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Red Kap #SK26
	
	Hummingbird WPS102 Whispering Pines Sportswear
	Jerzee #03483
	Red Kap #SK26

	2. Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, embroidered Sheriff’s star and Logo over left pocket, (SEE ATTACHMENT “A”) 3 button front, Sizes Small – 4Xlarge * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent Colors: Red and White
	
	16.95
	NO BID
	NOTE 2

16.95
	NOTE 3 & 5 & 6

S – XL: 12.95

2XL: 14.75

3XL: 17.25

4XL: N/A
	NOTE 8

S – XL: 16.00

2X – 3XL: 18.00

	Brand/Style No:
	
	Red Kap #SK26
	
	Hummingbird WPS102 Whispering Pines Sportswear
	Jerzee #03483
	Red Kap #SK26


	BID NUMBER: 18-03

Bid Title: Embroidered Polo Shirts

Part 1 of 2 – Page 2 of 3

Opened: 06/16/03 @ 3:00 P.M
	
	A.T.C. Uniforms – Image First
	J.H. Churchwell
	Hummingbird Graphics Inc.
	Designlab Inc.
	Designlab Inc.

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5

	3.  Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, embroidered Sheriff’s star and logo over left pocket, embroidered CHAPLAIN on back of shirt in 2” green lettering, (SEE ATTACHMENT “A”) 3 button front,  Sizes Small – 4Xlarge * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent Color: White
	
	15.95
	NO BID
	NOTE 2

23.95
	NOTE 3 & 5 & 6

S – XL: 18.70

2XL: 20.50

3XL: 22.85

4XL: N/A
	NOTE 8

S – XL: 21.75

2X – 3XL: 23.75

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Red Kap #SK26
	
	Hummingbird WPS102 Whispering Pines Sportswear
	Jerzee #03483
	Red Kap #SK26

	4.  Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, with embroidered Sheriff’s star and logo over left pocket, embroidered COMMUNICATIONS on right side of shirt in ¼” green lettering, 3 button front, Sizes Small - 4Xlarge * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent, Color: Gray
	
	16.95
	NO BID
	NOTE 2 

19.95
	NOTE 3 & 5 & 6

S – XL: 15.85

2XL: 17.60

3XL: 20.10

4XL: N/A
	NOTE 7

NO BID

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Red Kap #SK26
	
	Hummingbird WPS102 Whispering Pines Sportswear
	Jerzee #03483
	

	5.  Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, with embroidered Sheriff’s star and logo over left pocket, embroidered employee name on right side of shirt with embroidered COMMUNICATIONS arched over name, all in ¼” green lettering, 3 button front, Sizes Small - 4Xlarge  * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent, Color: Gray
	
	16.95
	NO BID
	NOTE 2 

19.95 
	NOTE 3 & 5 & 6

S – XL: 17.85

2XL: 19.60

3XL: 22.10

4XL: N/A
	NOTE 7

NO BID

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Red Kap #SK26
	
	Hummingbird WPS102 Whispering Pines Sportswear
	Jerzee #03483
	

	6.  Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, with embroidered Sheriff’s star and logo over left pocket, embroidered INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY on right side of shirt in ¼” green lettering, 3 button front, Sizes Small - 4Xlarge * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent, Color: Green
	
	16.95
	NO BID
	NOTE 2 

19.95
	NOTE 3 & 5 & 6

S – XL: 15.85

2XL: 17.60

3XL: 20.10

4XL: N/A
	NOTE 8

S – XL: 20.25

2X – 3XL: 22.25

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Red Kap #SK26
	
	Hummingbird WPS102 Whispering Pines Sportswear
	Jerzee #03483
	


	BID NUMBER: 18-03

Bid Title: Embroidered Polo Shirts

Part 1 of 2 – Page 3 of 3

Opened: 06/16/03 @ 3:00 P.M
	
	A.T.C. Uniforms – Image First
	J.H. Churchwell
	Hummingbird Graphics Inc.
	Designlab Inc.
	Designlab Inc.

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5

	Exceptions:
	
	NOTE 1
YES
	
	NOTE 3

YES
	YES
	YES

	Sample Submitted:
	
	NO
	
	NOTE 4

YES
	NOTE 9

YES
	NO
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	Miami Silk Screen and Embroidery -

Corporate Innovations

1450 North Miami Ave.

Miami, FL

33136

(813) 417-2327

Raymond Resnick/Jill Opollo
	
	
	
	

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	6
	
	
	
	

	1. Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, embroidered Sheriff’s star and Logo over left pocket, embroidered SHERIFF on back of  shirt, 3 button front (SEE ATTACHMENT “A”)  Sizes Small – 4Xlarge * Red Kap # SK26 or equivalent

Colors:  Gray and White
	.
	24+

S – XL:

17.49

2XL:

18.86

3X – 4XL:

19.75
	72+

S – XL:

16.51

2XL:

17.99

3X- 4XL:

18.81
	144+

S – XL:

15.50

2XL:

17.10

3X – 4XL:

18.05
	
	
	
	

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Extreme #85016
	
	
	
	

	
	
	RED
	WHITE
	
	
	

	2. Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, embroidered Sheriff’s star and Logo over left pocket, (SEE ATTACHMENT “A”) 3 button front, Sizes Small – 4Xlarge * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent Colors: Red and White
	
	NOTE 10

24+

S – XL:

13.00

2XL:

14.55

3XL:

15.50
	NOTE 10

72+

S – XL:

12.50

2XL:

14.00

3XL:

14.80
	NOTE 10

144+

S – XL:

12.25

2XL:

13.70

3XL:

14.55
	NOTE 10

24+

S – XL:

11.85

2XL:

13.45

3XL:

14.30
	NOTE 10

72+

S – XL:

11.50

2XL:

12.85

3XL:

13.75
	NOTE 10

14+

S –XL:

11.25

2XL:

12.50

3XL:

13.25
	
	
	

	Brand/Style No:
	
	Extreme #85016
	Extreme #85016
	
	
	


	BID NUMBER: 18-03

Bid Title: Embroidered Polo Shirts

Part 2 of 2 – Page 2 of 3

Opened: 06/16/03 @ 3:00 P.M
	
	Miami Silk Screen and Embroidery -

Corporate Innovations
	
	
	
	

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	6
	
	
	
	

	3.  Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, embroidered Sheriff’s star and logo over left pocket, embroidered CHAPLAIN on back of shirt in 2” green lettering, (SEE ATTACHMENT “A”) 3 button front,  Sizes Small – 4Xlarge * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent Color: White
	
	NOTE 10

24+

S – XL:

15.57

2XL:

17.25

3XL:

18.00
	NOTE 10

72+

S – XL:

14.81

2XL:

16.50

3XL:

17.25
	NOTE 10

144+

S – XL:

14.70

2XL:

16.25

3XL:

17.00
	
	
	
	

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Extreme #85016
	
	
	
	

	4.  Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, with embroidered Sheriff’s star and logo over left pocket, embroidered COMMUNICATIONS on right side of shirt in ¼” green lettering, 3 button front, Sizes Small - 4Xlarge * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent, Color: Gray
	
	NOTE 10

24+

S – XL: 

14.80

2XL:

16.30

3XL:

17.25
	NOTE 10

72+

S – XL:

14.25

2XL:

15.80

3XL:

16.85
	NOTE 10

144+

S-XL:

13.85

2XL:

15.25

3XL:

16.25
	
	
	
	

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Extreme #85016
	
	
	
	

	5.  Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, with embroidered Sheriff’s star and logo over left pocket, embroidered employee name on right side of shirt with embroidered COMMUNICATIONS arched over name, all in ¼” green lettering, 3 button front, Sizes Small - 4Xlarge  * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent, Color: Gray
	
	NOTE 10

24+

S – XL:

17.50

2XL:

18.75

3XL:

19.60
	NOTE 10

72+

S-XL:

16.50

2XL:

18.05

3XL:

18.90
	NOTE 10

144+

S – XL:

16.00

2XL:

17.50

3XL:

18.50
	
	
	
	

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Extreme #85016
	
	
	
	

	6.  Polo Shirt, 60% cotton – 40% polyester pique knit, left breast pocket, short sleeve, knit fashion collar, knitted cuff or hemmed sleeves, with embroidered Sheriff’s star and logo over left pocket, embroidered INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY on right side of shirt in ¼” green lettering, 3 button front, Sizes Small - 4Xlarge * Red Kap #SK26 or equivalent, Color: Green
	
	NOTE 10

24+

S – XL:

14.80

2XL:

16.30

3XL:

17.25
	NOTE 10

72+

S – XL:

14.30

2XL:

15.70

3XL:

16.56
	NOTE 10

144+

S – XL:

13.85

2XL:

15.30

3XL:

16.10
	
	
	
	

	Brand/Style No.:
	
	Extreme #85016
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	Miami Silk Screen and Embroidery -

Corporate Innovations
	
	
	
	

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	6
	
	
	
	

	Exceptions:
	
	NOTE 11

YES
	
	
	
	

	Sample Submitted:
	
	YES
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	





NOTE 1:  Add 20% for Oversize Items – From 2XL

NOTE 4: Back Embroidery on submitted sample was yellow not Green
NOTE 8:   No Reference to Size 4X

NOTE 2: WPS 102 60/40 Ring Spun Pique w/Pocket
           NOTE 5: Not available in 4X


NOTE 9:   Submitted Sample has no pocket

NOTE 3: Unable to obtain 3 button shirt – 2 button only
      NOTE 6: 50/50 blend


NOTE 10: Available in 4X – Same Price as 3X – Per vendor email 6/17/03 


                                                 NOTE 7: Not available in Gray


NOTE 11: Freight charge of $9.50 per 36 pc.

NOTE 1: Add 20% for Oversize Items – From 2XL

 NOTE 4: Back Embroidery on submitted sample was yellow not Green
NOTE 8: No Reference to Size 4X


NOTE 2: WPS 102 60/40 Ring Spun Pique w/Pocke
t            NOTE 5: Not available in 4X


NOTE 9: Submitted Sample has no pocket

NOTE 3: 2 button shirt            
                                    NOTE 6: 50/50 blend 


NOTE 10: Available in 4X – Same Price as 3X – Per vendor email 6/17/03


                                                    NOTE 7: Not available in Gray


NOTE 11: Freight charge of $9.50 per 36 pc.


