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BID TABULATION
	Bid Number: 23-03

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: 6/13/03 @ 3:00 Awarded: 6/20/03 


Page 1 of  5
	Ernie Haire Ford

9545 N. Florida Avenue

Tampa , FL 33612 

Paul Helms

PH: 813-933-6571

FX: 813-930-6126
	Bill Currie Ford

5815 N. Dale Mabry Hwy.

Tampa, Fl 33614

Mike Derryberry

PH: 813-872-5555

FX: 813-879-5570
	Hackettstown Ford

100 Main Street

Hackettstown, NJ 07840

Brad Badal

PH: 800-666-4472

FX: 973-584-5022
	Maroone Dodge, LLC 

21151 N.W. 2 nd Avenue

Miami, Fl 33169

Steven Henry

PH: 305-653-6343

FX: 305-653-8250
	Classic Chevrolet

State Road 434 South

Winter Park, FL 32790

Peter Popiel

PH: 407-298-1535

FX: 407-298-6170
	Whiteside Chevrolet

50714 National Road

St. Clairsville, OH 43950

Brian McCulley

PH: 800-610-0211

FX: 740-699-2475
	Holler Dodge

1050 N. Orlando Avenue

Winter Park, FL 32789

Peter Popiel

PH: 407-298-1535

FX: 407-298-6170

	Spec #01 - Full Size 4-Door Ford P71 Police Package
	20,197.00
	19,883.00
	20,313.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Brand/Model
	Ford Crown Victoria P71

Police Package
	Ford Crown Victoria P71 

 Police Package
	Ford Crown Victoria P71

Police Package
	
	
	
	

	Spec #02 - Full Size 4-Door Administrative Vehicle
	19,454.00
	19,393.00


	No Bid
	No Bid
	15,913.00


	16,952.00
	No Bid

	Brand/Model
	Ford Crown Victoria P-73
	Ford Crown Victoria     P73
	
	
	Chevrolet Impala 1WF19
	Chevrolet Impala 1WF19
	

	Bid Number: 22-02

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: 6/13/03 @ 3:00 

Awarded: 6/20/03  


Page 2 of 5
	Ernie Haire Ford

9545 N. Florida Avenue

Tampa, FL 33612

Paul Helms

PH: 813-933-6571

FX: 813-930-6126
	Bill Currie Ford

5815 N. Dale Mabry Hwy.

Tampa, FL 33614  

Mike Derryberry

PH: 813-872-5555

FX: 813-879-5570
	Hackettstown Ford

100 Main Street

Hackettstown, NJ 07840

Brad Badal

PH: 800-666-4472

FX: 973-584-5022
	Maroone Dodge, LLC 

21151 N.W. 2 nd Avenue

Miami, Fl 33169

Steven Henry

PH: 305-653-6343

FX: 305-653-8250
	Classic Chevrolet

State Road 434 South

Winter Park, FL 32790

Peter Popiel

PH: 407-298-1535

FX: 407-298-6170
	Whiteside Chevrolet 

50714 National Road

St. Clairsville, OH 43950

Brian McCulley

PH: 800-610-0211

FX: 740-699-2475
	Holler Dodge

1050 N. Orlando Avenue

Winter Park, FL 32789

Peter Popiel

PH: 407-298-1535

FX: 407-298-6170

	Spec #03 - Mid Size 4-Door Administrative Vehicle


	13,546.00
	14,044.00
	No Bid
	12,786.00
	No Bid
	15,160.00


	12,958.00

	Brand/Model
	Ford Taurus P52
	Ford Taurus P52
	
	Dodge Stratus JRDM41
	
	Chevrolet Malibu 1ND69
	Dodge Stratus JRDM41


AWARD: Award to the lowest responsible and responsive bidder meeting specifications by manufacturer. The prices shown above are for the base unit vehicle as specified in the bid. Please reference following pages for additional add and delete options.

.

	Bid Number: 23-03 Pg 3 of 5 

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: 6/13/03 @ 3:00 
	Ernie Haire Ford

Paul Helms

813-933-6571
	Bill Currie Ford

Mike Derryberry

813-872-5555
	Hackettstown Ford

Brad Badal

800-666-472
	Maroone Dodge

Steve Henry

305-653-6343


	Classic Chevrolet

Peter Popiel

407-298-1535
	Whiteside Chevrolet 

Brian McCulley

800-610-0211
	Holler Dodge

Peter Popiel

407-298-1535

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
1
	
   2
	
3
	
4
	5
	6
	7

	Spec #01- Full Size 4-Door Ford Crown Vic P71Police Package
	20,197.00
	19,883.00
	20,313.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Model Order Code:
	P71 Crown Victoria
	P71  Crown Victoria
	P71 Crown Victoria
	
	
	
	

	Engine Size:
	4.6L V8
	4.6L V8
	4.6L V8
	
	
	
	

	List options required to equal base bid:
	AM/FM Radio                       Rear door locks inoperable

Drivers’ side spotlight

Ignition powered decklid release

Rear power windows inoperable

Rear mounted decklid lights
	AM/FM Radio

Rear door locks inoperable

Driver’s side spotlight

Ignition powered decklid release

Rear power windows inoperable

Rear mounted decklid lights
	Police Prep Package

Cloth front/vinyl rear seats

Driver spot lamp

AM/FM Radio

Rear window locks & handles


	
	
	
	

	Delivery Time /  Warranty Period:
	90-140 Days-3/36000
	60-90 Days- 3/36,000
	90-120 Days-3/36,000
	
	
	
	

	Safety flashing lights mounted under deckled:
	Included
	90.00
	Included
	
	
	
	

	Roof - reinforcement
	78.00
	71.00
	8,500.00
	
	
	
	

	Rear Deck Warning lights R/B dealer inst.
	140.00
	No price given
	120.00
	
	
	
	

	Accessory feed wires for Police equipment
	Included
	No price given
	Included
	
	
	
	

	Limited slip
	124.00
	112.00
	125.00
	
	
	
	

	Wiring for roof mounted lightbar L or R
	84.00
	No price given
	No price given
	
	
	
	

	Roof w/hole
	188.00
	174.00
	60.00
	
	
	
	

	Left side pillar mounted 6" spotlight Fty inst
	Included
	169.00
	Included
	
	
	
	

	Left side pillar mounted 6" spotlight Dealer
	No price given
	No price given
	300.00
	
	
	
	

	Rear door locks inoperative
	Included
	23.00
	Included
	
	
	
	

	Rear door handles inoperative
	Included
	23.00
	Included
	
	
	
	

	Rear windows inoperative
	Included
	23.00
	Included
	
	
	
	

	Safety bumper guards
	400.00
	No price given
	No price given
	
	
	
	

	Complete set of service manuals
	147.00
	No price given
	85.00
	
	
	
	

	Third key
	15.00
	5.00
	5.00
	
	
	
	

	AM/FM cassette radio
	274.00
	254.00
	11.85
	
	
	
	

	Extended Warranties:
	4,020- 3 year/100,000 miles
	None Listed
	2,150.00-3 year/100,000 miles
	
	
	
	

	Additional Add Options
	3,955-75,000 mile warranty
	None listed
	3,425.00-3 year/75,000 miles
	
	
	
	

	Exceptions
	None listed
	None listed
	Rear window switches are deleted
	
	
	
	

	Bid Number:  23-03 Pg 4 of 5

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: 6/13/03 @ 3:00  
	Ernie Haire Ford

Paul Helms

813-933-6571
	Bill Currie Ford

Mike Derryberry

813-357-6785
	Hackettstown Ford

Brad Badal

800-666-4472
	Maroone Dodge

Steven Henry

305-653-6343
	ClassicChevrolet

Peter Popiel

407-298-1535
	Whiteside Chevrolet 

Brian McCulley

800-610-0211
	Holler Dodge

Peter Popiel

407-298-1535

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
1
	                         2
	
  3
	                       4
	5
	                       6
	7

	Spec. #02 – Full size 4-door

Administrative Vehicle
	19,454.00
	19,393.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	15,913.00
	16,952.00
	No Bid

	Model Order Code:
	P73 Crown Victoria
	P73-100B
	
	
	Impala-1WF19
	Impala-1WF19
	

	Delivery time:
	90-140 days
	60-90 days
	
	
	75-110 days
	60 Days
	

	Engine Size:
	4.6L  V-8  
	4.6L  V-8
	
	
	3.4L  V6
	3.4 Liter   V6
	

	Wheelbase:
	114.7”
	114.7”
	
	
	110.5”
	110.5”
	

	List options required to equal base bid:
	NA
	Front tag mount
	
	
	ABS brakes

Cruise Control

Floor Mats
	ABS  brakes

Floormats

Cruise Control
	

	Warranty statement:
	3/36,000 miles
	3/36,000 miles
	
	
	3/36,000
	3/36,000
	

	2-dr vehicle
	NA
	NA
	
	
	2 Door MonteCarlo 2,379.00
	NA
	

	Engine
	NA
	NA
	
	
	3.8L V6       1,775.00
	    L36                            993.00

    1SB                            853.00 
	

	Full size spare tire
	114.00
	102.00
	
	
	130.00
	310.00
	

	Complete set service manuals
	147.00
	No price given
	
	
	175.00
	290.00
	

	Keyless entry
	234.00
	213.00
	
	
	Included
	360.00
	

	Ford P74 package
	2,560.00
	2,995.00
	
	
	NA
	NA
	

	Ext Warranties:
	5/100,000  1,400.00

5/100,000  1,940.00       
	NA
	
	
	5/75,000                      1,100.00

6/100,000                    2,135.00
	3/100,000                    2,390.00

5/100,000                    2,690.00
	

	Additional Options:
	NA
	NA
	
	
	Admin. Police pkg.     2,130.00

Floor mats                        40.00

Cruise control                250.00 

6 way power drive seat  325.00

5/100,000 warranty     1,805.00  


	AM/FM CD                345.00

AM/FM/CD/Cassette  445.00

Power Driver Seat       325.00
	

	Delete Options:
	NA
	NA
	
	
	ABS brakes                    520.00


	Floormats                     34.40

ABS Brakes                 516.00

Cruise Control             215.00
	

	Exceptions to Bid:
	None listed
	None listed
	
	
	Wheel base is 110.5”
	None Listed
	


	Bid Number: 23-03
Pg 5 of 5

Bid Title: Pursuit & Administrative Vehicles

Opened: 6/13/03 @ 3:00 
	Ernie Haire Ford

Paul Helms

813-933-6571
	Bill Currie Ford

Mike Derryberry

813-357-6785
	Hackettstown Ford

Brad Badal

800-666-6343
	Maroone Dodge

Steven Henry

305-653-6343
	Classic Chevrolet

Peter Popiel

407-298-1535
	Whiteside Chevrolet

Brian McCulley

800-610-0211
	Holler Dodge

Peter Popiel

407-298-1535

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	                    1
	                         2
	
     3
	
             4
	
          5
	6
	

	Spec #03 - Mid Size 4-door 

Administrative Vehicle
	13,546.00
	14,044.00
	No Bid
	12,786.00
	No Bid
	15,160.00
	12,958.00

	Model Order Code:
	P52 Taurus
	P52 Taurus
	
	Stratus-JRDM41
	
	Malibu-1ND69
	Stratus-JRDM41

	Delivery Time:
	90-120 Days
	90-120 days
	
	60-90 days
	
	60 Days
	90-120 days

	Engine Size/HP:
	3.0L/ 155 HP
	3.0 Liter  V6 155 H.P.
	
	2.7L V6 
	
	3.1 L V6
	2.7L V6

	Wheel Base:
	108.50
	Not given
	
	108”
	
	107”
	108”

	List Options required to Equal base bid:
	Speed Control

ABS Brakes
	ABS, Speed Control, Cigarette lighter
	
	2.7L V6 Engine

 ABS Brakes
	
	Cruise Control

Power Mirrors

Power windows

ABS brakes
	2.7L V6 Engine

ABS brakes

Smoker’s Group

	Warranty statement:
	3/36,000
	3/36,000
	
	3/36,000
	
	3/36,000
	3/36,000

	Additional Option:
	AM/FM Cassette         184.00

Power seats                  382.00

Third key                       25.00

Complete manuals      147.00

5/100,000 warranty  1,400.00

5/100,000 warranty  1940.00
	AM/FM Cassette      199.00

Third key                    85.00
	
	Full Size Spare              160.00

Third  key                        18.00

Service Manuals            140.00

AM/FM cassette            100.00   

Aluminum wheels         425.00 

Power seats                   380.00

5/70,000  (Ext. care)  1,245.00

5/85,000  (Max. care) 1,590.00


	
	AM/FM/CD/Cassette     150.00

Map light                        209.00

Full size spare                310.00

Whitewall tires               600.00 

Aluminum wheels          375.00

Third key                          12.00

Complete manuals          290.00

3/100,000 warranty        2,390.00

5/100,000 warranty        2,690.00

Power seat, split fold rear 

Seat,CD/Cassette           1,650.00
	AM/FM/CD/Cassette 100.00

Power Seats                380.00

Full size spare            250.00

Aluminum Wheels     425.00

Third Key                    30.00

Complete Manuals     185.00

5/85,000 warranty   1,490.00 

5/100,000 warranty 1,940.00

Keyless entry             175.00                 



	Delete Options:
	ABS Brakes              512.00

Cruise Control           185.00
	ABS Break                  534.00

Cruise Control             191.00
	
	ABS Brakes                  520.00
	
	Power windows,mirrors, & keyless entry                   865.00  
	ABS Brakes               505.00

Cigarette lighter           15.00

	Exceptions to Bid:
	None listed
	None listed
	
	None listed
	
	None listed
	2004 Literature is in limited supply.  Vendor will rovide computer printout of specs.
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