[image: image1.wmf] 

 




 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1
BID TABULATION

	BID  NUMBER: 10-04

Rainwear

Opened: 5-6-04 @ 3:00 P.M.

Awarded:  5-19-04

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
	P

A

C

K

/

Q

U

A

N

T

I

T

Y
	Hamilton Uniforms

P. O. Box 357

Crosswicks, NJ 08515

Sonja Fenick

PH: 609-393-4000

FX: 609-298-3541
	Superior Uniform Group

10055 Seminole Boulevard  Seminole, FL 33772

JoEllen Mills

PH: 727-803-7171

FX: 727-803-7146
	Central Public Safety

3810-A W. Osborne Avenue

Tampa, FL 33614

Jack Stephens

PH: 813-348-4866

FX: 813-348-0450
	Law Enforcement Supply

5404 Airport Blvd

Tampa, FL 33634

Mark Sevigny

PH: 800-326-4019

FX: 813-885-7787
	AMFAK Inc.

3160 S. W. 22nd Street Miami, FL 33145

Frances Charon

PH: 305-446-5766

FX: 305-448-6112
	NAFECO

11681 49TH Street N.

Clearwater, FL 33762

David Muar

PH: 727-561-0209

FX: 727-571-1483
	Loveline Industries

385 Gerard Avenue

Bronx, New York 10451

Daniel Goldstiein

PH: 718-402-3500

FX: 718-402-3408

	
ITEM DESCRIPTION 
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7

	1) Plastic Rain Hat Covers, Small – XL, Debco or equal
	600
	2.97
	3.95
	No Bid
	3.08
	No Bid
	3.65
	4.10

	2) Raincoats, PVC or Polyester, yellow, medium weight, Small – 3X, River City #200C or equal
	500
	S-2X 4.47

3X 4.82
	4.82
	S-2X 5.74

3X-6X 6.19
	4.47

Note 7
	S-L 4.50

2X-3X 4.75
	S-2X 5.49

3X-6X 5.91
	7.10

	2a) Pricing for #2 Raincoat with “Crossing Guard” screen printed on back
	500
	S-2X 6.05

3X 6.39
	8.82
	S-2X 7.74

3X-6X 8.19

Note 6
	6.22

Note 7
	S-L 5.50

2X-3X 6.25

Note 4
	S-2X 7.39

3X-6X 7.81
	7.40

	3) Raincoats, yellow 50” length with badge frommets, XS – 4X
	400
	S-2X 33.07

3X-4X 37.63
	46.75

Note 1
	No Bid
	No Bid
	XS-L 5.50

2X-3X 6.50

4X 7.50

Note 2, 3, 5
	S-XL 38.81

2X-3X 44.14

4X 49.48
	No Bid

	3a) Pricing for Item #3 with “SHERIFF” screen printed on back
	400
	S-2X 34.57

3X-4X 39.13
	50.75

Note 1
	No Bid
	No Bid
	XS-L 7.00

2X-3X 8.00

4X 9.00

Note 2, 3, 5
	S-XL 39.88

2X-3X 45.21

4X 50.55
	No Bid

	Exceptions (Yes) or (No)
	
	No
	No
	No
	No
	No
	No
	No


Note 1: Alternate Neese 4755C

Note 5: Does not meet specs

Note 2: Boss Man



Note 6: 30 item minimum order

Note 3: 48” Length



Note 7: Awarded through coin toss

Note 4: $60 set up fee

Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office


P.O. Box 3371


Tampa, FL  33601							
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Purchasing Unit


Jock McGlathery, Buyer


(813) 247-8048








