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BID TABULATION
	Bid Number:  43-04

Bid Title: Tower, Antenna Systems, High Pole Lights, & Camera Services

Opened:  1/25/05 at 3:00 pm

Awarded: March 7, 2005 with an initial year of 3/7/05 thru 3/6/06 and two (2) additional one (1) year renewal options
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	P

A

C

K

/

Q

U

A

N

T

I

T

Y
	SECS

2017 Cattlemen Road

Sarasota, FL 34232

Christopher Lester

PH: 941-378-0080

FX: 941-378-0811
	Volt Telecommunications Inc.

5000 Shore Drive

New Port Richey, FL 34652

Shelby Best

PH: 727-841-8525

FX: 727-846-9398
	North Florida Tower Service, Inc.

P.O. Box 2528

Lake City, FL 32056-2528

Donald Suhl

PH: 386-752-1100

FX: 904-752-4590
	Himes Electric Company

P.O. Box 516

Lutz, FL 33548

Kyle Long

PH: 813-909-1927

FX: 813-909-9776

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4

	PART I  -  COMM ANTENNA & TOWER MAINT
	
	
	
	
	

	 1.  Annual Antenna & Tower Inspection

      (as described in Part C)  OR
	foot
	No Response
	No Response
	5.00/ft
	No Bid

	 2.   Hourly rate for the above service,

      in lieu of price per foot
	hour
	150.00/hr
	380.00/hr
	78.00/hr
	No Bid

	3. Profiling of Tower Structure and appurtances.
	Foot
	15.00/ft
	6.00/ft
	9.50/ft
	No Bid

	4 Painting of Tower Structures (Addendum 2)
	foot
	25.00-Guyed 35.00-SST
	110.00-Guyed  110.00-SST
	14.00-Guyed  14.00-SST
	No Bid

	5. Dismantle & Removal of existing self-supporting towers
	foot
	65.00/ft
	175.00/ft
	95.00/ft
	No Bid

	6.  Dismantle & Removal of existing Guyed Towers
	hour
	50.00/ft
	115.00/ft
	65.00/ft
	No Bid

	7.  Tower Lighting System
	foot
	15.00/ft
	162.00/ft
	3.00/ft
	No Bid

	8.  Antenna and/or Transmission Line
	foot
	15.00/ft
	244.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	9.  Install Antena with 7/8”  Transmission Line
	foot
	12.00/ft
	244.00/ft
	4.50/ft
	No Bid

	10.  Install Antena with 1-5/8” Transmission Line
	foot
	14.00/ft
	244.00/ft
	4.50/ft
	No Bid

	11. Antenna Removal and Replacement
	foot
	10.00/ft
	244.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	12. Antenna removal Only
	Foot
	8.00/ft
	275.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	13. 7/8” Transmission Line/Connector Removal/Replace
	Foot
	11.00/ft
	7.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	14. 1-5/8” Transmission /Connector Removal/Replace
	Foot
	14.00/ft
	9.50/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	15. 7/8” Transmission Line Removal
	Foot
	7.00/ft
	3.50/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	16. 1-5/8” Transmission Line Removal 
	Foot
	9.00/ft
	4.75/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	17.7/8” Connector Removal & Replacement
	Foot
	8.00/ft
	162.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	18. 1-5/8” Connector 7 Removal Replacement
	Foot
	9.00/ft
	162.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	19.  Removal & Replacement of Cable Hangers
	hour
	150.00/hr
	243.00/ft
	75.00/hr
	No Bid

	20. Tower Top Amplifier Removal & Installation
	foot
	9.00/ft
	185.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	21. Tower Top Amplifier Removal & Installation
	hour
	150.00/hr
	243.00/ft
	75.00/hr
	No Bid

	22. Install 6 ft. Mcwv Dish w/ transmission Line
	foot
	14.00/ft
	324.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	23.  Install 6 ft. Mcwv Dish w/ transmission Line
	hour
	225.00/hr
	324.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	24.  Mcxwv Dish & Transmission Line Removal
	foot
	14.00/ft
	324.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	25. Mcxwv Dish & Transmission Line Removal
	hour
	225.00/hr
	324.00/ft
	No Response
	No Bid

	26. Microwave Feed Horn Removal & Replacement
	foot
	12.00/ft
	405.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	27. Microwave Feed Horn Removal Only
	foot
	11.00/ft
	405.00/ft
	4.00/ft
	No Bid

	28. Microwave Dish Optimization
	hour
	150.00/hr
	324.00/hr
	75.00/hr
	No Bid

	29..Miscellaneous Tower, Antenna, Camera work 
	Foot

&

Hour
	150.00/ft

Technician  75.00/hr

Tower Mechanic  65.00/hr

Electrician  60.00/hr

Project Manager  70.00/hr
	243.00/ft

Tower Tech  81.00/hr
	75.00/hr
	No Bid

	30.  Additional Equipment Charges
	
	Note 1, 2

Crew Mobilization  150.00 /trip
	No Response
	No Response
	No Bid

	31. Tower Profiling in conjunction w/ annual inspection (Addendum 1)
	Foot
	15.00/ft
	243.00/hr
	8.50/ft
	No Bid

	32.  Sweeping Transmission Line-Stand Alone (Addendum 1)
	Each
	115.00/ea
	225.00/ea
	100.00/ea
	No Bid

	33. Sweeping Transmission Line w/another task (Adenedum 1)
	Each
	95.00/ea
	175.00/ea
	50.00/ea
	No Bid

	Regular Service Hours
	
	8:00A.M.-5:00P.M.
	8:00 am to 5:00 pm
	8:00 A.M. – 5:00 P.M.
	No Bid

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Part 2: High Mast Pole Light Maintenance
	
	
	
	
	

	1. Labor Cost for 120 Foot Poles
	Hour
	50.00/hr Regular Time

75.00/hr Over Time
	162.00/hr Regular Time

243.00/hr Over Time
	75.00/hr Regular Time

112.50/hr Over Time
	65.00/hr Regular Time

97.50/hr Over Time

	2. Labor Cost for 35 & 40 Foot Poles
	Hour
	50.00/hr Regular Time

75.00/hr Over Time
	162.00/hr Regular Time

243.00/hr Over Time
	75.00/hr Regular Time

112.50/hr Over Time
	65.00/hr Regular Time

97.50/hr Over Time

	3. Equipment Costs
	Hour
	125.00/hr Man-lift 120 ft.

50.00/hr Man-lift 40 ft.
	600.00/hr Bucket Truck

425.00/hr  Electric Scissor Lift
	95.00/hr Bucket Truck (8 hour minimum)
	85.00/hr Bucket Truck

214.00/hr Crane w/2 man bucket

95.00/hr Auger Truck w/operator

	4. Additional charges
	
	150.00 Crew Mobilization
	No Response
	No Response
	No Response

	5. Regular Hours of Service
	
	8:00A.M. - 5:00 P.M.
	8:00A.M. - 5:00 P.M.
	8:00A.M. - 5:00 P.M
	7:00A.M. - 5:00 P.M

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Part 3: CCTV Camera Replacement
	
	
	
	
	

	1. Labor Cost for Arial Work
	Hour
	50.00/hr Regular Time

75.00/hr Over Time
	162.00/hr  Regular Time

243.00/hr  Over Time
	75.00/hr Regular Time

112.50/hr Over Time
	75.00/hr Regular Time

112.50/hr Over Time

	2.  Equipment Costs
	Hour
	125.00/hr Man-lift 120 ft.

50.00/hr Man-lift 40 ft.
	600.00/hr Bucket Truck

425.00/hr  Electric Scissor Lift
	95.00/hr Bucket Truck (8 hour minimum)
	95.00/hr Bucket Truck (8 hour minimum)

	3. Additional Charges
	
	150.00 Crew Mobilization
	No Response
	Note 3
	Note 3

	4. Regular Service Hours
	
	8:00A.M. - 5:00 P.M.
	8:00A.M. - 5:00 P.M.
	8:00A.M. - 5:00 P.M.
	8:00A.M. - 5:00 P.M.
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Note 1: Pricing doesn’t include parts, materials, man-lifts, or cranes

Note 2: Professional Liability Insurance will incur additional charges if required

Note 3: 8 hour minimum on all jobs, 2 men minimum on all hourly jobs


