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BID TABULATION

	BID NUMBER:  44-04, Xerox Paper Supplies 

Opened:  January 12, 2005 @ 3:00 PM

Awarded: February 10, 2005 with an initial period of February 10, 2005 thru February 9, 2006

1St Renewal:

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
	Q

T

Y
	Peninsular Paper Co.

P.O. Box 1197

Tampa, FL 33601

(PH) 813-621-3091

(FX) 813-621-1380

Richard S. Clarke Jr.
	Office Depot

1909 US HWY 301 N

Suite 100

Tampa, FL 33619

(PH) 813-621-1389

(FX) 813-621-1245

Jim Olsen

	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM (S)
	
	1
	2 

	20# Xerox 4200 White – 3R2047

8.5 x 11
	200
	NO BID
	$25.18

	20# Xerox 4200 White – 3R3761 

11x 17
	200
	NO BID
	$25.85

	20# Xerox 4200 White – 3R2641

(3hole) 8.5x11
	160
	NO BID
	$27.70

	24# Xerox 4024 White – 3R3871 (letterhead)


11 x 17
	120
	NO BID
	NO BID

	24# Xerox Brite White Color Exp


8.5 x 11

	40
	NO BID
	$107.00

	20# Xerox 2Part Carbonless

8.5 x 11

	5
	NO BID
	$150.22

	20# Xerox 3Part Carbonless

8.5 x 11

	10
	NO BID
	$155.92

	20# Xerox 4Part Carbonless


8.5 x 11
	2
	NO BID
	$185.61

	90# Colorsource White Index

8.5 x 11
	20
	NO BID
	NO BID

	90# Colorsource Green Index

8.5 x 11
	10
	NO BID
	NO BID

	90# Colorsource Canary Index


8.5 x 11
	10
	NO BID
	NO BID

	110# Colorsource White Index


8.5 x 11
	10
	NO BID
	NO BID

	20# Colorsource Ivory


8.5 x 11
	30
	NO BID
	$33.30

	20# Colorsource Green

8.5 x 11
	10
	NO BID
	$33.30

	20# Colorsource Canary

8.5 x 11

	10
	NO BID
	$33.30

	20# Colorsource Gray



8.5 x 11
	2
	NO BID
	$33.30

	20# Colorsource Blue



8.5 x 11
	5
	NO BID
	$33.30

	20# Colorsource Tan



8.5 x 11
	2
	NO BID
	$33.30

	20# Colorsource Cream

8.5 x 11

	2
	NO BID
	NO BID


	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM (S)


	
	Peninsular Paper, Inc
	Office Depot

	20# Colorsource Blue



8.5 x 11
	5
	NO BID
	$33.30

	20# Colorsource Tan



8.5 x 11
	2
	NO BID
	$33.30

	20# Colorsource Cream

8.5 x 11

	2
	NO BID
	NO BID

	8pt Kromecote Laser HG C1S


12 x 18
	8
	NO BID
	NO BID

	10pt Kromecote Laser HG C1S


12 x 18
	2
	NO BID
	NO BID

	12pt Kromecote Laser HG C1S


12 x 18

	2
	NO BID
	NO BID

	140# PPG Teslin Synthetic White Sheets

11 x 17
	4
	NO BID
	NO BID

	140# PPG Teslin Synthetic White Sheets

8 x 11
	1
	NO BID
	NO BID

	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	

	TOTAL AWARD
	
	
	$23,564.22

	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	



Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office


P.O. Box 3371


Tampa, FL  33601							
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Purchasing Unit


Violet Bachmann, Senior Procurement Analyst


(813) 247-8029
































Purchasing Department


Violet Bachmann, Sr Procurement Analyst


813-247-8029





AWARDED VENDOR WILL NOTIFY HCSO WITHIN 30 DAYS OF INCREASE’S SET FORTH BY THE PAPERMILL. ALL INCREASES WILL INCLUDE LETTER FROM PAPER MILL STIPULATING THE INCREASE.


