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 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1
BID TABULATION

	BID NUMBER: 5-05, Inmate Canteen Items

Opened: June 8, 2005  @ 3:00 PM

Awarded:  July 22, 2005

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
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	Lance 

4507 W. Hillsborough

Tampa, FL 

33614

PH:(813) 880-9000

FX: (813) 889-0312

Gary Ratliff
	Bob Barker Company

118 E. Jones St.

P.O. Box 429

Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526

PH: (800) 334-9880

FX: (800) 322-7537

Matt Anderson or Mary Shea
	Carr Barber Supply

14930 N. Florida Ave

Tampa, FL 

33613

PH: (813) 269-9664

FX: (813) 269-7227

E. J. Carr
	Quick Aid 

6400 Regency Pkwy 

Suite 600

Norcross, GA

30071

PH: (800) 269-0963

FX: (813) 991-6403

Carolyn Kobasko
	H.T. Hackney Co.

9330 Adamo Dr. E

Tampa, FL 

33619

PH: (813) 621-0100

FX: (813) 621-5182

Jeff York
	Apex Office Products

5209 N Howard Ave

Tampa, FL 

33603

PH: (813) 871-2010

FX; (813) 875-9059

Ray Klaus

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6

	THREE MUSKETEERS CANDY BAR
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.40
	No bid

	MARS CANDY BAR- aka Snickers/Almonds
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.40
	No bid

	SNICKERS CANDY BAR
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.39
	No bid

	REESES PEANUT BUTTER CUPS
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.40
	No bid

	HERSHEY CANDY BAR - Almond
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.40
	No bid

	M & M PEANUT CANDY
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.39
	No bid

	M & M PLAIN CANDY
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.39
	No bid

	ROOT BEER BARRELS
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.35
	No bid

	BUTTERFINGER
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.40
	No bid

	KIT KAT
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.40
	No bid

	CHICK O STICK (p/butter &coconut)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.1031
	No bid


	
	
	Lance
	Bob Barker Company
	Carr Barber
	Quick Aid
	H.T. Hackney
	Apex Office Supplies

	CHOCOLATE COOKIES
	
	.2160
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	VANILLA COOKIES
	
	.2160
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	GOLD-N-CHEESE CRACKERS
	
	.2340
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	VANILLA SUGAR WAFERS
	
	.3150
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	NUT O LUNCH
	
	.2160
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	GRILLED CHEESE CRACKERS
	
	.2430
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	TOASTCHEE CRACKERS
	
	.2430
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	PLAIN POTATO CHIPS
	
	.2340
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	CRUNCHY CHEESE TWISTS
	
	.2340
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	BQ PORK SKINS
	
	.3600
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	BBQ CHIPS
	
	.2340
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	SUNFLOWER KERNELS
	
	.3330
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	SNACK MIX
	
	.3465
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	HEALTH MIX
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	STRAWBERRY CEREAL BAR
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	BANANA MOON PIE
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.355
	No bid

	NACHO S CHIPS, (Don Pablo)
	
	.2340
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	OATMEAL PIE
	
	.3510
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	DUNKING STICKS
	
	.3510
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	SALTED PEANUTS
	
	.2430
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	GRANOLA BAR
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.32
	No bid

	PEANUT BAR *lg
	
	.3060
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	BEEF STICKS
	
	.2880
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	HOT SAUSAGE
	
	.2880
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	CUP-A-SOUP-(4pk) 
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.24
	No bid

	YELLOW RICE
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.38
	No bid

	TUNA FISH
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.89
	No bid

	INSTANT GRITS
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.1725
	No bid

	NOODLES & CHEESE
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.42
	No bid

	VIENNA SAUSAGE - CHIC
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.925
	No bid

	CHILI N RICE
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.3412
	No bid

	RED BEANS N RICE
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.6938
	No bid

	SWEET SUE CHICKEN
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.35
	No bid


	
	
	Lance
	Bob Barker Company
	Carr Barber Supply
	Quick Aid
	H.T. Hackney
	Apex Office Supplies

	ORANGE DRINK (10 pk)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.2858
	No bid

	APPLE DRINK (3pk) 
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.3185
	No bid

	YOO-HOO DRINK (4pk)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.3828
	No bid

	CIRCLE A WORD BOOK
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	RADIO - HEADSET
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	24.88
	No bid

	AA BATTERIES
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.68
	1.39

	AAA BATTERIES
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.68
	1.39

	PLAYING CARDS(Trump -old #170)
	
	No bid
	Note 1

$.34
	No bid
	No bid
	.5358
	No bid

	PINOCHLE CARDS( Hoyle #171)
	
	No bid
	Note 1

$.98
	No bid
	No bid
	1.20
	No bid

	BASKETBALLS
	
	No bid
	Note 1

$8.84
	No bid
	No bid
	8.45
	No bid

	BASKETBALL NETS-Sports Authority
	
	No bid
	Note 1

$2.85
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	PLAYGROUND BALLS
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	UNO CARDS
	
	No bid
	$4.80
	No bid
	No bid
	5.93
	No bid

	CHECKERS GAMES
	
	No bid
	$2.20
	No bid
	No bid
	2.304
	No bid

	CHESS GAMES
	
	No bid
	$2.60
	No bid
	No bid
	3.404
	No bid

	DOMINOS
	
	No bid
	$5.45
	No bid
	No bid
	3.772
	No bid

	APAP (TYLENOL) 
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.86
	No bid
	No bid

	CHLORPHEN (ANTIHISTAMINE
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.19
	No bid
	No bid

	TOLNAFTATE (ANTI-FUNGAL)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.17
	No bid
	No bid

	ANTIBIOTIC OINTMENT (10-(.32oz) pks
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.14
	No bid
	No bid

	COUGH CALMER (24 drops)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.25
	No bid
	No bid

	MILK OF MAGNESIA (12oz)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.50
	No bid
	No bid

	ELECTRIC CLIPPERS-Carr
	
	No bid
	No bid
	37.45
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	BARBICIDE JAR-Carr
	
	No bid
	No bid
	13.50
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	BARBICIDE SOLUTION 16OZ-Carr
	
	No bid
	No bid
	3.95
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	CLIPPER OIL-Carr
	
	No bid
	No bid
	1.50
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	OYSTER DISINFECTANT SPRAY-Carr
	
	No bid
	No bid
	4.95
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	SCISSORS-Carr
	
	No bid
	No bid
	13.43
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	TWEEZERS-Carr
	
	No bid
	No bid
	.95
	No bid
	Note 1

.516
	No bid

	PLASTIC AMERICA MIRROR
	
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid


	
	
	Lance
	Bob Barker Company
	Carr Barber
	Quick Aid
	H.T. Hackney
	Apex Office Supplies

	THINNING SHEARS
	
	
	No bid
	17.99
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	TRIM, NAIL CLIPPERS
	
	
	No bid
	1.15
	No bid
	Note 1

.7425
	No bid

	EMERY BOARD
	
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.51
	No bid

	SALINE SOLUTION
	
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	2.12
	No bid

	TOOTHBRUSH
	
	
	.14
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	TOOTHPASTE – COLGATE CLEAR
	
	
	1.67
	No bid
	No bid
	1.70
	No bid

	CLEAR MOUTHWASH-Bob Barker
	
	No bid
	.65
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	POLIGRIP
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	2.64
	No bid

	AFRO-PICK
	
	No bid
	.07
	.15
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	LARGE COMB
	
	No bid
	.03
	.25
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	HAIR BRUSH- (Mark IV)
	
	No bid
	Note 1

.26
	No bid
	No bid
	.62
	No bid

	HAIR TIES
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.105
	No bid

	HAIR DRESSING (ROYAL 4OZ)
	
	No bid
	Note 2

1.32
	No bid
	No bid
	1.32
	No bid

	REGULAR SHAMPOO
	
	No bid
	1.10
	No bid
	No bid
	1.07
	No bid

	DANDRUFF SHAMPOO (Crawford Clear)
	
	No bid
	Note 1 & 3

.83
	No bid
	Note 4

2.54
	.89
	No bid

	REGULAR CONDITIONER (Crawford)
	
	No bid
	Note 1 & 3

.52
	No bid
	No bid
	.89
	No bid

	SHOWER GEL (Crawford)
	
	No bid
	Note 1

1.88
	No bid
	No bid
	.91
	No bid

	ROLL ON DEODORANT 
	
	No bid
	Note 8

.27
	No bid
	No bid
	.975
	No bid

	BODY LOTION (Crawford) 
	
	No bid
	Note 1 & 3

2.85
	No bid
	No bid
	.89
	No bid

	BABY POWDER(JOHNSON)
	
	No bid
	Note 1

.28
	No bid
	No bid
	1.212
	No bid

	MEDICATED SKIN CREAM (Noxzema)
	
	No bid
	Note 1

.65
	No bid
	No bid
	1.27
	No bid


	
	
	Lance
	Bob Barker Company
	Carr Barber
	Quick Aid
	H.T. Hackney
	Apex Office Supplies

	LATHER SHAVE GEL (Crawford) 
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.91
	No bid

	AFTER SHAVE LOTION (Crawford)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.91
	No bid

	MAGIC SHAVE CREAM
	
	No bid
	2.71
	No bid
	No bid
	Note 1 & 4

2.42
	No bid

	LIP BALM
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	Note 1

.36
	1.34
	No bid

	CANVAS TENNIS SHOES  (SZ 5-17)
	
	No bid
	3.90
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	PENS-Wonderwriter - OFFICE DEPOT
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	Note 9

.23

	MANILLA ENVELOPES W/O CLASPS
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	Note 9

.077
	Note 9

.08

	SPARCO LEGAL PADS 8 ½ X 11
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.466
	.401

	TOP FLIGHT DRAWING PAD
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	1.22
	2.69

	WATERCOLOR MARKERS
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.666
	3.49

	WOODEN PENCILS W/ERASER
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.77
	Note 5

.43

	Note 7

YELLOW LEGAL PADS 81/2 X 11
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.466
	4.81

	PAPER BAGS - (6 lb)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.0191
	8.68

	PAPER BAGS - (25 lb)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.0473
	18.89

	PAPER BAGS - (1/6 57 LB)
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.0611
	24.73

	PAPERMATE SHARPWRITER PENCILS .07MM – YELLOW BARREL
	
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	.22

	
	
	No bid
	No bid
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 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1
Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office


P.O. Box 3371


Tampa, FL  33601							





�





Purchasing Unit


Violet Bachmann, Sr. Procurement Analyst


(813) 247-8029




















Note 1: Not brand requested in bid			Note 9: No award – NACO Agreement less expensive


Note 2: Tie breaker – coin toss – W. Moyer / V. Bachmann


Note 3: Bottle not clear	                           


Note 4: No sample


Note 5: Dozen price


Note 6: 500 per pk – sold by pk only


Note 7: Duplicate item – in 


Note 8: Item is not of same quality as currently in stock  



























