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 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1
	BID  NUMBER:  55-05

Opened: January 26, 2006 @ 3:00 P.M.

Awarded:  March 15, 2006
Sheriff’s Office Civilian Uniforms

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
	Logo Outfitters

14501 McCormick Dr.

Tampa , FL 33626

(PH) 813-814-7596

(FX) 813-855-8655

David Heggland
	Brown & Bigelow
3529 Autumn Glen Dr.

Valrico, FL 33594

(PH) 813-417-2327

(FX) 813-654-8434

Jill Oppolo
	Superior Uniform Group
10055 Seminole Blvd

Seminole, FL 33772

(PH) 800-627-8467

(FX) 727-456-2617

Nan Patrick
	DesignLab Inc.

825 Old Airport Rd

Greenville, SC 29607

(PH) 800-786-7464

(FX) 864-297-7198

Bruce Weissmann

NOTE 5 & 6
	Harrison Uniforms
120 NW 25st St

Miami, FL 33127

(PH) 305-572-1240

Elizabeth Cowen

STATEMENT OF NO BID
	Galls Inc.
2680 Palumbo Dr.

Lexington, KY 40509

(PH) 800-876-4242

Audra Meighan

STATEMENT OF NO BID
	
	

	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7
	8

	A1:  SHERIFF POLO, SHORT           SLEEVE


	NOTE 1
$19.00

	NOTE 3
$18.50 (SM-XLG)
$20.50 (2XL)
$21.25 (3XLG)
$30.65 (4XLG)
	$10.95
	NOTE 4
$19.95

$26.48 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A1:  SHERIFF POLO, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3

$22.25 (SM-XLG)
$23.50 (2XL)

$25.00 (3XLG)

$34.00 (4XLG)
	$13.35
	NOTE 4

$22.58
	
	
	
	

	A2: INSTRUCTOR POLO, SHORT SLEEVE
	NOTE 1

$17.00
	NOTE 3
$15.50 (SM – XLG)

$17.50 (2XLG)

$17.65 (3XLG)

$26.15 (4XLG)
	$10.95
	NOTE 4 
$16.47

$23.48 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A2: INSTRUCTOR POLO, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3
$18.35 (SM – XLG)

$19.50 (2XLG)

$20.50 (3XLG)

$30.00 (4XLG)
	$13.35
	$19.08
	
	
	
	


	A3: CHAPLAIN – POLO, SHORT SLEEVE
	NOTE 1

$19.00
	NOTE 3

$18.50 (SM – XLG)

$17.40 (2XL)

$17.65 (3XL)

$26.15 (4XLG)
	$10.95
	NOTE 4
$19.95

$26.98 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A3: CHAPLAIN POLO, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3

$22.25 (SM-XLG)
$23.50 (2XLG)

$25.00 (3XLG)

$34.00 (4XLG)
	$13.35
	$22.58
	
	
	
	

	A4: COMMUNICATIONS POLO, SHORT SLEEVE


	NOTE 1

$17.00


	NOTE 3
$14.65 (SM-XLG)

$16.65 (2XLG)

$17.05 (3XLG)

$26.65 (4XLG)
	$11.95
	NOTE 4
$17.95

$24.98 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A4: COMMUNICATIONS POLO, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3

$18.85 (SM – XLG)

$20.00 (2XLG)

$21.70 (3XLG)

$30.00 (4XLG)
	$14.25
	$19.95
	
	
	
	

	A5: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY, SHORT SLEEVE
	NOTE 1

$17.00
	NOTE 3
$15.50 (SM – XLG)

$17.40 (2XLG)

$17.65 (3XLG)

$26.15 (4XLG)
	$10.95
	NOTE 4
$16.47

$23.48 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A5: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3
$18.35 (SM-XLG)

$19.50 (2XLG)

$20.50 (3XLG)

$30.00 ( 4XLG)
	$13.35
	$19.08
	
	
	
	


	A6: EVIDENCE, SHORT SLEEVE


	NOTE 1

$17.00


	NOTE 3
$15.15 (SM – XLG)

$17.05 (2XLG)

$17.40 (3XLG)

$26.80 (4XLG)
	$11.95
	NOTE 4
$17.95

$24.98 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A6: EVIDENCE , LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3

$19.00 (SM – XLG)

$19.20 (2XLG)

$21.70 (3XLG)

$30.70 (4XLG)
	$14.35
	$19.95
	
	
	
	

	A7: FACILITIES, SHORT SLEEVE


	NOTE 1

$17.00


	NOTE 3
$14.50 (SM – XLG)

$16.40 (2XLG)

$16.75 (3XLG)

$26.15 (4XLG)
	$10.95
	NOTE 4 
$16.47

$23.48 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A7: FACILITIES, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3

$18.35 (SM – XLG)
$19.50 (2XLG)

$21.70 (3XLG)

$30.70 (4XLG)
	$13.35
	$19.08
	
	
	
	

	A8: IDENTIFICATION, SHORT SLEEVE
	NOTE 1

$17.00
	NOTE 3
$16.15 (SM – XLG)

$18.10 (2XLG)

$18.30 (3XLG)
$26.80 (4 XLG)
	$11.95
	NOTE 4
$17.95

$24.98 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A8: IDENTIFICATION, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3
$19.00 (SM –XLG)

$19.20 (2XLG)

$21.70 (3XLG)

$30.70 (4XLG)
	$14.25
	$19.95
	
	
	
	


	A9: FLEET MAINTENANCE, SHORT SLEEVE 
	NOTE 1
$17.00
	NOTE 3
$15.15 (SM – XLG)

$17.05 (2XLG)

$17.40 (3XLG)

$26.80 (4XLG)
	$11.95
	NOTE 4
$17.95

$24.98 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A9: FLEET MAINTENANCE, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3
$19.00 (SM – XLG)

$19.20 (2XLG)

$21.70 (3XLG)

$30.70 (4XLG)
	$14.25
	$19.95
	
	
	
	

	A10: PHOTO LAB, SHORT SLEEVE
	NOTE 1

$17.00
	NOTE 3
$14.65 (SM – XLG)

$16.65 (2XLG)

$17.05 (3XLG)

$26.65 (4XLG)
	$11.95
	NOTE 4 
$17.95

$24.98 (4XLG)
	
	
	
	

	A10: PHOTO LAB, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3
$18.85 (SM – XLG)

$20.00 (2XLG)

$21.70 (3XLG)

$30.70 (4XLG)
	$14.25
	$19.95
	
	
	
	

	A11: COMM MAINTENANCE, SHORT SLEEVE 
	NOTE 1

$17.00
	NOTE 3
$14.65 (SM – XLG)

$16.65 (2XLG)

$17.05 (3XLG)

$26.65 (4XLG)
	$11.95
	NOTE 4 
$17.95

$24.98 (4XLG)


	
	
	
	

	A11: COMM MAINTENANCE, LONG SLEEVE
	NONE NOTED
	NOTE 3
$18.85 (SM – XLG)

$20.00 (2XLG)

$21.70 (3XLG)

$30.70 (4XLG)
	$14.25
	$19.95
	
	
	
	


	B1: CASUAL PANTS – WOMENS / MENS (28-42)


	$17.00 (EDWARDS)

$20.00 (DICKIES)
	NO BID
	$12.85
	$17.48 (PLAIN)
	
	
	
	

	B1: CASUAL PANTS – WOMENS / MENS (44-54)
	$19.00 (EDWARDS)

$23.00 (DICKIES)
	NO BID
	$15.42
	$18.90 (PLEATED)
	
	
	
	

	C: MEN’S WORK SHIRT LONG SLEEVE, WHITE W/SEWN PATCH(SP) / EMBROIDERED PATCH(EP)
	DICKIES:

$15.00(SP)                                $17.00(EP)
GCA/2559:

$13.00(SP)
$15.00(EP)
	NO BID
	MARTIN’S #23070
$11.85
$17.25
	RED CAP #SP14WH
$11.56 (SP)

$14.95(EP)
	
	
	
	

	D: MEN’S WORK SHIRT SHORT SLEEVE WHITE W/SEWN PATCH (SP) EMBROIDERED PATCH (EP)
	DICKIES

$13.50(SP)
$15.00(EP)
GCA/2559

$11.50(SP)
$13.50(EP)
	NO BID
	MARTIN’S #22070
$9.95
$16.45
	RED CAP #SP24WH
$9.95(SP)

$13.45(EP)
	
	
	
	

	E: MEN’S WORK SHIRT LONG SLEEVE – SPRUCE  W/SEWN PATCH (SP) EMBROIDERED PATCH(EP)
	DICKIES

$16.00(SP)
$18.00(EP)
GCA / 2568

$13.00(SP)
$15.00(EP)
	NO BID
	MARTIN’S #23073
$12.85

$18.25
	RED CAP #SP14SG
$11.45(SP)

$14.95(EP)


	
	
	
	


	F: LADIES SPRUCE PANTS
	NO BID
	NO BID
	MARTIN’S #21363
$12.85
	RED KAP #PT59SG
$14.95
	
	
	
	

	G: SPRUCE MENS PANTS, 
SIZE UP TO 43
SIZE 44 AND UP
	DICKIES
$20.00

$23.00 (44 & UP)
GCA

$17.00

$20.00 (44 & UP)
	NO BID
	MARTIN’S #231113
$16.95
	RED KAP #PT10SG

$14.95
	
	
	
	

	H: MEN’S WORK SHIRT SHORT SLEEVE SPRUCE W/SEWN PATCH (SP), EMBROIDERED PATCH (EP)
	DICKIES

$14.25 (SP)
$16.25(EP)
GCA

$12.50(SP)
$14.50(EP)
	NO BID
	MARTIN’S #22073
$9.95
	RED KAP #SP24SG
$10.45
	
	
	
	

	I: HARRITON OR EQUAL OXFORD SHIRTS SHORT / LONG SLEEVE, MEN / WOMENS

S thru XL

2XL

3XL

4XL
	NOTE 2

$22.00

$24.00

$25.00

$26.00
	NO BID
	MENS/WOMENS SHORT SLEEVE
$19.45
MEN/WOMENS LONG SLEEVE

$20.45
	MEN’S SHORT SLEEVE $22.95
MEN/WOMENS LONG SLEEVE $25.95

WOMEN’S SHORT SLEEVE $ 26.95
	
	
	
	

	J: EMBROIDERING – 2 LINES, WITH MAX OF 35 CHARACTERS
	$4.00
	NO BID
	$2.50
	$3.00
	
	
	
	

	K: ADD’L CHARGE FOR LETTER’S OVER 35 CHARACTER’S
	NO CHARGE
	NO BID
	$0.12
	$0.15
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	PRICING BY LINE ITEM
	$340.75
	$855.05
	$289.52
	$329.65
	
	
	
	


Note 1: Pricing is for Jerzee 438m, additional pricing available for alternate manufacture




Note 4: Ultra Club #8590

Note 2: Price includes add
itional charges for larger sizes as follows: $2.00 for 2xlg, $3.00 for 3xlg, $4.00 for 4xlg

Note 5: Oversize charges: Shirts: 2xl – 3xl -20%, male trousers: 46 and up – 20%, female slacks: 22 and up – 20% 
Note 3: 4xlg is a Chestnut Hill – 4xlg not available in Jerzee (noted in bid amendment)




Note 6: Willing to provide website based ordering

Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office


P.O. Box 3371


Tampa, FL  33601							





�





Purchasing Unit


Violet Bachmann, 


Sr Purchasing Analysis


(813) 247-8029





