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QUOTATION TABULATION
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	QUOTE NUMBER: 

Opened:  April  2, 2007
Awarded:  June 15, 2007
Initial Period: One year 
Renewals: Three
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
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	Law Enforcement Supply

5404 Airport Blvd. 

Tampa, FL 33634

PH: 800-326-4019 

FX: 813-885-7787

Mark Sevigny X4611


	Law Enforcement Supply

Alternate Style
	Central Public Safety

3810-A W. Osborne

Tampa, FL 33614

PH: 813-348-4866

FX: 813-348-0450

Jack Stephens
	Central Public Safety

Alternate Style
	AFS

 (Anclote Fire & Safety)

460 E. Lemon St.

Tarpon Springs, FL 34689

PH: 727-942-8533

FX: 727-937-0981

John Farrar
	AFS

Alternate Style
	Don Hume Leathergoods

500 26th ST NW

Miami, OK 74354

PH: 800-331-2686

FX: 918-542-4340

Gail Wilford 

	
	
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)
	
	(1A)  Bianchi
	(1B) Bianchi,  (1C)Safariland
	(2A)Gould & Goodrich Security Pro  
	(2B)Gould & Goodrich    K-Force 
	(3A)Gould & Goodrich Security Pro 
	(3B)Gould & Goodrich  K-Force 
	(4A)Don Hume Leathergoods

	1
	Duty Belt 2-1/4” – Hook Lining 
	EA
	22.75
	(1B) 27.24
	22.40
	32.15
	26.63
	38.75
	No Bid 

	2
	Duty Belt 2-1/4” – Unlined 
	EA
	No Bid 
	
	20.76

Security Pro 
	30.20
	28.75
	41.25
	46.20

	3
	Belt Keepers 
	EA
	1.38
	
	1.36
	1.42
	1.73
	1.78
	2.64

	4
	Duty Holster – Triple Retention
	EA
	50.79
Uncle Mike’s Pro3
	(1C) MULTIPLE (6)       See List Attached 
	63.35
	82.59
	81.25
	89.74
	68.80

	5
	HandcuffCcase, Single Pair, Chain Cuffs
	EA
	11.99
	
	12.18
	12.65
	15.63
	16.25
	21.00

	6
	Double Magazine Case 
	EA
	16.75
	
	13.15
	17.35
	16.88
	21.81
	23.20

	7
	Double Magazine Case for Glock 
	EA
	16.75
	
	13.15
	17.35
	16.88
	21.81
	23.20

	8
	Single Magazine Case 
	EA
	9.75
	
	10.60
	12.55
	13.63
	16.13
	17.70

	9
	Aerosol Case, Small Canister 
	EA
	11.75
	
	11.69
	13.64
	15
	16.25
	18.55

	10
	Baton Holder, ASP F21 
	EA
	
	
	11.69
	15.12
	15
	19.40
	18.60

	11
	Radio Holder        
	EA
	20.99
	
	12.65
	16.15
	16.25
	20.75
	13.00

	12
	Flashlight Case, Stinger  
	EA
	7.49
	(1B) 12.10
	11.50
	12.65
	14.75
	16.25
	16.75

	13
	Pager Case
	EA
	9.49
	
	11.69
	13.64
	9.10
	9.10
	No Bid 

	14
	Cell Phone Case 
	EA
	No Bid
	
	11.69
	13.64
	15
	17.50
	19.95

	15
	Glove Case 
	EA
	8.49
	
	9.99
	9.99
	12.83
	12.50
	12.70

	
	Samples Included  
	
	Yes
	Yes
	Yes 
	Yes 
	Yes 
	Yes 
	Yes


Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office


P.O. Box 3371


Tampa, FL  33601							
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Purchasing Unit


Janice Wilder, Buyer


(813) 247-0026
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