BID NUMBER: 21-08 OPENED: Nov 7,2008 AWARDED: INITIAL TERM: ONE YEAR ANNUAL RENEWALS UP TO THREE YEARS
1 2 4 5 6 g
SHADED AREA ICS Unitex Internat'l Bob Barker Co. Textile Sales Robinson Textiles ~ ~ Charm-Tex
INDICATES AWARD P.0. Box 21056 2855 N. Berkeley Lake Rd P.0. Box 429 P.O. Box 32576 152 W. Walmut St. #250, 1618 Coney Island Ave
Waco, TX 76702 NW Duluth, GA 30096 Fuquay-Varina NC 27526 | Baltimore MD 21282 Gardena CA 90248 mwoo.ﬁws NY 11 wuo .
Ph: 800-524-5427 Ph: 770-232-0060 Ph: 800-334-9880 Ph: 800-724-8040 Ph: 800-421-8582 Ph: woomww,u‘mw:u
Fx: 254-751-0299 Fx: 770-232-0038 Fx: 800-322-7537 Fx: 410-356-5015 Fx: 800-370-7019 Fx: 718-258-8303
Michelle Markum Raheem Hussain Matt Anderson Gary Zemil Pam Hurt _ StanDanzger
icswacosales@ raheem@ mattanderson@ textile@verizon.net robtexemail@aol.com s.«m,\.em_p.@org#oxboﬁ‘ ,
hotmail.com unitexonline.com bobbarker.com o e .
tanoryn — | F | | C | | D2 | IR G | | A | . E |
Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen
Description of [tems Item Stock # Item Stock # Ttem Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock # Ttem Stock #
4 7 [ [ # [ _ ALTERNATE BID ITEMS 7 _ | [ _ F ﬂ _
$9.12 $7.00 $7.45 $8.10 Ao $8.00
1. Pillow Case 55/45 Blend 50/50 Blend 65/35 Blend N/A 55/45 Blend NO BID Muslin 4234W130 50/50
_ B) $9.90
1022 PC4234 TSIPC E_m hmuhﬁﬁmo * Acme 72771
$31.40 $35.00 $33.75 $33.90 A)§3400 $39.00
2. Flat Sheet 55/45 Blend 50/50 Blend 65/35 Blend N/A 55/45 Blend NO BID lin. 66104W130 50/50 Blend
B) $44.90
L0202 5H66104L TS6A Percale mlgcﬁwo Acme 22396
$26.80 $31.90 AN ERA00- $39.00
3, Fitted Sheet NO BID NO BID 65/35 Blend N/A 55/45 Blend NO BID ~ Muslin 30756W130 50/50
B) $44.90
FS3075L TS30756 Percale 30756W180 Acme 24517
$12.98 $9.50 $16.50 Import o Sissa $18.00
4, Bath Towel 86/14 Blend 20"x40" 86/14 Blend 20"x40" 84/16 Blend 20"x40" Alt1: $13.31 5.51b/dz NO BID NO BID . 86/14 w_@@\wwﬂ_iﬁ: 85/15 Blend 20" x 40"
Alt2: $10.24 5.0 Ib. o
LCP16 Domestic BB4220 Alt3: $8.724.25 Ib ~ BT2040J6.5P Acme 11547
$2.44 $1.95 $3.80 Alt1:$2.42 11b $3.18
5. Wash Cloth 86/14 Blend 12"x12" 86/14 blend 12"x12" 86/14 Blend 12"x12" Alt2:$1.94 .75 1b NO BID NO BID 86/14 Blend 12"x12"
LCP17 BB4040 WC1212J1.0P
95.24 $70.8 $83.40 $64.32 $98.00
6. Cotton Blanket 100% Cotton 66"x90" NO BID 100% Cotton $96.00 100% Cotton 66"x90" 100%Cotton 66"x90"
L027 "TS6090 RTTB Thermal Acme 66350
$91.44 $67.20 $50.16 $76.00
7. Wool Blanket 70% wool 62"x90" NO BID 50% Wool 62"x80" $95.00 50% wool, 54"x80" 52% Wool 62"X84"
RTWB BL/DB50E Acme 67510




| |
BID NUMBER: 21-08 OPENED: Nov 7,2008 AWARDED: INITIAL TERM: ONE YEAR ANNUAL RENEWALS UP TO THREE YEARS
9 10 11
SHADED AREA Tabb Textile Logical Linen Imperial Textile
INDICATES AWARD 511 Pleasant Dr. P. 0. Box 471614 Rick Puglisi
Opelika, AT 36801 Miami FL 33247 800-870-4494
Ph: 334-745-6762 Ph: 954-443-2699
Fx: 334-745-2377 Fx: 954-443-3510
Marsha Thrift Joe Faluade
tabb@textilegroup.net logicallinen@aolcom
| [ H ] B | | | | | | | | | | | | |
Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen Price per Dozen
Description of Items Item Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock # Item Stock #
l l ] I l I I [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [
7.95 $11.34
1. Pillow Case 50/50 Blend 55/45 Blend Statement of NO BID
PC110
$31.00 $46.50
2. Flat Sheet 50/50 Blend 55/45 Blend
MS200
$43.00 $44.28
3. Fitted Sheet 50/50 Blend 55/45 Blend
FT299
A) $8.25 $14.10
4. Bath Towel 86/14 Blend 20"x40' BT130 86/14 Blend 20"x40'
B) $13.00
86/14 Blend 20"x40" BT240
A) $1.70 $3.11
5. Wash Cloth 86/14 Blend 12"x12" WC110 86/14 Blend 12"x12"
B) $3.09
86/14 Blend 12"x12" WC331
$63.00 $84.00
6. Cotton Blanket 100%Cotton 66"x90" 100% Cotton 66"x90"
TB122
$56.40 $138.24
7. Wool Blanket 50% Wool 62"x84" 70%Wool 62" x 80"
WBI110 Commander




