P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

Bid Number: 06-00

Description: Photographic Supplies

Opened: February 9, 2000 @ 3:00 P.M.
Awarded: May 17, 2000 thru December 31, 2000
Part 1 of 3

Basis for Award. Best Price

Items Boxed Indicate Award

Alkit Pro Camera
222 Park Ave S
New York, NY
10003-1504

P 212-674-1515
F 212-533-8044

FEIN 13-3208802

B & H Photo Video
420 Ninth Ave
New York, NY
10001

P 212-444-6600

F 212-239-7770

FEIN 13-2768071

BID TABULATION

PURCHASING SECTION
Carolyn Hendrickson
(813) 247-8054

Camera Hutt
518 Oakfield Drive

Brandon, FL 33511

P 813-681-2625
F 813-684-1079

FEIN 59-2701321

Dixie Sales Company

11251 Phillips Pkwy Dr
E

Jacksonville, FL
32256-1570

P 904-292-1852
F 904-262-5394

FEIN 59-3418855

Focus Camera Inc
905 McDonald Ave
Brooklyn, NY 11218-
5611

P 877-685-8799

F 718-437-8860

FEIN 11-2713285

HPI International
186 21 Street

Brooklyn, NY 11232

P 718-768-8800
F 718-768-0743

FEIN 13-3140252

J & L Photo Supply
820 E 42™ Street

Brooklyn, NY 11210

P 718-258-7383
F 718-421-4869

FEIN 11-3259965

Tara Curnen X 332 Dan Waxel Mike Giordano Robin Bannon x 221 Mark Silber Amy Berger Sarah Freund
Mary Crooks X 217
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
KODAK PRODUCTS PRICES GOOD PRICES GOOD PRICES GOOD THRU PRICES GOOD THRU PRICES GOOD THRU PRICES GOOD THRU PRICES GOOD

THRU 12/31/00 THRU 12/31/00 12/31/00 12/31/00 12/31/00 12/31/00 THRU 12/31/00

GROUP I: NON-CARDED ROLL FILM
FOR COLOR PRINTS
1. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/12, .
20 rl/pk #1393594 $/RL 1.86 2.59 2.66 no bid 1.99
2. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/24, .
20 rl/pk #1863505 $/RL COIN TOSS - 2.19 2.99 3.56 no bid 2.19

CH/JR
3. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/36, .
20 rl/pk #114613 $/RL 3.22 3.59 4.68 no bid 3.39
4. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC .
135/12, 20 rl/pk #1963206 $/RL 2.48 3.39 3.37 no bid 2.19 2.55
5. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC no bid
135/24, 20 rl/pk #1973551 $/RL 2.40 3.65 4.51 2.39 3.09
6. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC .
135/36, 20 rl/pk #1584531 $/RL 3.85 4.49 5.79 no bid 3.79 3.55 4.15
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS none none 20 rolls NA none $100.00 No minimum




DESCRIPTION

Alkit Pro Camera

B & H Photo Video

Camera Hutt

Dixie Sales Company

Focus Camera Inc

HPI International

J & L Photo Supply

GROUP II: NON-CARDED ROLL FILM
FOR COLOR SLIDES

7. Ecktachrome Color Elite 100 EB

135/24 (20 rolls/pack) #1113612 3.28 3.99 4.82 no bid 3.79 3.22 3.99
$/RL
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS none none 20 rolls NA none $100.00 Nno minimum
GROUP Ill: NON-CARDED ROLL
PROFESSIONAL STILL FILMS
8. Black & White, Pan, Tri-X 120, ASA _
400 (20 rolls/pack) #8120891 (Pro-pack 2.28 2.24 2.45 no bid 2.33 1.89 2.10
#869-4762) $H/RL
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS none none 20 rolls NA none $100.00 Nno minimum
GROUP IV: CHEMICAL SUPPLIES
9. Flexicolor RA SM Process F1
#1112028 59.26 60.81 56.47 no bid 73.87 79.99 no bid
$/EA
10. Flexicolor RA SM Process F2
#845618 $/EA 19.07 20.87 18.24 no bid 29.94 29.50 no bid
11. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Developer
#1756337 $/EA 3.58 4.01 341 no bid 6.25 5.95 no bid
12. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Bleach
#8824690 29.73 32.01 28.38 no bid 39.03 39.95 no bid
$/EA
13. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Fixer
#8462681 7.19 9.76 6.87 no bid 10.54 11.95 no bid
$/EA

14. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Stabilizer
#8698441 $/EA .80 .93 .78 no bid 1.99 1.99 no bid
15. Ektacolor RA developer/replenisher

17.88 19.04 17.10 no bid 34.25 29.50 18.99

RT, to make 10 liter 4/case) #8415580
$/EA




16. Ektacolor RA bleach/fix replenisher,

to make 10 liter (4lcase) #8309031 17.88 21.09 17.22 no bid 34.32 29.50 20.95
$/EA
17. Ektacolor RA stabilizer/replenisher, _
to make 10 liter (16/0ase) #8575623 9.56 9.53 9.13 no bid 18.69 9.95 10.25
$/EA
18. Ektacolor RA developer starter _
solution to make 95 liters (1/case) 8.39 10.59 8.40 no bid 22.63 9.95 9.95
#1026681 $/EA
DESCRIPTION Alkit Pro Camera B & H Photo Video Camera Hutt Dixie Sales Company Focus Camera Inc HPI International J & L Photo Supply
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS case quantity none case NA none none $200.00
GROUP V: PAPER SUPPLY
19.Ektacolor Royal VIII, F, 4" x 246.1", Royal VII
(4/case) #1120609 $/RL 28.97 32.46 28.97 no bid 34.00 159.80 no bid
20.Ektacolor Royal VI, F, 8" x 246.1' Royal VII
(2/case) #8594566 $/RL 57.49 63.38 57.50 no bid 53.75 139.90 52.25
21.Ektacolor Royal VIII, F, 11" x 246.1' Royal VII
(2/case) #1953402 $/RL 78.72 86.91 78.95 no bid 63.50 199.00 73.50
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS case quantity case case NA 19 - 4 rolls/cs none multiples of 2
20 - 2 rolls/cs
21 - 2 rolls/cs
GROUP VI: MISCELLANEOUS KODAK
PRODUCTS
22. Control Strip, Process C41, 35MM X
100'Roll #1803709 (2 BX) $/BX 106.44 no bid no bid 107.65 112.50 112.95
23. Control Strip, RA, 50/Box #8282170
(1 BX) $/BX 49.17 no bid no bid 54.30 58.50 54.95
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS none none NA NA none none no minimum
GROUP VII: POLAROID FILM
PRODUCTS
24. Spectra, platinum film, Twin Pack, _
10 exposures /pack’ (30/Case) H624242 18.24 18.98 no bid 18.00 18.50 17.80 19.25
$/TWPK
25. Spectra, high definition, grid film,
(30/cs) #617792 $ITWPK 24.37 24.95 20.95 ai iﬁ 24.99 23.95 27.25




26. Type 600 platinum, Twin Pack, 10
$/TWPK
27. Type 667, Twin Pack, 10
$/TWPK
28. Type 669, Twin Pack, 10

T

w

P

K
29.Type 665, Pos/Neg, 8 #631181/10 exp pk 10 exposure
$/PK
30.T-1900 one-step color print film, (36

no bid 209.95 no bid no bid 174.99 172.00 no bid

ea 8 x 10 print sheets/box) #615474
$/BX

Twincheck,Superflex, Code #1122-12

DESCRIPTION Alkit Pro Camera B & H Photo Video Camera Hutt Dixie Sales Company Focus Camera Inc HPI International J & L Photo Supply

31.T-1910 one-step black & white print
film, (36 ea 8 x 10 print sheets/box) no bid 209.95 no bid no bid 174.99 172.00 no bid
#616522 $/BX
32 X-ray, TPX, 8'x10", 15
exposures/bOX, (3bx/Case) #604783 $/ 354.39 404.85 no bid 355.08 369.00 discontinued no bid

C

S
33. Coaterless 803, 8'x10", black &
white f||m’ 15 exposureslbOX, (3bx/Case) 368.01 374.85 no bid 372.00 378.00 369.00 no bid
#609656 $/CS
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS none none none $50.00 none none no minimum
GROUP VIII: MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLY
34. Negative Preservers, Unstamped, SAVAGE
Kraft, 4" x 5", Savage #S-851 or APEC 51.50
#264, 500/box (50 BX) $/BX 34.34 55.95 no bid no bid 48.50 no bid
35. Numerical Coding Tape, Shastar

7.47 no bid 9.95 no bid no bid no bid no bid

$/RL




36. Dust-Away (or equal) Refill, 12

Dust-Away 802

Beseler 8594

to be approved

Ounce Brand/Stock # Case Pack 8 OZ - 12/case 12/case 3.99

jcase S/EA 3.40 6.49 no bid 6.50 5.29 no bid
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS none none none NA none none NA
Mounting Board, Black on One Side (this DURACRAFT
will be awarded as a group):
37a. 8"x 10", 100/case $/CS 49.50 99.00 no bid 148.00 99.50/cs of 200 no bid
37b. 11"x 14", 100/case $/CS 100.00 149.00 no bid 214.50 89.50 no bid
37c. 16" x 20", 50/case $/CS 84.75 No bid no bid 148.50 129.00/cs of 100 no bid
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS none none case NA none none NA
GROUP IX: BATTERIES
38. Batteries, Mercury Battery, 1.35 V, Varta V625U Sanyo Panasonic or Wein Cell Duracell PX625A
flat, Eveready EPX625, Duracell 12 each _
PX625AB (12 EA) Brand/Stock # $/EA o8 3.95 2.95 no bid 2.59 2.99 1.95
39. Batteries, 1.55 V, 145 mAh, Kodak EK1236637 Kodak Varta or Panasonic Duracell MS76
Duracell MS76B or Varta V76PX 1.19 1.99 12 each

1.95 no bid 1.40 1.75 1.95

Brand/Stock # $/EA




DESCRIPTION

Alkit Pro Camera

B & H Photo Video

Camera Hutt

Dixie Sales Company

Focus Camera Inc

HPI International

J & L Photo Supply

40. Batteries, Lithium, 6 V, 1500 mAh, Kodak EK8039398 Kodak as specified Sanyo 2CR5
flat, 2CR5, Sanyo, Kodak, Varta or _
Eveready ELZCRS, Duracell DL245 7.57 3.29 8.99 no bid 3.20 3.45 3.99
Brand/Stock # $/EA
41. Batteries, AA, hi energy lithium, 1.5 AAL2 _ _ as specified _ Energizer AA Lithium
V, Eveready Energizer L91 Brand/Stock # 4.37 2.25 no bid no bid 2.35 no bid 4.50
$/EA

42. Batteries, long life lithium, 6 V, Kodak EK1234137 Kodak as specified 4LR44 Duracell PX28L
Duracell PX28L, Eveready L544, or Varta _ _
V28PXL Brand/Stock # $/EA 5.17 6.25 7.95 no bid 4.50 no bid 4.55
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS none none none NA none none $100.00
43. Battery Pack, #2, Quantum QB2 QB2 as specified
Brand/Stock # $/EA 162.75 169.95 no bid no bid 170.00 no bid no bid
44Module "S" For Sunpack Model 544 QUMS MS as specified
(MS) 37.80 49.95 no bid no bid 39.00 no bid no bid
Brand/Stock # $/EA
45. Power Module, SB-24 Quantum CK QUCK Ck as specified
Turbo 25.20 36.50 no bid no bid 28.75 no bid no bid
Brand/Stock # $/EA
46. Battery Pack for Handicam, NP-77H Bescor BP-774 Vidpro NP98 long life
long life (2400 mAh), Varta V68, Kaneco _ _ _ _ _
#6024 or Ultra Power UP577H 32.55 no bid no bid no bid 34.95 no bid no bid
Brand/Stock # $/EA
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS _ none none NA NA none none NA
GROUP X: CAMERA EQUIPMENT - ALL
CAMERAS MUST COME WITH 1 YEAR
WARRANTY ON PARTS AND LABOR
47. Camera, Polaroid OneStep, auto- Polaroid 626022 Polaroid 614753 Polaroid One Step Polaroid 619487 As specified Polaroid One Step
focus with plastic lens #619487 (Special One Step _
Edition not required) Brand/Model , Min. 53.04 29.95 39.95 $46.95 47.99 42.50 no bid
Ord. Requirement , $/EA
48. Camera, Polaroid Spectra 2 Polaroid 618356 Polaroid 618356 Polaroid Polaroid 618356 As specified Spectra AF 610000
#615203, Brand/Model, Min. Ord. Spectra 2

77.48 72.95 99.95 79.50 77.95 79.50 no bid

Reqguirement, $/EA




49. Camera, 35 mm, auto-focus lens;
Canon Sureshot, Nikon One Touch
1805, Ricoh AF77, Minolta AF 101R,
Olympus Trip AF20, Pentax PC55AF, or
equivalent, most current model,
Brand/Model, Ord. Requirement, $/
E
A

Pentax PC550

38.45

Pentax PC550
KB60212

36.96

Minolta AF Big Finder

59.00

no bid

$50.00 minimum order

Polaroid 35mm “one
film” AF motorized

$31.85

none

Sure Shot Owl

Canon Sure Sshot

Oowl
62.50 53.95
none no minimum

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

BID TABULATION

Bid Number: 06-00

Description: Photographic Supplies

Opened: February 9, 2000 @ 3:00 P.M.

Awarded: May 17, 2000 thru December 31, 2000
Part 2 of 3

Basis for Award. Best Price

Laube Photo

1351 S Cleve-Mass
Rd, Suite 4

Akron, OH 44321

P 800-395-2748
F 330-665-3963

FEIN 34-1824461

Long’s Electronics
2630 5" Ave S
Irondale, AL 35210
P 800-633-4984

F 877-633-4984

FEIN 63-0412141

PURCHASING SECTION
Carolyn Hendrickson
(813) 247-8054

Perfecta Camera

174 S Maple St
Manchester, NH 03103
P 603-645-1234

F 603-668-6545

FEIN 02-0330053

Pitman Photo Supply
8650 SW 132" St
Miami, FL 33156

P 800-252-3008

F 800-835-3995

FEIN 59-1295395

Price Point Supply
PO Box 438
Lakewood, NJ 80701
P 732-367-1009

F 732-367-3176

FEIN 95-4192888

Unique Photo
11 Vreeland Road

Florham Park, NJ
07932-0979

P 800-631-0300
F 973-377-8800

FEIN 22-2921804

Valley Litho Supply
1047 Haugen Ave
Rice Lake, WI 54868
P 800-826-6781

F 800-962-5924

FEIN 41-1249245

&

ltems Boxed Indicate Award Harold Laube Dennis Wood Scott Hutchins Lowell Elsea Morris Gluck Gia Konopacki X 216 Jim Babineau
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13 14
KODAK PRODUCTS PRICES GOOD NO AWARDS PRICES GOOD THRU PRICES GOOD THRU NO AWARDS PRICES GOOD THRU CAN NOT HONOR
THRU 12/31/00 12/31/00 12/31/00 12/31/00 PRICES BID
GROUP I: NON-CARDED ROLL FILM
FOR COLOR PRINTS
1. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/12,
20 rl/pk #1393594 $/RL 1.89 no bid 2.50 2.53 2.06 1.95 1.88
2. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/24,
20 rl/pk #1863505 $/RL 2.70 no bid 3.34 3.38 2.83 1.99 2.65
3. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/36, 1141613 1141613 1141613
20 rl/pk #114613 $/RL 3.05 no bid 4.80 4.43 3.43 3.04
4. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC .
135/12, 20 rl/pk #1963206 $/RL 2.05 no bid 3.18 3.21 244 2.20 1.95
5. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC .
135/24, 20 rl/pk #1973551 $/RL 2.88 no bid 4.24 4.28 2.75 2.94




6. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC 1584531 1584531
135/36, 20 rl/pk #1584531 $/RL 3.92 no bid 5.47 5.52 3.98
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS all or none pricing NA $50.00 0 $100.00

EKF112
0

$100.00

8053902
3.75

20 rolls




DESCRIPTION

Laube Photo

Long’s Electronics

Perfecta Camera

Pitman Photo Supply

Price Point Supply

Unique Photo

Valley Litho Supply

GROUP II: NON-CARDED ROLL FILM
FOR COLOR SLIDES

7. Ecktachrome Color Elite 100 EB

135/24 (20 rolls/pack) #1113612 3.08 no bid 4.77 4.57 4.45 4.16 2.95
$/RL
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 20 rolls NA $50.00 0 $100.00 $100.00 20 rolls
GROURP IlI: NON-CARDED ROLL
PROFESSIONAL STILL FILMS
8. Black & White, Pan, Tri-X 120, ASA _ 13.40/5 roll pack
400 (20 rolls/pack) #8120891 (Pro-pack 192 no bid 2.30 2.44 2.35 2.65 2.05
#869-4762) $/RL
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 40 rolls NA $25.00 Pro-Pack $100.00 $100.00 20 rolls
GROUP IV: CHEMICAL SUPPLIES
9. Flexicolor RA SM Process F1
#1112028 no bid no bid no bid 69.35 no bid 73.10 no bid
$/EA
10. Flexicolor RA SM Process F2
#845618 $/EA no bid no bid no bid 22.32 no bid 27.70 no bid
11. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Developer
#1756337 $/EA no bid no bid no bid 4.18 no bid 5.90 no bid
12. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Bleach
#8824690 no bid no bid no bid 34.79 no bid 42.35 no bid
$/EA
13. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Fixer
#8462681 no bid no bid no bid 8.41 no bid 12.50 no bid
$/EA

14. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Stabilizer
#8698441 $/EA no bid no bid no bid .93 no bid .85 no bid
15. Ektacolor RA developer/replenisher Minimum order 4

no bid no bid no bid 22.50 no bid 21.95 no bid

RT, to make 10 liter 4/case) #8415580
$/EA




16. Ektacolor RA bleach/fix replenisher,

Minimum order 4

to make 10 liter (4/case) #8309031 no bid no bid no bid 21.26 no bid 22.00 no bid
$/EA
17. Ektacolor RA stabilizer/replenisher,
to make 10 liter (16/case) #8575623 no bid no bid no bid 11.04 no bid 10.00 no bid
$/EA
18. Ektacolor RA developer starter
no bid no bid no bid 9.64 no bid 13.40 no bid

solution to make 95 liters (1/case)
#1026681 $/EA

DESCRIPTION

Laube Photo

Long’s Electronics

Perfecta Camera

Pitman Photo Supply

Price Point Supply

Unique Photo

Valley Litho Supply

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS NA NA NA as indicated above NA $100.00 NA

GROUP V: PAPER SUPPLY

19.Ektacolor Royal VIII, F, 4" x 246.1", Royal, Fuiji, Crystal

(4/case) #1120609 $/RL .09/foot no bid no bid no bid 30.50
54.00 27.59 25.32

20.Ektacolor Royal VI, F, 8" x 246.1' Royal, Fuiji, Crystal

(2/case) #8594566 $/RL .19/foot no bid no bid no bid 58.50
53.00 54.75 50.63

21.Ektacolor Royal VIII, F, 11" x 246.1' Royal, Fuiji, Crystal

(2/case) #1953402 $/RL .24/foot no bid no bid no bid 69.62 76.95
67.83 74.97

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS all or none pricing NA NA 0 NA $100.00 $250.00

case lots

GROUP VI: MISCELLANEOUS KODAK

PRODUCTS

22. Control Strip, Process C41, 35MM X

100'Roll #1803709 (2 BX) $/BX no bid no bid no bid 112.29 no bid 126.95 no bid

23. Control Strip, RA, 50/Box #8282170

(1 BX) $/BX no bid no bid no bid 50.94 no bid 50.95 no bid

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS NA NA NA 0 NA $100.00 NA

GROUP VII: POLAROID FILM

PRODUCTS

24. Spectra, platinum film, Twin Pack, _ _

10 exposures /pack’ (30/Case) H624242 18.00 no bid 20.35 18.57 19.20 18.00 no bid

$/TWPK

25. Spectra, high definition, grid film,

24.18 no bid 20.81 25.70 23.80 no bid

(30/cs) #617792 $/ITWPK




26. Type 600 platinum, Twin Pack, 10

$/TWPK
27. Type 667, Twin Pack, 10
$/TWPK
28. Type 669, Twin Pack, 10 _ _
exposures/pack, (25/case) #623960  $/ 19.95 no bid 25.78 20.95 21.50 no bid

T

\\%

P

K
29.Type 665, Pos/Neg, 8 _ _
exposures/pack’ (SOlcase) #603098 7.90 no bid 9.00 9.95 11.75 no bid
$/PK
30.T-1900 one-step color print film, (36

167.00 no bid 169.00 174.96 no bid no bid

ea 8 x 10 print sheets/box) #615474
$/BX

DESCRIPTION Laube Photo Long’s Electronics Perfecta Camera Pitman Photo Supply Price Point Supply Unique Photo Valley Litho Supply
31.T-1910 one-step black & white print
film, (36 ea 8 x 10 print sheets/box) 167.00 no bid 169.00 174.96 no bid 171.50 no bid
#616522 $/BX
32 X-ray, TPX, 8'x10", 15
C
S
33. Coaterless 803, 8'x10", black &
white f||m' 15 exposureslbOX, (3bx/Case) 346.50 no bid 127.00 378.51 no bid 379.39 no bid
#609656 $/CS
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS all or none pricing NA $50.00 0 none $100.00 NA
no minimum
GROUP VIII: MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLY
34. Negative Preservers, Unstamped,
Kraft, 4" x 5", Savage #S-851 or APEC 29.15 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
#264, 500/box (50 BX) $/BX 35.10
35. Numerical Coding Tape, Shastar
Twincheck,Superflex, Code #1122-12 8.49 no bid no bid no bid no bid 24.95 no bid
$/RL




36. Dust-Away (or equal) Refill, 12

Centry Dust Away

Ounce Brand/Stock # Case Pack 4.69 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

__Icase $/EA

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS all or none pricing NA NA NA NA $100.00 NA
no minimum

Mounting Board, Black on One Side (this

will be awarded as a group):

37a. 8"x 10", 100/case $/CS no bid no bid no bid 76.00 no bid 91.85 no bid

37b. 11" x 14", 100/case $/CS no bid no bid no bid 134.00 no bid 83.60 no bid

37c. 16" x 20", 50/case $/CS no bid no bid no bid 76.00 no bid 129.65 no bid

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS NA NA NA 0 NA $100.00 NA

GROUP IX: BATTERIES

38. Batteries, Mercury Battery, 1.35 V, Dantona 625A Varta 625 Duracell PX625AB GNB239 Various

flat, Eveready EPX625, Duracell no bid no bid

PX625AB (12 EA) Brand/Stock # $/EA 52 87 1.45 2.84 1.50

39. Batteries, 1.55 V, 145 mAh, Dantona V76PX Varta 76 Duracell MS76B EKB338 Kodak

Duracell MS76B or Varta V76PX .63 1.87 1.45 2.15 no bid 1.44 no bid

Brand/Stock # $/EA




DESCRIPTION

Laube Photo

Long’s Electronics

Perfecta Camera

Pitman Photo Supply

Price Point Supply

Unique Photo

Valley Litho Supply

40. Batteries, Lithium, 6 V, 1500 mAh, Dantona Lith-19 Varta 2CR5 Eveready EL2CR5 GNB235 Various

flat, 2CR5, Sanyo, Kodak, Varta or no bid no bid

Eveready EL2CR5, Duracell DL245 3.50 9.82 4.60 9.80 2.99

Brand/Stock # $/EA

41. Batteries, AA, hi energy lithium, 1.5 Dantona Comp-L91 Eveready AA Lithijm Eveready L91BP-2 EKB751 Kodak

V, Eveready Energizer L91 Brand/Stock # 59 3.74 2.00 4.56/tw pk no bid 59 no bid

$/EA

42. Batteries, long life lithium, 6 V, Dantona Lith-19 Kodak V28PXL Eveready L544 EKB1829139 Kodak

Duracell PX28L, Eveready L544, or Varta no bid no bid

V28PXL Brand/Stock # $/EA 422 6.19 4.60 248 2.96

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS all or none pricing none $25.00 0 NA $100.00 NA

43. Battery Pack, #2, Quantum Quantum BP2 Quantum QB-2 Quantum QMH1107

Brand/Stock # $/EA no bid 175.00 170.50 no bid 167.20 no bid

44Module "S" For Sunpack Model 544 Quantum MS Module Quantum QM-S Quantum QMH1164

(MS) no bid 44.00 39.60 no bid 39.73 no bid

Brand/Stock # $/EA

45. Power Module, SB-24 Quantum CK Quantum CK Modeul Quantum QM-Ck Quantum QMH1130

Turbo no bid 34.00 28.60 no bid 29.60 no bid

Brand/Stock # $/EA

46. Battery Pack for Handicam, NP-77H AGAIN & AGAIN Dantona Cam577H Varta 77H Varta V68

long life (2400 mAh), Varta V68, Kaneco LITHIUM NP77H no bid no bid no bid

#6024 or Ultra Power UP577H 27.89 3588 38.00 36.59

Brand/Stock # $/EA

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS _ all or none pricing none $50.00 0 NA $100.00 NA

GROUP X: CAMERA EQUIPMENT - ALL FREIGHT PREPAID

CAMERAS MUST COME WITH 1 YEAR ON ORDERS OVER

WARRANTY ON PARTS AND LABOR $200.00

47. Camera, Polaroid OneStep, auto- One Step FF Polaroid One Step AF Polaroid One Step AF Polaroid PLC323

focus with plastic lens #619487 (Special 6 for free freight no bid $60.00 minimum no bid $100.00 minimum no bid

Edition not required) Brand/Model , Min. 26.00 29.97 46.20 217.00

Ord. Requirement , $/EA

48. Camera, Polaroid Spectra 2 Polaroid Spectra 2 Polaroid Spectra 2 Polaroid PLC618356

#615203, Brand/Model, Min. Ord. 6 for free freight no bid $60.00 minimum no bid $100.00 minimum no bid
79.00 89.00 77.44 79.00

Requirement, $/EA




49. Camera, 35 mm, auto-focus lens;
Canon Sureshot, Nikon One Touch
1805, Ricoh AF77, Minolta AF 101R,
Olympus Trip AF20, Pentax PC55AF, or
equivalent, most current model,
Brand/Model, Ord. Requirement, $/
E
A

Yashaca EZ View
includes film, case &
2 batteries
6+ (even amounts of
6)
$37.00

no bid

Olympus Trip AF 31
$96.00 minimum

48.00

Canon Sure Shot Owl

50.34

no bid

Samsung AF33S

$100.00 minimum

39.97

no bid

Minimum Order 1 on
each

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Bid Number: 06-00

Description: Photographic Supplies

Opened: February 9, 2000 @ 3:00 P.M.
Awarded: May 17,2000 thru December 31, 2000
Part 3 of 3

Basis for Award. Best Price

Items Boxed Indicate Award

W. B. Hunt Co Inc
100 Main Street
Melrose, MA 02178

P 781-662-6764
F 781-662-6524

FEIN 04-2140407

Martin Marshall

BID TABULATION

PURCHASING SECTION
Carolyn Hendrickson

(813) 247-8054

DESCRIPTION 15
KODAK PRODUCTS CAN NOT HONOR
PRICES BID
GROUP |I: NON-CARDED ROLL FILM
FOR COLOR PRINTS
1. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/12,
20 rl/pk #1393594 $/RL 2.15
2. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/24,
20 rl/pk #1863505 $/RL 2.87
3. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/36, 1141613
20 rl/pk #114613 $/RL 3.77
4. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135/12, 20 rl/pk #1963206 $/RL 2.73
5. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135/24, 20 rl/pk #1973551 $/RL 3.64




6. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135/36, 20 rl/pk #1584531 $/RL

1584531
4.80

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

DESCRIPTION

W. B. Hunt Co Inc

GROUP II: NON-CARDED ROLL FILM
FOR COLOR SLIDES

7. Ecktachrome Color Elite 100 EB
135/24 (20 rolls/pack) #1113612
$/RL

3.88

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

DESCRIPTION

W. B. Hunt Co Inc

GROUP I1I: NON-CARDED ROLL
PROFESSIONAL STILL FILMS

8. Black & White, Pan, Tri-X 120, ASA
400 (20 rolls/pack) #8120891 (Pro-pack
#869-4762) $H/RL

2.28

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

GROUP IV: CHEMICAL SUPPLIES

9. Flexicolor RA SM Process F1

#1112028 73.95
$/EA
10. Flexicolor RA SM Process F2
#845618 $/EA 25.45
11. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Developer
#1756337 $/EA 5.17
12. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Bleach
#8824690 39.42
$/EA
13. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Fixer
#8462681 13.74
$/EA
14. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Stabilizer
5.95

#8698441 $/EA




15. Ektacolor RA developer/replenisher

RT, to make 10 liter 4/case) #8415580 23.36
$/EA
16. Ektacolor RA bleach/fix replenisher,
to make 10 liter (4/case) #8309031 20.79
$/EA
17. Ektacolor RA stabilizer/replenisher,
to make 10 liter (16/case) #8575623 11.75
$/EA
18. Ektacolor RA developer starter
13.11

solution to make 95 liters (1/case)
#1026681 $/EA




DESCRIPTION

W. B. Hunt Co Inc

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

GROUP V: PAPER SUPPLY

19.Ektacolor Royal VIII, F, 4" x 246.1",

(4/case) #112069 $/RL 27.59
20.Ektacolor Royal VIII, F, 8" x 246.1'
(2/case) #8594566 $/RL 54.75
21.Ektacolor Royal VIII, F, 11" x 246.1'

68.22

(2/case) #1953402 $/RL

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

GROUP VI: MISCELLANEOUS KODAK
PRODUCTS

22. Control Strip, Process C41, 35MM X
100'Roll #1803709 (2 BX) $/BX

130.95

23. Control Strip, RA, 50/Box #8282170
(1 BX) $/BX

122.69

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

GROUP VII: POLAROID FILM
PRODUCTS

24. Spectra, platinum film, Twin Pack,

10 exposures /pack, (30/case) #624242 18.40
$/TWPK
25. Spectra, high definition, grid film,
(30/cs) #617792 $ITWPK 18.40
26. Type 600 platinum, Twin Pack, 10
exposures /pack, (30/case) #623965 18.40
$/TWPK
27. Type 667, Twin Pack, 10
15.75

exposures/pack, (25/case) #617799
$/TWPK




28. Type 669, Twin Pack, 10

exposures/pack, (25/case) #623960  $/ 19.90
T
wW
P
K
29.Type 665, Pos/Neg, 8
exposures/pack, (50/case) #603098 12.35
$/PK
30.T-1900 one-step color print film, (36
177.00

ea 8 x 10 print sheets/box) #615474
$/BX

DESCRIPTION

W. B. Hunt Co Inc

31.T-1910 one-step black & white print

film, (36 ea 8 x 10 print sheets/box) 177.00
#616522 $/BX
32 X-ray, TPX, 8'x10", 15
exposures/box, (3bx/Case) #604783 $/ 371.25
C
S
33. Coaterless 803, 8"x10", black &
361.00

white film, 15 exposures/box, (3bx/Case)
#609656 $/CS

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

GROUP VIII: MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLY

34. Negative Preservers, Unstamped,

Kraft, 4" x 5", Savage #S-851 or APEC 42.00
#264, 500/box (50 BX) $/BX
35. Numerical Coding Tape, Shastar

8.40

Twincheck,Superflex, Code #1122-12
$/RL

36. Dust-Away (or equal) Refill, 12
Ounce Brand/Stock # Case Pack
__Icase $/EA

Beselor #8593 12/cs
4.95

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight




Mounting Board, Black on One Side (this

will be awarded as a group):

37a. 8"x 10", 100/case $/CS

Savage 15401
200/cs
115.20

37b. 11" x 14", 100/case $/CS

Savage 15402
100.80

37c. 16" x 20", 50/case $/CS

Sagage 15404
100/cs
114.00

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

GROUP IX: BATTERIES

38. Batteries, Mercury Battery, 1.35 V,
flat, Eveready EPX625, Duracell
PX625AB (12 EA) Brand/Stock # $/EA

Duracell PX625

1.90

39. Batteries, 1.55 V, 145 mANh,
Duracell MS76B or Varta V76PX
Brand/Stock # $/EA

Duracell MS76B
1.90




DESCRIPTION

W. B. Hunt Co Inc

40. Batteries, Lithium, 6 V, 1500 mAh, Sanyo 2CR5

flat, 2CR5, Sanyo, Kodak, Varta or

Eveready EL2CRS5, Duracell DL245 4.50

Brand/Stock # $/EA

41. Batteries, AA, hi energy lithium, 1.5 L91
2.49

V, Eveready Energizer L91 Brand/Stock #
$/EA

42. Batteries, long life lithium, 6 V,
Duracell PX28L, Eveready L544, or Varta
V28PXL Brand/Stock # $/EA

Duracell PX28L

4.95

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS

$50.00 PPD freight

43. Battery Pack, #2, Quantum Quantum 2
Brand/Stock # $/EA 168.00
44Module "S" For Sunpack Model 544 Quantum MS
(MS) 39.00
Brand/Stock # $/EA

45. Power Module, SB-24 Quantum CK Quantum CK
Turbo 29.90
Brand/Stock # $/EA

46. Battery Pack for Handicam, NP-77H Saft CH624
long life (2400 mAh), Varta V68, Kaneco (36326%6?1)

#6024 or Ultra Power UP577H
Brand/Stock # $/EA

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS _

$50.00 PPD freight

GROUP X: CAMERA EQUIPMENT - ALL
CAMERAS MUST COME WITH 1 YEAR
WARRANTY ON PARTS AND LABOR

47. Camera, Polaroid OneStep, auto-
focus with plastic lens #619487 (Special
Edition not required) Brand/Model , Min.
Ord. Requirement , $/EA

Polaroid One Step
AF 625547
$50.00 PPD freight
42.00

48. Camera, Polaroid Spectra 2
#615203, Brand/Model, Min. Ord.
Requirement, $/EA

Polaroid Spectra 2
618356T
$50.00 PPD freight
72.80




49. Camera, 35 mm, auto-focus lens;
Canon Sureshot, Nikon One Touch
1805, Ricoh AF77, Minolta AF 101R,
Olympus Trip AF20, Pentax PC55AF, or
equivalent, most current model,
Brand/Model, Ord. Requirement, $/
E
A

Pentax PC55 Kit
$50 PPD freight

39.95




Vendor 1: Return Policy -
Exceptions -

Vendor 2: Return Policy -
Exceptions -

Vendor 3: Return Policy -
Exceptions -

Vendor 4: Return Policy -

Exceptions -
Vendor 5: Return Policy -

Exceptions -

Vendor 6:: Return Policy -

Exceptions -

Vendor 7:: Return Policy -
Exceptions -

Vendor 8:: Return Policy -
Exceptions -

Vendor 9:: Return Policy -

Supports all original manufacturer’s warranties & policies; all returns must be accompanied by a return authorization number, provided upon
request; product must be returned in original packaging; product must be returned in saleable condition; product must be returned in a timely
manner.

None Listed

14 Day return privilege on unopened/unused product.
As per reference number 45231260 - Several items were special order, none returnable: prices valid only to 3/9/2001 - please reference their
reference number on all orders.

None Provided
None Listed

Polaroid, Kodak, Agfa and Fuji films are fully warranted by the respective corporations. As an authorized distributor, we work with our customers
and the respective film companies to provide customer satisfaction. All orders are double-checked for accuracy. Discrepancies in orders must be
reported to us within 5 business days of receipt of order. If we make a mistake in shipping, we will pick up the film via a UPS call tag and reship
the correct film at our expense. If the customer orders the wrong items, excess quantity of items, or provides incorrect shipping information, the
customer must receive a return authorization from Dixie Sales Company, return the film to Dixie Sales Company at their expense, and agree to
pay the original freight charge. Credit for the original invoice will be issued upon return receipt of the merchandise to our warehouse. A new
invoice will be created for the correct film. No returns are accepted after 30 days or without prior authorization from Dixie Sales Company.
None

14 Day return/exchange policy providing merchandise is returned in original mint condition as shipped with all packaging and papers intact.
All items “offered” are FOB destination as requested. The only exclusions are for chemicals which require UPS special hazardous materials
handling fees of $12.00 per package.

1) The agency has the right to return defective product within 30 days from the date of delivery. After this 30 day period has expired, only
warranty returns will be accepted. Returns must have a Return Merchandise Authorization number. Return Merchandise Authorization number
will be assigned for the item by the HPI customer service department. 2) Returns are inspected by HPI and accepted if: a) the product was not
damaged through any misuse on the part of the customer; b) the product is returned to HPI in its original or equipment shipping container, and;
c) all accessories including booklets, instruction manual, warranty information are returned with the package. Returns which fail to meet any of
these requirements will not be accepted by HPI. 3) the customer shall ship the supplies/equipment to HPI within 14 days after receipt of the RMA
number. 4) Returns due to an error on the part of HPI, HPI will bear the cost or returning product via UPS ground. An RMA number is assigned,
HPI will arrange for rapid pickup of shipment. 5) For returns due to an error on the part of the customer, the customer will bear the cost of
returning the product and the restocking charge.

None Listed

If the return is due to a mistake on our part, we will have UPS pick it up. We will cover all fees involved for the call tag and pick up.
None Listed

None Listed
Most groups bid were all or none pricing

Group V, Fuji Crystal same as Kodak Royal in color & developing

1) Complete “form” (copy provided with bid) and enclose with item being returned. Item must be returned within 5 days of receipt for full refund
credit or exchange. 2) Iltem must be in manufacturer’s original carton, along with all papers, accessories and packing that was sent to you. 3)



Exceptions -

Vendor 10:: Return Policy -

when shipping merchandise back, over box in a sturdy box and secure with strong tape. For your protection, insure it for its full value. 4) Address
your package using “labels provided”. 5) Return the package prepaid - cannot accept COD. 6) If equipment is not received in its original, like new
condition, other charges may be incurred. 7) Instruction apply only to retail customers. All others should call our 800 number. 8) Call for further
assistance.

None Listed

On a case-by-case basis, UPS pick up will be issued by our office.

Exceptions - None Noted

Vendor 11:: Return Policy -

All products are new and covered by manufacturers warranty. Any defective products will be replaced by Pitman Photo Supply at no charge.
Call 800-252-3008 for returns. Pitman Photo Supply will supply a UPS Call Tag.

Exceptions - None Listed

Vendor 1 2:: Return Policy -

Anytime within 30 days. After 30 days, needs authorization to return.

Exceptions - None Listed.

Vendor 13:: Return Policy -

Unique Photo Inc. must be notified upon receipt of merchandise that the item(s) need to be returned. A return authorization number must be
issued before the return is sent back. Unique Photo Inc. is not responsible for duplicate shipments and will not pick up those returns. Any error
made by Unique Photo Inc, such as defective or damaged merchandise, will be picked up, inspected and then replaced.

Exceptions - None Listed

Vendor 14:: Return Policy -

Any item shipped wrong or this is not correct in any way will be piked up by Valley Litho & full credit given.

Exceptions - None Listed

Vendor 15:: Return Policy -

EXCHANGE POLICY: Cash refunds in 24 hours only, after one day merchandise credit only. No returns or exchanges of sensitized materials aftel
24 hours for any reason. Sensitized materials will be treated on a case by case basis. No returns for credit or exchange after 10 days. All returns
or exchanges must be in original packaging with all original papers and accompanied by sales slip. No guarantee paper or cards are to be filled
out in any way. No refunds on video cameras or background paper. Merchandise credit or exchange only. WARRANTY: In almost every case,
the warranty on products that you have purchased from W.B. Hunt Co. is between you and the manufacturer. A copy of the complete warranty
is available upon request by mail from the respective manufacturer, and may also be found included in the packaging of some products. Your
item will be repaired at no cost to you if you bring it or send it to the manufacturer’s authorized service agency from date of purchase through
the expiration of the manufacturer’s warranty. If you bring or send your item to W.B. Hunt Co, there will be a $10.00 minimum charge to cover
handling and shipping expenses in sending ti to the manufacturer or his authorized agency. Your warranty card and/or sales slip must accompany
all items returned to us for repair. Used equipment carries a third day warranty unless otherwise specified on the bill of sale. The equipment,
if found faulty, will either be repaired or the money refunded at the discretion of W.b. Hunt Co within the thirty day period. W.B. Hunt Co. will
not be responsible for any consequential or incidental damages resulting from the failure of an item.

Exceptions - None Listed



