Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office Purchasing Office

P.O. Box 3371 Carolyn L. Hendrickson
Tampa, FL. 33601 (813) 247-8054
BID TABULATION
Bid Number: 10-99 Adorama Inc.** Alkit Pro Batteries Plus Camera Dixie Sales Co Golden Triangle | HPI Int’l Laube Photo**
Camera** Boutique**

Bid Title: Photographic Supplies

42W. 18" St. 1703 W. 11251 Phillips 3421 W 186 21* Street | 1351 S.. Cleve-
Opened: January 13, 1999 @1500 hours New York, NY 222 Park Ave S | Fletcher 342 Kearney St Pkwy DrE Kennedy Blvd Brooklyn, NY | MassRd,, Ste 4

10011 New York, NY | Tpa, FL 33612 San Francisco, Jacksonville, FL Tpa, FL. 33609 11232
Awarded: February 23, 1999 10002 CA 94108 32256-1571
Award Period: 2/25/99 thru 2/24/2000

Greg Karas Trent Long Gary Carleton Ray Belardo, Jr Sheree Spriggs Sam Sellers Jr Amy Berger Harold Laube
Page 1 of 7-Part]

888-582-2500 212-674-1515 960-5667 415-982-2843 904-292-1852x210 | 876-5277 718-768-8800 | 800-395-2748
Items circled indicates an award. 212-727-9613 212-533-8044 960-9712 415-982-2609 877-626-7337 874-2103 718-768-0743 | 330-665-3963
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
KODAK PRODUCTS
GROUP I: NON-CARDED ROLL FILM
FOR COLOR PRINTS
1a. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/12,
20 ri/pk #1393594 2.50 2.04 NO BID 227 NO BID 2.59
1b. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/12,
50 rl/pk #8959686* 2.32 2.35 NO BID 118.14 NO BID 249
2a. Kodacolar Gold ASA 100 GA 135/24,
20 ri/pk #1863505 3.19 2.75 NO BID 3.08 NO BID 3.23
2b. Kodacolar Gold ASA 100 GA 135/24,
50 ri/pk #1209857* 3.11 3.14 NO BID 160.65 NO BID 3.07
3a. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135-36,
20ri/pk # 3.99 3.51 NO BID 4.02 NO BID 3.79
3b. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/36,
50 rl/pk #1509066* 4.10 4.12 NO BID 209.49 NO BID 3.69
4a. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135/12, 20 rl/pk #1963206 3.09 2.37 NO BID 2.90 NO BID 323

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll. NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs. NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69. NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44
NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2. NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4. NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6. NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.

NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed. *KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER



Bid No. 10-99 - Page 2 of 7 - Part [ Adorama Inc. Alkit Pro Batteries Plus Camera Boutique | Dixie Sales Golden Triangle | HPI Int’l. Laube Photo

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

4b. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC

135/12,50 rl/pk #8669590* 2.99 NO BID 151.20 NO BID 3.13 2.87

5a. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC

135/24, 20/rl/pk #1973551 3.85 3.03 NOBID 3.94 NO BID 3.68 3.82

5b. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC

135/24, 50/1l/pk #8127656* 3.96 3.98 NO BID 204.75 NO BID 3.18 3.82

6a. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC

135/36, 20 rl/pk, # 4.99 4.29 NO BID 4.97 NO BID 4.50 5.52

6b. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC

135/36, 50 rl/pk, #1829589* 4.81 5.13 NO BID 259.89 NO BID 4.40 NO BID 5.52

Law Enforcement Packs of 50 rolls*
50 Rolls for

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 150.00 Pack or Brick $50.00 per order NONE LISTED Free Freight NONE LISTED

GROUP HI: NON-CARDED ROLL FIL.M

FOR COLOR SLIDES

7. Ektachrome Color Elite 100 EB

135/24

(20 rolls/pack) #1113612 4.20 4.18 NO BID 4.14 NO BID 4.86 4.57
50 Rolls for

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 150.00 Pack or Brick $50.00 per order 20 roll pk Free Freight NONE LISTED

GROUP III: NON-CARDED ROLL

PROFESSIONAL STILL FILMS

8. Black & White, Pan, Tri-X 120, ASA

400 (20 rl/pk) #8120891 (869-4762ProPk) 2.49 2.28 NO BID 2.40 NO BID 2.49 2.30
50 Rolls for

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 150.00 Pack or Brick $50.00 per order 5 pro pack Free Freight NONE LISTED

GROUP IV: CHEMICAL SUPPLIES

9.Flexicolor RA SM Process F1 #1112028 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 84.50 NO BID

10. Flexicolor RA SM Process F2 #

8456188 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.50 NO BID

11. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Developer

#1756337 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.25 NO BID

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.
NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.

**KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER




Bid No. 10-99- Page 3 of 7 - Part I Adorama Inc. Alkit Pro Batteries Plus Camera Boutique | Dixie Sales Co. Golden Triangle { HPI Int’l. Laube Photo

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 3 4 5 6 7 8

12. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Bleach

#8824690 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.50 NO BID

13. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Fixer

#8462681 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.95 NO BID

14. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Stabilizer

#8698441 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

15. Ektacolor RA developer/replenisher

RT, to make 10 liter (4/case) #8415580 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.64 24.50 NO BID

16. Ektacolor RA bleach/fix replenisher,

to make 10 liter (4/case) #8309031 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.93 24.50 NO BID

17. Ektacolor RA stabilizer/replenisher, to

make 10 liter (16/case) #8575623 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.98 11.95 NO BID

18. Ektacolor RA developer starter HPI70512430

solution to make 95 liters (1/case)

#1026681 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.95 12.50 NO BID
NONE

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS Case Quantities 1- Case LISTED

GROUP V: PAPER SUPPLY

19. Ektacolor Royal V,F 4" x 245',

(4/case) #1449560 NO BID 28.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.09 42.50 27.59

20. Ektacolor Royal V,F, 8" x 245’

(2/case) #1171834 NO BID 57.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID 79.58 80.50 54.75

21. Ektacolor Royal V,F, 11" x 245"

(2/case) #8853020 NO BID 78.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID 108.98 110.50 75.00
NONE

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS Case Quantities 1-Case LISTED NONE LISTED

GROUP VI: MISCELLANEOUS

KODAK PRODUCTS

22. Control Strip, Process C41, 35MM X

100' Roll #1803709 102.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID 106.44 124.50 NO BID

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.
NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.

NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1! quarter

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.

**KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER




Bid No. 10-99 - Page 4 of 7 - Part [ Adorama Inc. Alkit Pro Batteries Plus Camera Boutique | Dixie Sales Co. Golden Triangle | HPI Int’l. Laube Photo

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 3 4 5 6 7 8

23. Control Strip, RA, 50/Box #8282170 46.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID 48.29 57.50 NO BID

NONE

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 100.00 NONE LISTED 1 Box LISTED

GROUP VII: POLAROID FILM

PRODUCTS

24. Spectra, platinum film, Twin Pack, 10

exposures/pack, (30/case) #624242 18.98 18.77 NO BID 19.00

25. Spectra, high definition, grid film,

(30/cs) #617792 23.88 23.77 NO BID 23.80

26. Type 600 platinum, Twin Pack, 10

exposures/pack, (30/case) #623965 18.98 18.77 NO BID 19.00

27. Type 667, Twin Pack, 10

exposures/pack, (25/case) #617799 14.98 14.18 NO BID 15.80

28. Type 669, Twin Pack,10

exposures/pack, (25/case) #623960 20.99 NO BID 24.63 20.36 26.95 20.05 21.00

29. Type 665, Pos/Neg, 8 exposures/pack,

(50/case) #603098 8.30 NO BID 8.54 7.90 10.14 8.24 9.09

30. T-1900 one-step color print film,

(36 ea 8§ x 10 printsheets/box - 2 bx)

#615474 NO BID NO BID DISC. 172.00 176.58 175.00 171.00

31. T-1910 one-step black & white print

film, (36 ea 8 x 10 print sheets/box - 2 bx)

#616522 NO BID NO BID DISC. 172.00 176.58 199.00 171.00

32. X-ray, TPX, 8" x 10", 15

exposures/box, (3bx/Case), #604783 347.58 347.28 NO BID 340.89 336.00 348.00

33. Coaterless 803, 8"x10", black & white

film, 15 exposures/box,(3bx/cs)#609656 361.58 360.63 NO BID 354.00 372.00 360.00
$50.00 for Free

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 1 case NONE LISTED $50.00 per order $100.00 1 Case Freight NONE LISTED

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.

NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.

**KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER




Bid No. 10-99 - Page 5 of 7 - Part 1 Adorama Inc. Alkit Pro Batteries Plus Camera Boutique | Dixie Sales Co. Golden Triangle | HPI Int’l. Laube Photo

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

GROUP VIII: MISCELLANEQUS

SUPPLY

34. Negative Preservers, Unstamped, HP199120064

Kraft, 4" x 5", Savage #S-851 or APEC

#264, 500/box 37.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.03 39.50

35. Numerical Coding Tape, Shastar

Twincheck, Superflex, Code #1122-12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.49 NO BID 8.95

36. Dust-Away (or equal) Refill, 12 525 5.34 5.99 5.29

Ounce D5100

Brand/Stock # Beseler #8594 Falcon 8 oz NONE Dust Away

Case Pack /case 12/case 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID LISTED 12/case

NONE

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 100.00 NONE LISTED 1 case LISTED NONE LISTED

Mounting Board, Black on One Side (this

will be awarded as a group):

37a. 8" x 10", 100//case 115.00 (200/cs) 46.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 122.30 97.29 67.60
HP19912078

37b. 11" x 14", 100/case 100.00 75.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID 103.49 164.50 110.00
HPI9912068

37c. 16" x 20", S0/case 115.00 (100/cs) 64.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID 122.30 192.70 67.60
HPI9912076

NONE 2 Cases

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 1 case NONE LISTED 1 Case LISTED

GROUP IX: BATTERIES

38. Batteries, Mercury Battery, 1.35 V, 1.05 0.68 1.20 1.75 0.95 1.99

flat, Eveready EPX625, Duracell

PX625AB Varta 9X625

Brand/Stock # Varta VA6250 Varta V625U Varta 625 NO BID Varta NO BID Duracell

PX625AB

39. Batteries, 1.55 V, 145 mAh, Duracell 1.25 1.15 0.97 1.75 0.95 1.75 1.89

MS76B or Varta V76PX Panasonic NONE

Brand/Stock# Varta PX76 EPX76 Ray 357 Varta V76PX NO BID Varta LISTED Duracell MS76B

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.
NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.

NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44
NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.

*KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER



Bid No. 10-99 - Page 6 of 7 - Part | Adorama Inc. Alkit Pro Batteries Plus Camera Boutique | Dixie Sales Co. Golden Triangle | HPI Int’l. Laube Photo
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
40. Batteries, Lithium, 6 V, 1500 mAh, 3.58 3.74 7.98 429 6.04 3.95
flat, 2CRS, Sanyo, Kodak, Varta or
Eveready EL2CRS, Duracell DL245 NONE
Brand/Stock Sanyo 2CR5 Sanyo 2CR5 Panasonic 2CR5 ] Sanyo 2CRS NO BID Varta LISTED
41. Batteries, AA, hi energy lithium, 4.75/pk of 2 2.19 2.79 4.89 1.35 NOTE 2
1.5V, Eveready Energizer L91 Energizer 1.5V 235
Brand/Stock Eveready L91 Eveready AAL2 | Energizer L.91 Lithium NO BID Varta NO BID Eveready AA2
42. Batteries, long life lithium, 6V, 4.90 472 5.49 5.81 4.50
Duracell PX28L, Eveready 1544, or Varta
V28PXL
Brand/Stock Eveready L544 Panasonic L544 | Dur PX28LB NOBID Varta NO BID Duracell PX28L
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS NONE LISTED AA Lithium BP | NONE LISTED | NONE LISTED NONE LISTED NONE LISTED

of 2
43. Battery Pack, #2, Quantum 159.99 168.00
Brand/Stock # Quantum Batt. 2

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Quantum #2

44. Module “S” For Sunpack Model 544 { 37.50 39.00
MS) Quantum Module
Brand/Stock # S NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE LISTED
45. Power Module, SB-24 Quantum CK 27.99 29.00
Turbo Quantum Module
Brand/Stock # CIC { NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE LISTED
46. Battery Pack for Handicam, NP-77H 30.00 32.24 39.95 34.71 39.90
long life (2400 mAh), Varta V68, Kaneco
#6024 or Ultra Power UP577H Ultra Power Bescor BP77H Batteries Plus Sunpack 6 volt
Brand/Stock# UP577H BP77TH NO BID NO BID Varta NO BID (4,000 mAh)
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS NONE LISTED NONE LISTED | NONE LISTED NONE LISTED NONE LISTED
GROUP X: CAMERA EQUIPMENT
47. Camera, Polaroid OneStep, auto-focus | 44.99 42.50 43.55 44.50 44.00
with plastic lens #619487 Polaroid One Polaroid/625547
Brand/Model Step A/S NONE Auto Focus
Min. Ord. Requirement 5 NONE LISTED | NOBID $50.00 per order | NO BID NO BID LISTED 6

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.

NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Muit. Of 4.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44
NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.
**KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER



Bid No. 10-99 - Page 7 of 7 - Part 1 Adorama Inc. Alkit Pro Batteries Plus Camera Boutique | Dixie Sales Co. Golden Triangle | HPI Int’l. Laube Photo
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
48. Camera, Polaroid Spectra 2 #615203 77.95 73.74 72.50 75.00
Brand/Model Polaroid Spectra2 A/S HPI#6711012 Spectra 2
Min. Ord. Requirement 5 NO BID $50.00 per order NO BID NO BID 6
49. Camera Kit, Polaroid Spectra for Law 199.95 201.95 205.50 205.95
Enforcement #619182 Spectra Law
Brand/Model Polaroid LE Kit A/S NONE Enforcement
Min. Ord. Requirement NO BID $50.00 NO BID NO BID LISTED 10
50. Camera, 35mm, auto-focus lens; 48.10 77.95 52.95
Canon Sureshot, Nikon One Touch 1805,
Ricoh AF77, Minolta AF 101R, Olympus Cannon Sure
Trip AF20, Pentax PC55AF, or equal, Shot-Owl Date
most current model Minolta AF- Kit Ricoh AF 77
Brand/Model Olympus/AF20 Bigfinder NONE #042176
Min. Ord. Requirement NONE LISTED NO BID $50.00 NO BID NO BID LISTED 10
WARRANTY REPAIR LOCATION FOR | NONELISTED | NONE LISTED } NONE LISTED Polaroid Corp. Polaroid Camera | NONE LISTED Polaroid Polaroid
POLAROID. 5601 Fulton 5601 Fulton Ind. 575 5601 Fulton Inds
PHONE, CONTACT PERSON Indust. Blvd. Blvd. Technology Sq Blvd.
Atlanta, GA Atlanta, GA 30336 4™ Floor Atlant, GA
30378 800-225-1000 Cambridge, 30378
800-343-5000 MA 02139 800-343-5000
Repair Dept. 800-225-1618
Customer
Service
WARRANTY REPAIR LOCATION FOR | NONELISTED | NONE LISTED | NONE LISTED Minolta Corp. NONE LISTED NONE LISTED Canon Ricoh
35mm CAMERA. 11150 Hope St. U.S.A.,Inc. 475 Lillard Dr
PHONE, CONTACT PERSON Cypress, CA One Canon Sparks, NV
90630 Plaza 89434
714-895-6633 Lake Success, 800-225-1899
Repair Dept. NY 11042 Repair
516-328-5000
or 516-328-
5009
Elliot Peck

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.
NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.

NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.

*KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER




Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Purchasing Office
Carolyn L. Hendrickson
(813) 247-8054

BID TABULATION
Bid Number: 10-99 Pitman Photo Price Point Ritz Camera Southern Photo Team Unique Photo Valley Litho Wolf Camera**
Supply** Supply #193*+* Supply** Marketing Inc Sply
Bid Title: Photographic Supplies
2535 N. Harpor PO Box 3002 | 11 Vreeland 1047 Haugen 150 14® Street NW
Opened: Januarl3 , 1999 @ 1500 hours 8650 SW 132™, | PO Box 438 6711 Ritz Way City Blvd. Troy, OH Rd Av Atlanta, GA 30318
Street Lakewood, NJ Beltsbille, MD Melbourne, FL 45373 Florham Park, Rice Lake, WI
Awarded: February 23, 1999 Miami, FL 08701-0438 20705 32935-6219 NI 07932 54868
33156
Award Period: 2/25/99 thru 2/24/2000 David
Lowell Elsea Morris Gluck Janet Patterson Zimmerman David Tohar Jim Babineau Josh Weber
Page 1 of 7 - PartIl Melissa Austin
800-252-3008 732-367-1009 407-254-4224 800-344-9054 | 800-631-0300 800-826-6781 800-239-9653x222
Items circled indicates an award. 800-835-3995 732-367-3176 301-419-3209x228 | 407-254-8348 937-339-2126 | 973-377-8800 800-962-5924 | 404-724-2994
301-210-4623
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16
KODAK PRODUCTS
GROUP I: NON-CARDED ROLL FIIL.M
FOR COLOR PRINTS
1a. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/12,
20 rl/pk #1393594 2.53 2.19 2.58 2.98 NO BID NOBID NO BID 2.17
1b. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/12, NOTE 9
50 1l/pk #8959686* 2.53 NO BID 2.58 2.98 NO BID NOBID NO BID 48.12/cs of 20*
2a. Kodacolar Gold ASA 100 GA 135/24,
20 rl/pk #1863505 3.38 2.99 3.45 398 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.82
2b. Kodacolar Gold ASA 100 GA 135/24, NOTE 9
50 rl/pk #1209857* 3.38 NO BID 3.45 3.98 NO BID NOBID NO BID 59.29/cs of 20*
3a. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135-36,
20rl/pk # 4.43 3.85 4.79 5.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.06
3b. Kodacolor Gold ASA 100 GA 135/36,
50 rl/pk #1509066* 4.43 NO BID 4.79 521 NO BID NOBID NO BID
4a. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135/12, 20 rl/pk #1963206 3.21 2.25 3.28 3.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2. NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.
*KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER



Bid No. 10-99 - Page 2 of 7 - Part II Pitman Photo Price Point Sply | Ritz Camera 193 Southern Photo Team Market. | Unique Photo Valley Litho Wolf Camera
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16
4b. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC NOTE 9
135/12,50 rl/pk #8669590* 3.21 NO BID 3.28 3.78 NO BID NOBID NO BID 64.59/cs of 20*
5a. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135724, 20/rl/pk #1973551 4.28 3.25 437 5.03 NO BID NOBID NO BID 3.38
5b. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135/24, 50/rl/pk #8127656* 4.28 NO BID 4.37 5.03 NO BID NOBID NO BID
6a. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135/36, 20 rl/pk, # 5.52 4.63 5.89 6.49 NO BID NOBID NO BID
6b. Kodacolor ASA 400 Ultra Gold GC
135/36, 50 rl/pk, #1829589* 5.52 NO BID 5.89 6.49 NO BID NOBID NO BID
Law Enforcement Packs of 50 rolls* Law Enf. 50 roll Law Enf 50 roll
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS All other 1 roli $100.00 All other 20 rolls 20/50 20 Rolls Ea *
GROUP II: NON-CARDED ROLL FILM
FOR COLOR SLIDES
7. Ektachrome Color Elite 100 EB 135/24
(20 rolls/pack) #1113612 4.57 4.30 5.02 5.38 NO BID 4.02 3.30 4.51
NONE
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS One Roll $100.00 20 Rolls 20 LISTED 20 Rolls 20 Rolls
GROUP III: NON-CARDED ROLIL
PROFESSIONAL STILL FILMS
8. Black & White, Pan, Tri-X 120, ASA NOTE3 & 4
400 (20 rl/pk) #8120891 (869-4762ProPk) 2.69 NO BID 2.38 2.74 NO BID 2.60 2.28 2.48
NONE
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS 20 rolls 20 LISTED 20 Rolls 20 Rolls
GROUP IV: CHEMICAL SUPPLIES
9.Flexicolor RA SM Process F1 #1112028 NOTE 5 NO BID 65.95 63.35 NO BID 61.95 NO BID NO BID
69.34
10. Flexicolor RA SM Process F2 # NOTE 6
8456188 22.32 NO BID 20.95 20.40 NO BID 19.95 NO BID NO BID
11. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Developer NOTE 7
#1756337 4.18 NO BID 3.99 3.82 NO BID 3.75 NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.
NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.
*KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER




Bid No. 10-99- Page 3 of 7 - Part II Pitman Photo Price Point Sply | Ritz Camera Southern Photo Team Market. | Unique Photo Valley Litho Wolf Camera

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16

12. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Bleach NOTE S

#8824690 34.79 NOBID 33.25 31.79 NO BID 31.10 NO BID NO BID

13. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Fixer NOTESS

#8462681 8.41 NO BID 7.99 7.69 NO BID 7.50 NO BID NOBID

14. Flexicolor RA SM Tank Stabilizer NOTE 8

#8698441 0.93 NO BID 0.89 0.95 NO BID 0.85 NO BID NO BID

15. Ektacolor RA developer/replenisher NOTE 6

RT, to make 10 liter (4/case) #8415580 22.50 NO BID 19.95 19.11 NO BID 18.70 NO BID NO BID

16. Ektacolor RA bleach/fix replenisher, to NOTE 6

make 10 liter (4/case) #8309031 21.26 NO BID 19.95 19.19 NO BID 25.70 NO BID NO BID

17. Ektacolor RA stabilizer/replenisher, to NOTE 8

make 10 liter (16/case) #8575623 11.04 NO BID 9.95 10.22 NO BID 10.00 NOBID NO BID

18. Ektacolor RA developer starter solution NOTE 8

to make 95 liters (1/case) #1026681 9.64 NOBID 9.39 8.98 NO BID 8.75 NO BID NOBID
NONE

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS No Min. Required NA LISTED

GROUP V: PAPER SUPPLY

19. Ektacolor Royal V,F,4" x 245', (4/case)

#1449560 27.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 28.50 NO BID

20. Ektacolor Royal V,F, 8" x 245' (2/case)

#1171834 54.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 55.75 NO BID

21. Ektacolor Royal V,F, 11" x 245'

(2/case) #8853020 74.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 75.95 NO BID

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS One Roll NONE

GROUP VI: MISCELLANEOUS KODAK

PRODUCTS

22. Control Strip, Process C41, 35MM X

100’ Roll #1803709 112.29 NO BID NO BID 115.00 NO BID 142.30 NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.

NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Muit. Of 1.
**KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER
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DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16

23. Control Strip, RA, 50/Box #8282170 50.94 NO BID NO BID 52.00 NO BID 80.95 NO BID NO BID

NONE

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS One Box One Box LISTED

GROUP VII: POLAROID FILM

PRODUCTS

24. Spectra, platinum film, Twin Pack, 10

exposures/pack, (30/case) #624242 19.82 19.99 20.25 24.08 22.77 20.95 NOBID 18.24

25. Spectra, high definition, grid film,

(30/cs) #617792 21.19 26.00 29.46 27.99 24.23 25.15 NO BID 22.88

26. Type 600 platinum, Twin Pack, 10

exposures/pack, (30/case) #623965 19.82 19.99 20.25 24.08 21.15 20.95 NO BID 21.24

27. Type 667, Twin Pack, 10 10 exp pk

exposures/pack, (25/case) #617799 16.09 16.20 10.55 21.51 22.76 14.50 NO BID 17.50

28. Type 669, Twin Pack,10 10 exp pk

exposures/pack, (25/case) #623960 24.42 23.15 15.00 30.83 27.05 NO BID 23.89

29. Type 665, Pos/Neg, 8 exposures/pack,

(50/case) #603098 8.40 10.25 10.50 10.69 9.50 8.75 NO BID 8.84

30. T-1900 one-step color print film,

(36 ea 8 x 10 printsheets/box - 2 bx)

#615474 170.10 NOBID 202.50 NO BID NO BID 170.10 NO BID NO BID

31. T-1910 one-step black & white print

film, (36 ea 8 x 10 print sheets/box - 2 bx)

#616522 170.10 NO BID 199.95 NOBID NO BID 170.10 NOBID NO BID

32. X-ray, TPX, 8" x 10", 15

exposures/box, (3bx/Case), #604783 371.25 NO BID 411.50 397.00 NO BID 361.12 NO BID NO BID

33. Coaterless 803, 8"x10", black & white

film, 15 exposures/box,(3bx/cs)#609656 385.53 NO BID 42225 412.17 NO BID 376.23 NO BID 372.93
NONE NONE

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS One Unit $100.00 No Min. Required Case LISTED LISTED Case

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.

NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Muit. Of 2.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Muit. Of 4.

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.
*KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER
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B
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16
e
GROUP VIII: MISCELLANEQUS
SUPPLY
34. Negative Preservers, Unstamped, Kraft, 56.00 30.50 45.60
4" x 5", Savage #S-851 or APEC #264,
500/box Savage NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID
35. Numerical Coding Tape, Shastar 24.95
Twincheck, Superflex, Code #1122-12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36. Dust-Away (or equal) Refill, 12 Ounce 8.00 6.90
Brand/Stock # Dust Gun 201376 Century Duster
Case Pack /case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12/cs NO BID NO BID
NONE
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS One Box of 500 NONE LISTED LISTED Box
Mounting Board, Black on One Side (this
will be awarded as a group):
37a. 8" x 10", 100//case 76.00 NO BID NO BID 123.00 NO BID NO BID 123.78
37b. 11" x 14", 100/case 134.00 NO BID NO BID 103.00 NO BID NO BID 104.24 (50/cs)
37c. 16" x 20", 50/case 76.00 NO BID NO BID 110.00 NO BID NO BID 123.78
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS Case Quantity NONE LISTED Case
GROUP IX: BATTERIES
38. Batteries, Mercury Battery, 1.35 V, flat, 2.84 0.84 222 1.25
Eveready EPX625, Duracell PX625AB Duracell Various- Varta
Brand/Stock # PX625AB Duracell or Sanyo(Not
Alkaline NO BID PX625AB NONE LISTED NO BID Murcury)GNB
239 NO BID
39. Batteries, 1.55 V, 145 mAh, Duracell 2.64 1.49 0.93 1.40
MS76B or Varta V76PX Panasonic Various - Varta
Brand/Stock# Duracell M576B NO BID G13PA/1B NONE LISTED NO BID or Kodak
EKB338 NO BID

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.
NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.
*KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER
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DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16
40. Batteries, Lithium, 6 V, 1500 mAh, 10.24 5.94 3.87 475 3.61
flat, 2CRS, Sanyo, Kodak, Varta or Various - Varta
Eveready EL2CRS, Duracell DL245 Eveready or Kodak or
Brand/Stock EL2CR5 NO BID Canon 2CR5 NONE LISTED NO BID Panasonic Varta or Sanyo
GNB235 NO BID 2CRS
41. Batteries, AA, hi energy lithium, 1.5V, 4.77 per 2 pack 3.75
Eveready Energizer 191 Eveready Eveready Enegizer
Brand/Stock L91BP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID L91 (2AA Pack)
42. Batteries, long life lithium, 6V, 5.73
Duracell PX28L, Eveready L544, or Varta Various - Varta
V28PXL or Panasonic or
Brand/Stock Eveready L544 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Duracell
EKB346 NO BID NO BID
‘NONE
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS One NO MINIMUM NONE LISTED LISTED Each
43 Battery Pack, #2, Quantum 162.80 163.95 155.20 154.93
Brand/Stock # Quantum QB-2 NO BID Quantum battery Quantum Quantum QB2
pack 2 NO BID NO BID QMH1107 NO BID 531211037
44. Module “S” For Sunpack Model 544 37.40 35.95 36.13
(MS) Quantum MS Quantum Quantum MS
Brand/Stock # Module NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID QMHI1164 NO BID 531211053
45. Power Module, SB-24 Quantum CK 26.40 25.95 25.33
Turbo Quantum CK Quantum Quantum CR
Brand/Stock # Module NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID QMH1130 NO BID 53121135
46. Battery Pack for Handicam, NP-77H 30.96 & 27.91
long life (2400 mAh), Varta V68, Kaneco
#6024 or Ultra Power UP577TH Telepower
Brand/Stock# Varta V68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID TP77XL
MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENTS One NO MINIMUM NONE
LISTED Each
GROUP X: CAMERA EQUIPMENT
47. Camera, Polaroid OneStep, auto-focus 47.96 44.75 51.75 54.00 \ 46.82
with plastic lens #619487 Polaroid One Polaroid One Step | Polaroid One Step | Polaroid One- | Polaroid One Step
Brand/Model Step AF AF 619487 Step AF
Min. Ord. Requirement #625547 NO BID 1 2 30 NO BID 6

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.
NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.
**KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER
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DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16
48. Camera, Polaroid Spectra 2 #615203 78.22 89.95 87.61 84.50 78.50 79.31
Brand/Model Polaroid Spectra Polaroid Spectra2 | Polaroid Spectra 2 Polaroid Polaroid Polaroid Spectra 2
2 615203 Spectra 2 Spectra 2
Min. Ord. Requirement 1 NO BID 1 2 6 NO BID Each
49. Camera Kit, Polaroid Spectra for Law 209.94 226.95 235.14 210.00 209.00 212.76
Enforcement #619182 Polaroid Cat Polaroid Spectra Polaroid Spectra Polaroid Law | Polaroid Law
Brand/Model #619182 Law Enforcement 619182 Enforcement Enfor. Kit Specta L.E. Kit
Min. Ord. Requirement 1 NO BID 1 2 1 NO BID 6
50. Camera, 35mm, auto-focus lens; Canon 58.70 52.50 4425 NOTE 10
Sureshot, Nikon One Touch 1805, Ricoh Samsung 333 43.45
AF77, Minolta AF 101R, Olympus Trip
AF20, Pentax PC55AF, or equal, most Canon Sure
current model Shot Owl Olympus Trip AF
Brand/Model #C133252 30 QDW/Ritz Kit Olympus Trip
Min. Ord. Requirement 1 NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID AF-30
6
WARRANTY REPAIR LOCATION FOR SPTS Ritz Camera POLAROID Team Polaroid Wolf Camera
POLAROID. 1750 9* Ave N. 6711 Ritz Way DIRECT Marketing Co 5601 Fulton 4907 14 St. W.
PHONE, CONTACT PERSON St. Petersburg, Beltsville, MD 1390 Lytle Industrial Blvd Bradenton, FL.
FL 33713 20705 Road Sw 34207
813-896-6141 301-419-3209x228 Troy, OH Atlanta, Ga 941-755-3344
Bruce Spooner | NONE LISTED Melissa Austin 45373 30378 Mark Richer
800-344-9054 | 800-343-5000
David Repairs NONE
Zimmerman LISTED
WARRANTY REPAIR LOCATION FOR SPTS Ritz Camera Samsung Wolf Camera
35mm CAMERA. 1750 9® Ave N. 6711 Ritz Way 40 Seaview Dr 4907 144 St W
PHONE, CONTACT PERSON St. Petersburg, Beltsville, MD Secaucus, NI Bradenton, FL
FL 33713 20705 07094 34207
813-896-6141 301-419-3209x228 NONE 201-902-0347 NONE 941-755-3344
Bruce Spooner | NONE LISTED Melissa Austin NONE LISTED LISTED Repairs LISTED Mark Richer

NOTE 1. Black Vinyl Twin 2000 Roll.

NOTE 5. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 2.

NOTE 2.Min. Order 2 Packs.
NOTE 6. Min Ord. Mult. Of 4.
NOTE 9. 1 Unite = 20 Rolls. Kodak will not market after 1% quarter

NOTE 3. 5 Rolls #869-4762 - $2.69.
NOTE 7. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 6.
NOTE 10.Spec. Sheet Enclosed.

NOTE 4.1 Roll #812-0891-$2.44

NOTE 8. Min. Ord. Mult. Of 1.
*KODAK AUTHORIZED L.E. DEALER




