Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office

P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Office

Christopher G. Back, Buyer

(813) 247-8023

Bid Number: 12-00 P J.H. Churchwell Kristen Uniform Textile Saes Inc. Acme Supply Wesvic's Robinson ICS Tabb Textile ATD American Charm-Tex, Inc.
A Company & Linens Co., Ltd. Clothing & Shoe Textiles, Inc. Company Inc. Co.
Bid Title: Inmate Towel and Linen Supply C Brokers, Inc.
K 301-313 E. Bay 2010 Eggert P.O. Box 32576 P.O. Box 1139 P.O. Box 1379 152 W. Walnut P.O. Box 21056 4939 Lower 135 Greenwood 1618 Coney
Opened: 07/14/00 @ 3:00 PM / St. P.O. Box Road St., Ste. 250 Roswell Rd. Ave. Idand Avenue
Awarded: 01/04/01 Q 1019
U
1% Year Award Period: 01/04/01 - 01/03/02 A Jacksonville, FL Baltimore, Port Pembroke, Gardena, Waco, Marietta, Wyncote, Brooklyn,
N 32201 Amherst, MD 21282 Washington, GA 31321 CA 90248 TX 76702- GA 30068 PA 19095 NY 11230
Patl - Pagel of 4 T NY 14226 NY  11050- 1056 1396
| Gary Zemil 1139 Victor Duggar Gary Lovemark Alan Fenster Joshua Danzger
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD T Derek Brocious P (800) 724- P (912) 653 P (800) 421- James M. Bogan P (334) 745 Spencer Zaslow P (718) 252-
Y P (716) 832- 8040 Zaheer Shaikh 2379 5582 P (800) 524- 6762 P (215) 576- 8100
7571 F (410) 356- P (800) 338- F (912) 653- F (800) 370- 5427 F (334) 745- 1000 F (718) 258-
F (716) 836- 5015 2425 3366 7019 F (254) 751- 2377 F (215) 576- 8303
6463 F (800) 338- 0299 1827
9869
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
1. Towels, bath, terry cloth, 20" x 40", white, 100% 5000 NOTE 30 NOTE 18
cotton or cotton /polyester blend acceptable, 5 Ib. dz. NO BID 11.29 10.80 8.45 10.90 NO BID 9.98 8.88 9.82 9.28
min. fabric weight per dz., irregular 100% Cotton
Fabric weight; Ibs./dz. - 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs/dz. 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz.
Dimensions of Product - 20" x 40" 20" x 40" 20" x 40" 20" x 40" 20" x 40" 20" x 40" 20" x 40" 20" x 40"
Brand/Stock No. - Import Import 20405 Acme #11511 Wesvic 20405 ICS Import Tabb Int. Import 5 Ib/dz International
#016 #2040
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 ¥2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO
NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent

NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB
NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size
NOTE 16. No thread count given

NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs

NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed
NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing

NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing
NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel

NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes
NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing

NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops

NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges
NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing
NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after

testing
NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other
bidders
NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart
from materia




2. Wash clothes, terry cloth, 12" x 12" min., white, 13000 NOTE 30 NOTE 18 & 20 NOTE 18 & 19 NOTE 18 & 21
100% cotton/poly. Blend acceptable, 12 0z. min. dz. NO BID 1.45 1.49 1.10 2.29 NO BID 152 & 29 1.47 1.27
fabric weight per dz., irregular 1.07 100% Cotton
Fabric weight; oz./dz. - 12 oz/dz. 3/4#/dz. 12 oz./dz. .50 Ib./dz. 12 oz./dz. .751b/dz. .75 Ib/dz. 12 oz./dz.
Brand/Stock No. Import Import 12x12 Acme #15312 Wesvic 121250 ICS Import Tabb Int. Import .75 Ib/dz International
#L017 121212|

3. Pillow cases, approx. dimension 21" x 34", 50% 650 SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
cotton/50% polyester blend, min. thread count of dz. NO BID BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN
128, regulars and irregulars are acceptable BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW

Bid Number 12-00: J.H. Churchwell Kristen Uniform Textile Saes Inc. Acme Supply Wesvic's Robinson ICS Tabb Textile ATD American Charm Tex

Part | - Page 2 of 4 Company & Linens Co., Ltd. Clothing & Shoe Textile, Inc. Company Co.

Brokers, Inc.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
White/Regular - /dz. NOTE 30 NOTE 18 & 23 NOTE 18 & 25 NOTE 18 & 25 NOTE 18 & 24 NOTE 18 & 23 NOTE 18 & 31
Thread count - 9.35 8.38 7.50 10.15 NO BID 9.60 & 35 NO BID 8.80
Dimensions of Product - T-130 T/130 T130 T128 T130 or better 7.30 T128+
Brand/Stock No. - 21" x 34" As Per Spec 21" x 34" 21" x 34" 21" x 34" T130 21" x 34"
Import Import Acme #29563 Wesvic 2134128 ICS #L022 21" x 34" Charmtex
21x34P/IC Tabb #401W
White/Irregular - /dz. 7.25 8.25
Thread Count - NO BID NO BID T130 T128 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product - 21" x 34" 21" x 34'
Brand/Stock No. Acme Wesvic 2134128
#29563ROL
Navy Blue/ Regular - /dz. NOTE 1 15.00 14.66 12.15 16.50
Thread Count - NO BID 10.60 T130 NO BID NO BID T130 or better T130 NO BID T128+
Dimensions of Product - T130 21" x 34" 21" x 34" 21" x 34" 21" x 34"
Brand/Stock No. - As Per Spec Acme #29563 ICSHL022N Tabb #401N Charmtex
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 %2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO

NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent
NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB

NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given
NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs
NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed

NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing
NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing

NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel

NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes

NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing

NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops
NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges

NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing
NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after

bidders

testing

NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other

NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart

from

materia




Navy Blue/Irregular - /dz. 14.00
Thread count - NO BID NO BID T130 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product - 21" x 34"
Brand/Stock No. - Acme
#29563ROL
4. Sheets, flat, size 54" x 90", 50% cotton/50% 600 SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
polyester blend, min. thread count of 128, regulars dz. NO BID BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN
and irregulars are acceptable BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW
White/Regular - /dz. NOTE 30 NOTE 18 & 24 NOTE 18 & 23 NOTE 18 & 25 NOTE 18 & 32 NOTE 18 & 33
Thread Count - 28.16 25.90 24.00 26.50 43.95 29.18 & 35 NO BID 27.65
Dimensions of Product - T-130 T/130 T130 128 128 T130 23.90 T128+
Brand/Stock No. - 54" x 90" 54" x 90" 54" x 90" 54" x 90" 54" X 90" 54 x 90 or 60 x T130 54" x 90"
Import 5490W Acme #22111 Wesvic 5490128 Rob Tex RTMS 90 54" x 90" Charmtex
ICS Import Tabb #4638W
#1020
JH. Churchwell Kristen Uniform Textile Sales Inc. Acme Supply Wesvic's Robinson ICS Tabb Textile ATD American Charm Tex
Bid Number 12-00: Company & Linens Co., Ltd. Clothing & Shoe Textiles, Inc. Company Co.
Part | - Page 3 of 4 Brokers, Inc.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
White/Irregular - /dz. 23.25
Thread Count - NO BID NO BID T130 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product - 54" x 90"
Brand/Stock No. - Acme
#22111ROL
NOTE 1
Navy Blue/Regular - /dz. NO BID 28.15 35.00 NO BID 76.00 56.00 35.20 NO BID 43.00
Thread Count - T/130 T130 128 T130 T130 T128+
Dimensions of Product - 54" x 90" 54" x 90" 54" x 90" 54 x 90 or 60 x 54" x 90" 54" x 90"
Brand/Stock No. - 5490w Acme #22111 Rob Tex RTMS 90 Tabb #4637N Charmtex
ICSHLO20NB
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 %2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO

NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent
NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB

NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given
NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs

NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed

NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing
NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing
NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel
NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes
NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing
NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops

NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges
NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing

NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after
testing
NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other

bidders
NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart
from materia



Navy Blue/lrregular- /dz. 34.00
Thread Count - NO BID NO BID T130 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product - 54" x 90"
Brand/Stock No. - Acme
#22111ROL
5. Sheets, fitted to fit mattress size 30" x 76" x 5", 600 SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
50% cotton/50% polyester blend, min. thread count dz. NO BID BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN
of 128 regulars and irregulars are acceptable BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW
White/Regular - /dz. NOTE 18 & 34 NOTE 5 & 18 NOTE 18 & 35
Thread Count - NO BID 31.50 34.00 39.90 30.40 NO BID
Dimensions of Product - T/130 T130 128 NO BID NO BID T130 30.30
Brand/Stock No. - As Per Spec 30" x 76" x 5" 30" x 76' x 5" 34" x 80" x 6" T128+
30765 Acme #SF3076 Wesvic 30765 Tabb 4701W 30" x 76" x 5"
Charmtex
White/Irregular - /dz. NOTE 30 33.00
Thread Count - 39.60 NO BID T130 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product - T-130 30" x 76" x 5"
Brand/Stock No. - 30" x 76" x 5" Acme
Import #SF3076ROL
Bid Number 12-00: JH. Churchwell Kristen Uniform Textile Sales Inc. Acme Supply Wesvic's Robinson ICS Tabb Textile ATD American Charm Tex
Part | - Page 4 of 4 Company & Linens Co., Ltd. Clothing & Shoe Textiles, Inc. Company Co.
Brokers, Inc.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
Navy Blue/Regular - /dz. NOTE2& 3 NOTE 5
Thread Count - NO BID 29.60 45.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 38.75 NO BID 47.45
Dimensions of Product - T/130 T130 T130 T128+
Brand/Stock No. - As Per Spec 30" x 76" x 5" 34" x 80" x 6" 30" x 76" x 5"
30765 Acme #SF3076 Tabb 4704N Charmtex
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 %2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO

NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent
NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB

NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given
NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs

NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed

NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing
NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing
NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel
NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes
NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing
NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops

NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges
NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing
NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after

bidders

testing

NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other

NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart

from

materia




Navy Blue/Irregular - /dz. 44.00
Thread Count - NO BID NO BID T130 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product - 30" x 76" x 5"
Brand/Stock No. Acme

#SF3076ROL
6. Pillows, size 17" x 25", flame retardant, Staph 2700 NOTE 30 NOTE 26 NOTE 26 NOTE 26 NOTE 26
Check, Micro Vent XL (9 %2 0z) cover, polyester fill e NO BID 4.18 NO BID 5.75 3.90 NO BID 4.20 3.23 NO BID 3.15

Protect Acme Liebharat Liebhardt
Brand/Stock No. #PLWS1725 Wesvic 1725 ICS #L03PC HsS18 HsS18
NOTE 4 NOTE 4
SAMPLES SUBMITTED: NO YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
EXCEPTIONS: NONE SEE NOTES SEE NOTES NONE SEE NOTES NONE SEE NOTES NONE NOTE 6
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 %2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO

NOTE 13. Pillow size is 20 x 26, micro-vent
NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB

NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given
NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs
NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed

NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing
NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing
NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel
NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes
NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing
NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops

NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges
NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing
NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing

bidders

NOTE 35: Acceptable product after
testing
NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other

NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart

from

materia




P.O. Box 3371

Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Office

Christopher G. Back, Buyer

(813) 247-8023

Bid Number: 12-00 P Pro Pac, Inc. Bob Barker Harbor Linen World Wide Pride Enterprises Uniforms Mfg. Pro-Stat, Inc.
A Company, Inc. Co. Supply
Bid Title: Inmate Linen and Towel Supply C
K 5601 Rivers PO Box 429 P.O. Box 316 2720-G Blair PO Box 12716 7-11 Factory
Opened: 07/14/00 @ 3:00 P.M. / Ave. 118 E. Jones St. P.O. Box 3510 Stone Rd. Lane
Q
Awarded: 01/04/01 U Fuquay-Varing, Cresson, Tallahassee, Scottsdale,
A Charleston, NC 27526 Cherry Hill. PA 16630 FL 32301 AZ 85267- Middlesex,
Award Period: 01/04/01 - 01/03/02 N SC 29406 NJ 08034 2716 NJ 08846
T
Patll - Pagel of 5 | Mary Eure John Romani Terrie Brooks
T Bert Benton P (800) 334- David Garfield P (800) 910- P (850) 487- L. Tucker Stephen Notaro
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD Y P (800) 345- 9880 P (800) 257- 1086 3774 P (800) 222- P (800) 652-
3036 F (800) 322- 7858 F (814) 886- F (850) 488- 1474 2558
F (888) 877- 7537 F (856) 346- 5952 1299 F (480) 368- F (631) 862-
6722 4598 8556 1719
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
1. Towels, bath, terry cloth, 20" x 40", white, 100% 5000 Domestic 18.11 NOTE 30 NOTE 30
cotton or cotton /polyester blend acceptable, 5 Ib. dz. 10.29 12.00 9.39 Import 11.34 18.60 9.00 10.24
min. fabric weight per dz., irregular
NOTE 7 Dom. 5.15
Fabric weight; Ibs./dz. - 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz. Ibs./dz. 5.5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz. 5 Ibs./dz.
Dimensions of Product - 20" x 40" 20" x 40" 20" x 40" Import 5 Ibs./dz 20" x 40" 20" x 40" 20" x 40"
Brand/Stock No. - #LINN-0900010 Bob Barker Olympia 20" x 40" Pride #2765-09 #2040LCWT-S Pro-Stat Inc.
#BT2040 Domestic #PS204050
#0604511
Import
#01204045
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 ¥2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO

NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent

NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB
NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given

NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs

NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed
NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing

NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing

NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel

NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes

NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing

NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops
NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges

NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing

NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing

NOTE 35: Acceptable product after

testing

NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other

NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart

from

materia




2. Wash clothes, terry cloth, 12" x 12" min., white, 13000 NOTE 18 & 35 Domestic 3.86 NOTE 30 NOTE 30
100% cotton/poly. Blend acceptable, 12 oz. min. dz. 1.28 2.80 1.45 4.44 1.40 114
fabric weight per dz., irregular NOTE 18
Import 1.37
Bid Number 12-00:
Part Il - Page 2 of 5 Pro Pac Inc. Bob Barker Harbor Linen World Wide Pride Enterprises Uniforms Mfg. Pro-Stat, Inc.
Company, Inc. Supply Inc.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
NOTE 7 NOTE 17
Fabric weight; oz./dz. - .75 Ibs./dz. 11b./dz. 12 oz./dz. Domestic .70# 11.3 oz./dz. 12 oz./dz. 12 oz./dz.
Brand/Stock No. - #LINN- Bob Barker Olympia Import .75# Pride #2765-02 Poly-Cotton Pro-Stat Inc.
1100010 #41050 Import 1212L P #PS121275
#03121207
3. Pillow cases, approx. dimension 21" x 34", 50% 650 SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
cotton/50% polyester blend, min. thread count of dz. BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN
128, regulars and irregulars are acceptable BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW
NOTE 7 & 18 & NOTE 9 & 10 NOTE 18 & 24 NOTE 18 NOTE 30 NOTE 30
White/Regular - /dz. 27 11.50 8.10 10.78 16.20 11.40 9.49
Thread count - 9.22 130 130 T-130 128 128 T-130
Dimensions of Product - 130 29 % x 19 3/4 21" x 34" 21" x 34" 21" x 34" 21" x 34" 42x34/21x34
Brand/Stock No. - 20" x 31" #PCCA4234W Olympia #13042461 Pride #2762-05 PL10 Pro-Stat Inc.
#LINN-0500010 #PS4234PC
White/Irregulars - /dz. NOTE 30
Thread Count - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.20 NO BID
Dimensions of Product - 128
Brand/Stock No. 21" x 34"
PL10
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 %2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO

NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent
NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB

NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given

NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs

NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed
NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing
NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing

NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel

NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes

NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing

NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops
NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges

NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing

NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after
testing
NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other

bidders
NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart
from materia




Navy Blue/ Regulars - /dz. NOTE 9 & 10 NOTE 1& 30
Thread Count - NO BID 20.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.71
Dimensions of Product - 130 T-130
Brand/Stock No. - #PCC4234BL 42x34/21x34
Bid Number 12-00: Pro Pac Inc. Bob Barker Harbor Linen World Wide Pride Enterprises Uniforms Mfg. Pro-Stat, Inc.
Part Il - Page 3 of 5 Company, Inc.. Supply Inc.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
Navy Blue/Irregulars - /dz.
Thread count - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product -
Brand/Stock No. -
4. Sheets, flat, size 54" x 90", 50% cotton/50% 600 SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
polyester blend, min. thread count of 128, regulars dz. BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN
and irregulars are acceptable BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW
NOTE 7 NOTE 10 NOTE 18 NOTE 16 & 30 NOTE 30
White/Regular - /dz. 30.23 33.85 28.62 28.35 46.80 30.00 29.41
Thread Count - 130 130 130 T-130 128 54" x 90" T-130
Dimensions of Product - 54" x 90" 54" x 90" 54" x 90" 54" x 90" 54" x 94" UM#5490L P 54" x 90"
Brand/Stock No. - #LINN-0700010 Bob Barker Olympia #15548061 Pride #2762-01 Pro-Stat Inc.
#SH5490 #PS5490FS
White/Irregulars - /dz. NOTE 30
Thread Count - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.90
Dimensions of Product - T-130
Brand/Stock No. - 54" x 90"
Pro-Stat Inc.
#PS5490FS
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 ¥2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO

NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent
NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB

NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given

NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs

NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed
NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing
NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing

NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel

NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes

NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing

NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops
NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges

NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing
NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after

testing
NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other
bidders
NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart
from materia




Navy Blue/Regular - /dz. NOTE 10 & 11
Thread Count - NO BID 75.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product - 58" x 90"
Brand/Stock No. - Bob Barker
#SH5890BL
Navy Blue/Irregulars- /dz.
Thread Count - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product -
Brand/Stock No. -
Bid Number 12-00: Pro Pec Inc. Bob Barker Harbor Linen World Wide Pride Enterprises Uniforms Mfg. Pro-Stat, Inc.
Part 11 - Page 4 of 5 Company, Inc.. Supply Inc.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
5. Sheets, fitted to fit mattress size 30" x 76" x 5", 600 SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE SEE
50% cotton/50% polyester blend, min. thread count dz. BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN BREAKDOWN
of 128 regulars and irregulars are acceptable BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW BELOW
White/Regular - /dz. NOTE 18 NOTE 10 NOTE 18 & 37 NOTE 18 NOTE 15 NOTE 30
Thread Count - 31.40 75.50 26.12 32.07 72.00 NO BID 38.25
Dimensions of Product - 130 130 130 T-130 128 T-130
Brand/Stock No. - 36" x 80" x 8" 36" x 78" 30" x 76" x 5" 30" x 76" x 5" 30" x 76" x 7" 30" x 76" x 6"
#LINN-0700020 Bob Barker Olympia #15397561 Pride #2762-02- Pro-Stat Inc.
#FS63636 01-00 #PS30766FS
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin
NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile
NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 ¥2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO
NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent

NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB
NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given
NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs
NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed

NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing
NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing

NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel
NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes

NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing

NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops
NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges
NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing
NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after

testing
NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other
bidders
NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart
from materia



White/Irregular - /dz.

Thread Count - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product -
Brand/Stock No. -
NO BID NOTE 12
Navy blue/Regular - /dz 115.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Thread count - 130
Dimensions of Product - 36" x 78"
Brand/Stock No. - Bob Barker
#IFS63636NV
Pro Pac Inc. Bob Barker Harbor Linen World Wide Pride Enterprises Uniforms Mfg., Pro-Stat, Inc.
Bid Number 12-00: Company, Inc. Supply Inc.
Part Il - Page5of 5
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
Navy Blue/Irregulars - /dz.
Thread Count - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dimensions of Product -
Brand/Stock No. -
6. Pillows, size 17" x 25" , flame retardant, Staph 2700 NOTE 26 NOTE 13 & 35 NOTE 26 NOTE 26 NOTE 36 NOTE 30 NOTE 30
Check, Micro Vent XL (9 % 0z) cover, polyester fill ea 3.34 & 36 3.22 347 5.51 5.75 3.35
4.75
Brand/Stock No. - NOTE 8
National Sleep NOTE 14
Products Bob Barker Pride #2463-14- Pro-Stat Inc.

#509075601 #MU2026 Liebhardt Staph Chek 17-25 UM#PL7R #PS1725SC

SAMPLES SUBMITTED: YES YES YES YES YES NO NO
NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94" NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded

NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 ¥2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO

NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent
NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB

NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs

NOTE 16. No thread count given

NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed

NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing

NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing

NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel

NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes

NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing

NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops
NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges

NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing
NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after

testing
NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other
bidders

NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart
from materia




EXCEPTIONS:

SEE NOTES SEE NOTES NONE

NONE SEE NOTES SEE NOTES SEE NOTES

NOTE 1. Vendor Bidson Lt. Blue

NOTE 2. Vendor Bids on Med. Blue

NOTE 3. Delivery on Med. Blue-90 days ARO

NOTE 4. Only white samples submitted cover 5.4 0z/sq.yd
NOTE 5. Dimensions are approximates

NOTE 6. Agency orders less than $1000/FOB origin

NOTE 7. Brand Name is Nationwide Textile

NOTE 8. Sample to show quadlity only, pillow will be 17" x 25" if awarded
NOTE 9. Dimension of Product 29 %2 x 19 3/4
NOTE 10. White & Navy - 65% poly. / 35% cotton

NOTE 11 Navy Dimensions are 58" x 94"
NOTE 12. Lead time 4-6 weeks ARO
NOTE 13. Pillow sizeis 20 x 26, micro-vent

NOTE 14. 7 oz. cover; 9 Y2 is FOB
NOTE 15. Sized to fit mattress bid size

NOTE 16. No thread count given
NOTE 17. Does not meet min. specs
NOTE 18: (3) test washes performed

NOTE 19: Shrinkage, edge ripping, after testing
NOTE 20: Shrinkage, seam separation after test

NOTE 21: Shrinkage, fraying after testing
NOTE 22: Shrinkage, thin after testing
NOTE 23: Thin, pilfering after testing

NOTE 24: Thin, stitching buckling, pilfering, dingy, seams unravel
NOTE 25: Inferior material/loose stitching after testing, pilfering

NOTE 26: Inferior covers, cracking, violation of fire/safety/sanitation codes
NOTE 27: Ripped at seams, pilfering after testing
NOTE 28: Hemmed (3) sides, thin, no loops

NOTE 29: Hemmed (4) sides, ripping at edges
NOTE 30: No samples submitted with Bid

NOTE 31: Some pilfering after testing
NOTE 32: 2 seams, thin after testing
NOTE 33: Small stitching

NOTE 34: Shrinkage after testing
NOTE 35: Acceptable product after

testing
NOTE 36: Has superior cover to other
bidders

NOTE 37: Unraveling after testing, elastic comes apart
from materia




