Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office

P.O. Box 3371

Tampa, FL 33601

Purchasing Office
Violet Bachmann, Buyer
(813) 247-8029

Bid Number: 12-01 P Unisource Bay Indust. Supply Pyramid School Products | Dade Paper Co. Jerry’sVacuums & Reliable Custodia Colonial Paper Co Premier Janitoria Supply | AA Casey CO
A Janitorial Supplies, Inc Maint. & Supplies
Bid Title: Brooms, Mops, Brushes and C
Cleaning Accessories K 6510 N 54th St 1339 Bennett Dr.
/ 6511 N. 54" St. P.O. Box 5084 6918 Presidents Dr 945 N. 14th Street 2000 Banks Rd. P.O.Box 310 #105 5124 NebraskaAve.
Opened: May 21, 2001 Q Hwy 27 South Suite 201G
U Tampa, FL Longwood, FL
Awarded: January 14, 2002 A Tampa, FL Clearwater, FL 33610 Orlando, FL Leesburg, FL Margate, FL Silver Springs, FL 32750 Tampa, FL
N 33610 34618 32809 34748 33063 34489 33603
Award Period: January 14, 2002 - January 13, 2003 T Kenneth Miller Kathy Grundhoefer
| Linda Cortez William J. Portman Scott Meltz Jerry Hoffman Jennifer Leckey Hugh Price
Page 1lof 3 T (813)621-6446 Ph (407)331-3125 Ph
Y (800)483-1991 Ph (727)796-1397 Ph (813)621-7688 Fx (407)859-1020 Ph (352)360-0234 Ph (954)973-0078 Ph (352)622-4171 Ph (407)331-3138 Fx
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD (800)410-0585 Fx (727)796-0378 Fx (407)857-8247 Fx (352)360-0885 Fx (954)979-5211 Fx (352)622-7243 Fx
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9
1. Toilet Bowl Brush, Wiretwist, nylon fiber, 2" trim,
minimum head size 4-1/2 x 5", wood handle, overall 600 ea NOTE 3 NOTE 6 & 16 NOTE 9 NOTE 10 NO BID NO BID
length 19" 181 1.98 .98 1.02 1.49 1.68 2.09
BRU - 6217
Brand/Stock FLO - PAK #313 FLO- PACK 313 ABCO #00017 ABCO BH-12001 WILENS #350-7021 IMPACT #220 WILEN #J508017
2. Floor Scrub Brush, tapered handle, 10" hardwood
block crimped syn. fill 2" trim, Weiler #44438 or 120 ea NOTE 2 NOTE2& 3 NOTE 6 NOTE 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
approved equal. 3.60 3.9 459 1.40 3.18 5.79
ABCO # WILEN
BH16001 (brush) #M 108060
Brand/Stock FLO - PAK #193 FLO - PAK #193 WEILER #44438 WILENS #1002010 #001010
3. Hand Scrub Brush, pointed ends, 9" x 2-1/2"
hardwood block, 132 tuft rows white tampico filler, 200 ea NOTE 3 NOTE 6 NOTE 10 NO BID NO BID
minimum 1" trim 215 2.34 1.42 1.35 1.83 2.18 1.83
Brand/Stock FLO - PAK #277 FLO - PAK #277 ABCO #BH23002 ABCO #BH23003 WILENS #1601000 FLO-PAC#277 WILEN #1012000
4. Tapered Handle for Floor Scrub Brush.
Straight grain hardwood with clear lacquered finish, NO BID NO BID
one end round and other end tapered, diameter 1-1/8 120 ea NOTE 3 NOTE 6 NOTE 10
inch, 60 incheslong. 2.58 2.83 159 1.58 1.96 271 1.62
PROLINE BRU 125
Brand/Stock FLO - PAK #2003-5 FLO PACK 2003-5 ABCO #HL 90001 ABCO #01113 WILENS #M 109560 FLO-PAC#2003-5 WILEN #M109560
5. Dust Pan, 12" beveled edge, color: bronze, 200 ea NOTE 3 NOTE3 & 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rubbermaid #2005 NO SUB 2.07 2.23 1.99 8.28 2.14
Brand/Stock RUBBERMAID #2005 RUBBERMAID #2005 RUBBERMAID #2005 RUBBERMAID #2005 RUBBERMAID #2005




Bid Number: 12-01; Page2 of 3 Unisource Bay Indust. Supply Pyramid School Products Dade Paper Co. Jerry’s Vacuum and Reliable Custodial Colonial Paper Company, Premier Janitoria Supply AA Casey Co.
Janitorial Supplies, Inc M aintenance & Supplies Inc
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9
6. Broom, 80% corn/20% filler, 42" handle, min dia 700 ea NOTE 3 NOTE3,6& 8 NOTE 11 NO BID NO BID
of 1", min length 54" 3.42 5.25 3.13 3.60 4.03 4.45 3.10
Weight per dozen (Minimum wgt 25#) 251L.BSDOZ 28 LBS/DOZ 241.BS'DOZ 28 LBS'DOZ 26 LBS/'DOZ 28 LBS/DOZ 241BS, 4 sew, 56" OVL
COSTA FLO-PACK WILEN ABCO CRYSTAL LAKE FLO-PAC WILEN
Brand/Stock #7004 #11.0193 #E502024 #00312-NB #12121 #11.0193 #E502024
7. Push Floor Broom 150 ea NOTE 3 NOTE3& 6 NOTE 17 NOTE 10 NO BID NO BID
9.38 8.95 6.95 5.38 7.36 8.68 7.71
CRYSTAL LAKE FLO-PAC#208-18 + WILEN
LAGASSE #20218 + #10312 (broom) #2004-5 #M 104560
Brand/Stock FLO-PAK #208-18 BRU #20218/136 ABCO #1104 ABCO # BH11003 #12810 (handle) #F006018
8. Deck Mop 380 ea NOTE 4 NOTE3& 6 NOTE 12
3.90 5.90 3.82 3.35 3.77 3.77 5.60 3.64
Brand/Stock COSTA #00132 UNISAN #132C ABCO # CD5032l ABCO #CD5032l WILENS #A60516 ABCO #5032l WILEN #A605032 COSTA #00132
9. Heavy Duty Dust Mop Head Frame with 75ea NOTE 3 NOTE3& 6 NOTE 10 NO BID NO BID
handle, 5" x 24" size. 8.05 9.99 6.14 5.65 7.01 7.64 6.59
FLO-PAK ABCO ABCO WILENS FLO-PAC WILEN
FRAME #472-24 #BH2454 + 1406NB (handle) #801560 (handle) #472-24 #C702024
Brand/Stock HANDLE #2015-5 UNISAN #1424/1490 BH 31000 BH2452Y (frame) 5 x 24 (frame) #2015-5 (handles) #C801560
10. Dust Mop Refills 700 ea NOTE 3 NOTE3& 6 NOTE 10 NO BID NO BID
3.42 575 6.14 421 515 3.55 6.17
Tieor Snap TIE-ON TIE-ON TIE-ON TIE-ON TIE-ON TIE-ON SNAP - ON
Brand/Stock FLO-PAK #475-24 UNISAN #1324 TUWAY #CC24-5 ABCO #DM23524W WILKENS#C302034 FLO-PAC WILEN #C057024
11. Pad, Soap-filled (144/cs) 100 cs NOTE 1 NOTE5 NOTE1,3& 6 NOTE 13 NO BID NO BID
29.95 31.51 18.98 29.76 24.75 22.84 28.33
Brand/Stock BRILLO PUR #W24000 BRILLO ACS# SPO1PB CONTICO #C51210 BRILLO #W240000 BRILLO #W240000 CDW #240000
12. Trigger Sprayer & Bottle 100 ea NOTE 3 NOTES3, 6& 7 NO BID NO BID
.95 1.05 .67 .73 1.00 .92 .76
CONTINENTAL#922HL
IMPACT UNISAN CONTINENTAL CONTICO UNISON #32- (Bottle) IMPACT SMITH CONTAINER
Brand/Stock #5032 AB BOTTLE #32 /5910 #932B + #922HL 932CN + 922HL #5910-9 - (Sprayer) #5032AB #SCC21425
13. Trigger Sprayers ONLY 300 ea NOTE 3 NOTE3,6& 7 NOTE10& 14 NO BID NO BID
.57 .60 40 44 .56 .66 46
Brand/Stock IMPACT #5700 UNISAN #5910 CONTINENTAL#922HL CONTICO #922HL UNISAN #5910-9 IMPACT #5700 CONTINENTAL#922HL
14. Pot Brush, 8 x 10 tuft rows, short plastic handle 200 ea NOTE 3 NOTE3,6& 7 NO BID NOTE 10 NO BID NO BID
2.95 3.23 1.75 1.52 2.72 3.56
Brand/Stock FLO-PAK #623 FLO-PAK #623 ABCO #00003 CONTICO #C1502208 FLO-PAC#623 WILEN #1502208
EXCEPTIONS SEE EXCEPTIONS NONE NOTED NONE NOTED NONE NOTED SEE EXCEPTIONS NONE NOTED NONE NOTED SEE EXCEPTIONS
ote1: 120 /cs Note 4: Minimum Order (6) One Case $35.40/cs  Note 7: 100/cs Note 10: Minimm Order $400 Note 13: Minimum Order 20/cs Note 16: Sample did not meet

ote 2: With-Out Handle
ote 3: Minimum Order Case Quantities - 12

Note 5: No Case Pack Indicated
Note 6: Full Cases Only

Note 8: Minimum Order (item #6) 540/ea

Note 9: Alternate Bid

Note 11: Minimum Order $500
Note 12: Minimum Order 30/dz

Note 14: 250/cs
Note 15: Per telecom -Bob Worch

Note 17: Price did not inlcude handle (Per telecom -Scott Meltz)



Bid Number: 12-01; Page of 3of 3 Unisource Bay Indust. Supply Pyramid School Products Dade Paper Co. Jerry’s Vacuum and Reliable Custodial Colonial Paper Company, Premier Janitoria Supply AA Casey Co.
Janitorial Supplies, Inc Maintenance & Supplies Inc
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9
TO AWARD BY OVERALL 14,803.35 19,031.35 13,890.20 * 12,695.35 * 15,764.15 * 13,794.80 16,963.95 *1,383.20 NOBID
TO AWARD LOW BID BY LINE ITEM 2,394.00 -0- 3,525.50 3,240.35 -0- -0- 2,170.00 -0-
11,329.85
NOT ALL ITEMSBID ON
lote 1: 120 /cs Note 4: Minimum Order (6) One Case $35.40/cs ~ Note 7: 100/cs Note 10: Minimm Order $400 Note 13: Minimum Order 20/cs Note 16: Sample did not meet

lote 2: With-Out Handle
lote 3: Minimum Order Case Quantities - 12

Note 5: No Case Pack Indicated
Note 6: Full Cases Only

Note 8: Minimum Order (item #6) 540/ea

Note 9: Alternate Bid

Note 11: Minimum Order $500
Note 12: Minimum Order 30/dz

Note 14: 250/cs

Note 17: Price did not inlcude handle (Per telecom -Scott Meltz)

Note 15: Per telecom -Bob Worch



