Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Office

Susan Ferlita, Senior Buyer

(813) 247-8048

Bid Number: 12-99 R & R International
Bid Title: Telephone Equipment &
Equipment Repairs 2495 Enterprise Road, #201

Opened: 2/22/99 @ 3:00 pm Clearwater, FL 34623
Awarded: 4/1/99 - SF (Revised 4/27/99)
James Gilliand
Award Period: 4/15/99 - 4/14/00
(727) 669-3316
Page 1 of 4 -Part I (727) 723-0307 FAX

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD

Telecom Remarketing Corp. of
America

3401 E University Drive, #103

Denton, TX 76208-1044

Tim Money

(940) 891-6604
(940) 565-5002 FAX

Tampa Bay Communications

5408-B N 59 Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Linda Potter

(813) 740-8333, ext 228
(813) 246-4708 FAX

Alltel Supply, Inc.

6625 The Corners Pkwy.

Norcross, GA 30092

Nicholle Duvall

800-533-3161
(770) 446-0420 FAX

Communications Support Equipment

7792 Professional Place

Tampa, FL 33637

Mike Hawthorne

(813) 988-8909
(813) 980-6770 FAX

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1

2

4

5

NEW REFURB REPAIR

NEW REFURB REPAIR

NEW REFURB

REPAIR

1. Northern Telcom Meridian digital [} 130.00 55.00
telephone instrument, Model

2008, color ash

85.0000 s

NOTE 2

130.00 145.00 50.00

NEW REFURB | REPAIR

NEW REFURB REPAIR

No Bid

2. Northern Telcom Meridian digital 225.00 65.00
telephone instrument, Model

2008, with display, color ash

255.00

255.00 289.00 60.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

3. Northern Telecom Meridian 195.00 165.00 65.00

digital telephone instrument,
hands free, Model 2008HF, color
ash

200.00 225.00 50.00

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

193.00

255.00

4. Northern Telecom Meridian
digital telephone instrument,
hands free, Model 2008HF, with
display, color ash

235.00 65.00

280.00 325.00 60.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

135.00 125.00 40.00

190.00 50.00

200.00 180.00 52.00

295.00

No Bid

5. Northern Telcom Meridian digital 65.00 45.00
telephone instrument, Model

2009, color ash

60.00 * No Bid 45.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

285.00 270.00 52.00

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 60.00 40.00

6. Northern Telcom Meridian digital || 230.00 200.00 55.00

telephone instruments, Model
2616, color ash

250.00 275.00 50.00

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

235.00 200.00 60.00




Bid No. 12-99 - Page 2 of 4 - Part [ R & R International Telecom Remarketing Corp. of Tampa Bay Communications Alitel Supply, Inc. Communications Support Equipment
America
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 4
7. Northern Telcom Meridian digital || 305.00 275.00 65.00 310.00 345.00 - || No Bid No Bid No Bid
telephone instruments, Model
2616, with display, color ash
8. Northern Telcom Meridian digital || No Bid No Bid No Bid 225.00 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
telephone instruments, Model
3000, color ash
9. Wall mount telephone instrument, {f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 113.03 No Bid No Bid
analog, Model K-1500W-2, || Viking
specify colors available || K-1900W2
10. Northern Telecom Meridian wall || 55.00 25.00 No Bid 23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mount telephone instrument,
analog, Model 2554, color ash NOTE 3
11. Northern Telcom Meridian 1150.00 850.00 225.00 1100.00 1400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1250.00 795.00 200.00
Attendant Console, Model 2250
12. Norstar Telephone for key system No Bid 60.00 135.00 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 144.00 123.00 45.00
applications, Model M7208
13. Norstar Telephone for key system | 145.00 60.00 175.00 195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 183.00 150.00 50.00
applications, Model M7310 ’ ‘
14. AT & T Cordless Telephone, 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 160.00 No Bid No Bid
Model 9120, color gray #9130
The following are to be new
Nortel/Meridian replacement parts:
15. Handset, Part No. NTOCO9EA- 25.00 15.00 25.00 No Bid
35, color ash
16. Handset Cord, 12 ft., Part No. 2.50 3.50 1.25 No Bid
A0274243, color ash
17. Double Module Footstand, Part 40.00 20.00 25.00 No Bid
No. P0780235, color ash
18. 22 Button Key Expansion, Part 150.00 150.00 150.00 No Bid
No. NT2K22WA-35, color ash
19. 22 Button Key Expansion, Part 75.00 35.00 18.25 No Bid

No. NT2K22WA-35, color ash

\




Bid No. 12-99 - Page 3 of 4 - Part I R & R International Telecom Remarketing Corp. of Tampa Bay Communications Alltel Supply, Inc. Communications Support Equipment
America
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5
20. Power Distribution Plant, Part No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No. J2412AA-1
21. Rectifier, -48 Volt, Part No. No Bid No Bid 1950.00 No Bid
MPR50
The following are to be new or refurbished NEW REFURB NEW REFURB NEW REFURB NEW REFURB NEW REFURB
Northern Telecom PABX Hardware:
22. NT8D02AB 1200.00 No Bid No Bid 950.00 No Bid No Bid 1150.00 1000.00
23. NT8DO03AB ]} 1200.00 * No Bid No Bid 1050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 985.00
24. NT8D09AK |l 1300.00 No Bid No Bid 1350.00 No Bid No Bid 1370.00 1050.00
25. QPC578D 375.00 * No Bid No Bid 295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
26. QPC594C 600.00 * No Bid No Bid 350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 490.00
The following are to be new replacement
parts:
27. 48 VDC Regulated Plug-In No Bid No Bid 5.25 46.40 No Bid
Power Supply Sola 48V 10 Amp Wescom #841148
NO AWARD THIS ITEM.
28. Three twisted pair, Cat 5, 22 70.000M No Bid 83.50M 47.73M No Bid
gauge, PVC jacketed, silver 4 pair CMR000094
phone cable, 1000 ft. spool 4 pair, Cat 5, 24 AWG
NO AWARD THIS ITEM.
29. Modular Wall jack, AMP Part .15/ea No Bid .29/ea .09/ea .85
No.5-641337-3 00 or equal #5641337-3 100/pkg
30. Elevator Telephone, Allentel No Bid No Bid 389.00 No Bid 160.00 _
Model No. Gb31454-ADA or Allentel Viking K1500-EH4
equal f .
31. Digital Announcer, Bogen Model || No Bid No Bid 453.00 425.00
No. MT34, NO SUBSTITUTES Includes Item 33,
NO AWARD THIS ITEM. new mfgr part #Pro-4
32. Amplifier, 100 Watt, Bogen 375.00 No Bid 512.00 440.00
Model No. TPU-100B, NO
SUBSTITUTES
33. Digital Announcer, Bogen Model || 340.00 No Bid 453.00 450.00

No. HSR4, NO SUBSTITUTES

Includes Item 31,
new mfgr part #Pro-4




Bid No. 12-99 - Page 4 of 4 - Part I

R & R International

Telecom Remarketing Corp. of

Tampa Bay Communications

Alltel Supply, Inc.

Communications Support Equipment

America
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5
34. Mounting Bracket, Caddy Part 1.25/ea No Bid .89 .59 245.00
No. MP1 or equal #MP1 Arico-Caddy Caddy MP-1 MP-1 #723455
100 ea min order
35. CSU/DSU, Kentrox T-Serv II, 900.00 No Bid 750.00 1150.00
NO SUBS
36. Surface Mount Interface Box, 5.00 No Bid 3.45 3.21
color white, Ortronics Part No. Replaced by
OR40400028, NO SUBS OR40400049
37. Face Plate, single gang, color 3.25 No Bid 1.85 1.69 2.00
white, Ortronics Part No.
OR40300158, NO SUBS
38. RJ-45 Modular Jack, color white, |} 6.50 No Bid 6.00 4.06 6.00
Ortronics Part No. OR60950008,
NO SUBS
39. RJ-11 Modular Jack, color white, [} 9.30 No Bid 10.45 6.33 9.00
Ortronics Part No. OR60900015,
NO SUBS
Exceptions None noted None noted As noted As noted, manufacturer discontinued None noted
items, replacement part number shown
ESTIMATED TIME FOR DELIVERY 3 to 5 days 5 days 2 to 4 days 2 to 5 days 14 days
AFTER RECEIPT OF AN ORDER
CALENDAR DAYS.
WARRANTY STATEMENT Unused Equipment - 36 month Full 2 year warranty 1 year warranty on all equipment Manufacturer’s standard warranty One year on equipment and labor
warranty
Refurbished Equipment - 18 month
warranty
Warranty Repair Location 2495 Enterprise Road, Suite 201 Denton, TX 5408-B N59 Street Manufacturer’s location 7792 Professional Place Drive
Clearwater, FL Tampa, FL 33610 Tampa, FL
Contact Person James Gilliand Tim Money Linda Potter Nicholle Duvall Mike Hawthorne
Telephone Number (727) 669-3316 JL(940) 891-6604 (813) 740-8333 800-533-3161 (813) 988-8909

* Vendor withdrew bid on this item. No award, discontinued product, only available as a refurbished unit.
NOTE 1 - Tie bid, awarded to vendor located in Hillsborough County, per bid specs.
NOTE 2 - Tie bid, coin toss.
NOTE 3 - Vendor withdrew bid on this item. Awarded to next low bidder.




Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Office

Susan Ferlita, Senior Buyer

(813) 247-8048

Bid Number: 12-99

Bid Title: Telephone Equipment &

Equipment Repairs

Opened: 2/22/99 @ 3:00 pm

Awarded: 4/1/99 - SF (Revised 4/27/99)

Award Period: 4/15/99 - 4/14/00

Part I - Page 1 of 4

SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD

Consolidated Datacom

5711 Johns Road, Suite 1308

Tampa, FL 33634

Geoff Thompson

(813) 249-7900
(813) 249-7300 FAX

Martix Telecommunications

P.O. Box 2503

Jonesboro, AR 72402

Mark Morrow

800-628-7491
(870) 974-7491 FAX

A-1 Teletronics

1010 - 118 Avenue North

St. Petersburg, FL 33716

Trinna Simpkins

(727) 576-5001, ext. 134
(727) 570-2055 FAX

Telesource

1450 Highwood East

Pontiac, MI 48340

Tom Van Buskirk

800-525-4300, ext. 405
(248) 335-0470 FAX

NO BID ALL ITEMS:
Lighthouse Technologies Intl, Inc.
NEC Business Network Solutions
Overture Communications, Inc.

Tenn Mark Telecommunications, Inc.

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)

7

8

9

10

NEW REFURB

REPAIR

NEW REFURB REPAIR

NEW REFURB REPAIR

NEW REFURB REPAIR

NEW REFURB REPAIR

1. Northern Telcom Meridian digital

telephone instrument, Model
2008, color ash

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

132.00 98.00 42.00

135.00 125.00 68.00

No Bid 115.00 46.00

2. Northern Telcom Meridian digital

telephone instrument, Model
2008, with display, color ash

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

3. Northern Telecom Meridian
digital telephone instrument,

hands free, Model 2008HF, color

ash

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

4. Northern Telecom Meridian
digital telephone instrument,

hands free, Model 2008HF, with

display, color ash

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

223.00

197.00 62.00

245.00 200.00 73.00

No Bid 195.00 52.00

180.00 80.00

NoBid | 14200 | 46.00

5. Northern Telcom Meridian digital

telephone instrument, Model
2009, color ash

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

263.00 88.00

No Bid 295.00 52.00

6. Northern Telcom Meridian digital

telephone instruments, Model
2616, color.ash

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

59.00 45.00

No Bid 55.00 41.00

199.00 90.00

No Bid 205.00 78.00




Bid No. 12-99 - Page 2 of 4 - Part II Consolidated Datacom Martix Telecommunications A-1 Teletronics Telesource
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 6 7 8 9 10

7. Northern Telcom Meridian digital || No Bid No Bid No Bid 306.00 287.00 68.00 300.00 280.00 143.00 No Bid 270.00 88.00
telephone instruments, Model
2616, with display, color ash

8. Northern Telcom Meridian digital || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 275.00 No Bid No Bid 325.00 95.00
telephone instruments, Model
3000, color ash

9. Wall mount telephone instrument, || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 195.00 195.00 120.00
analog, Model K-1500W-2,
specify colors available

10. Northern Telecom Meridian wall  }| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.00 25.00 No Bid 39.00 39.00 35.00
mount telephone instrument,
analog, Model 2554, color ash

11. Northern Telcom Meridian No Bid No Bid No Bid 1132.00 712.00 327.00 1170.00 700.00 389.00 No Bid 850.00 250.00
Attendant Console, Model 2250

12. Norstar Telephone for key system [ No Bid No Bid No Bid 139.00 119.00 65.00 135.00 119.00 65.00 No Bid { 45.00
applications, Model M7208

13. Norstar Telephone for key system |f No Bid No Bid No Bid 185.00 159.00 80.00 185.00 165.00 70.00 No Bid 55.00
applications, Model M7310

14. A T & T Cordless Telephone, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid . 105.00 No Bid 60.00
Model 9120, color gray Al&d

9200,
gray

The following are to be new

Nortel/Meridian replacement parts:

15. Handset, Part No. NTOCO9EA- No Bid 23.00 20.00 15.00
35, color ash

16. Handset Cord, 12 ft., Part No. No Bid No Bid 1.00 6.00
A0274243, color ash

17. Double Module Footstand, Part No Bid 25.00 22.00
No. P0780235, color ash

18. 22 Button Key Expansion, Part No Bid 134.00 150.00 145.00
No. NT2K22WA-35, color ash

19. 22 Button Key Expansion, Part No Bid 38.00 30.00

No. NT2K22WA-35, color ash




Bid No. 12-99 - Page 3 of 4 - Part II Consolidated Datacom Martix Telecommunications A-1 Teletronics “ Telesource “
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 6 7 8 9
20. Power Distribution Plant, Part No Bid No Bid No Bid
No. J2412AA-1
21. Rectifier, -48 Volt, Part No. No Bid 3600.00 No Bid
MPR50
The following are to be new or refurbished NEW REFURB NEW REFURB NEW REFURB NEW REFURB NEW REFURB
Northern Telecom PABX Hardware:
22. NT8DO02AB No Bid No Bid 1178.00 878.00 1150.00 999.00 No Bid 83000 I
23. NT8DO3AB No Bid No Bid No Bid 768.00 No Bid 1000.00 No Bid 1155.00
24. NT8D09AK No Bid No Bid 1178.00 987.00 1200.00 1100.00 No Bid 1250.00
25. QPC578D No Bid No Bid No Bid 342.00 No Bid 450.00 No Bid 285.00
26. QPC594C No Bid No Bid No Bid 368.00 No Bid 557.00 No Bid 285.00
The following are to be new replacement
parts:
27. 48 VDC Regulated Plug-In 44.25 110.00 No Bid No Bid
Power Supply Tel-Labs 48VDC .25 Amp
28. Three twisted pair, Cat 5, 22 52.00/M No Bid No Bid 40.00/M
gauge, PVC jacketed, silver
phone cable, 1000 ft. spool 4 pair
NO AWARD THIS ITEM.
29. Modular Wall jack, AMP Part {INoBid No Bid No Bid
No.5-641337-3 00 or equal
30. Elevator Telephone, Allentel No Bid No Bid No Bid 180.00
Model No. Gb31454-ADA or Viking Red Elevator Phone w/handset
equal VIK-1500-E
31. Digital Announcer, Bogen Model || 267.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No. MT34, NO SUBSTITUTES Includes Item 33,
new mfgr part #Pro-4
32. Amplifier, 100 Watt, Bogen 320.00 378.00 No Bid 505.00
Model No. TPU-100B, NO
SUBSTITUTES
33. Digital Announcer, Bogen Model |} 267.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No. HSR4, NO SUBSTITUTES Includes Item 31,
new mfgr part #Pro-4




Bid No. 12-99 - Page 4 of 4 - Part II Matrix Telecommunications A-1 Teletronics Telesource
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 7 8 9 10

34, Mounting Bracket, Caddy Part No Bid No Bid No Bid

No. MP1 or equal
35. CSU/DSU, Kentrox T-Serv II, 885.00 No Bid 1255.00

NO SUBS Kentrox T-Serv I CSV
36. Surface Mount Interface Box, No Bid No Bid 5.00

color white, Ortronics Part No.

OR40400028, NO SUBS
37. Face Plate, single gang, color No Bid No Bid 4.00

white, Ortronics Part No.

OR40300158, NO SUBS
38. RJ-45 Modular Jack, color white, 5.00 No Bid 10.00

Ortronics Part No. OR60950008,

NO SUBS
39. RJ-11 Modular Jack, color white, 9.00 No Bid 15.00

Ortronics Part No. OR60900015,

NO SUBS
Exceptions None noted None noted None Noted None noted
ESTIMATED TIME FOR DELIVERY 14 days 7 to 14 days 2 days 3 days
AFTER RECEIPT OF AN ORDER

CALENDAR DAYS.
WARRANTY STATEMENT We fully support all manufacturer’s One year advance replacement 18 month warranty on all purchases 18 month warranty on all purchase and
warranties warranty on all refurbished and new and a 2 year warranty on all repairs. repair services.
equipment. One year repair and return
warranty on repairs. |

Warranty Repair Location 5711 John Road, Suite 1308 3423 One Place 1500 W Carroll

Tampa, FL.

Jonesboro, AR 72404

Chicago, IL 60607

Contact Person

Geoff Thompson

Mark Morrow

Trinna Simpkins

Tom Van Buskirk

Telephone Number

800-528-5900

800-629-7491 or
(870) 974-7734

(727) 576-5001, ext. 134

800-525-4300, ext. 405

* Vendor withdrew bid on this item. No award, discontinued product, only available as a refurbished unit.
NOTE 1 - Tie bid, awarded to vendor located in Hillsborough County, per bid specs.

NOTE 2 - Tie bid, coin toss.

NOTE 3 - Vendor withdrew bid on this item. Awarded to next low bidder.



