P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

BID TABULATION

PURCHASING SECTION
Carolyn Hendrickson

(813) 247-8054

4.(

Bid Number: 17-99 P Pitman Phot@Matrix Data Cq Laube Photoj§ Vidicomp M3 Media Global Kendall LTP (\‘/;I{ias
A Supply Distributor Consultant Associates Graphic Contjyc
Description: Video Printer Paper (@
K 8650 SW 132" 4&P.O. Box 368007 K998 WilcrestiSR®. Box 567 P.O. Box 1274
Opened: May 14, 1999 @ 3:00 P.M. / Miami, FL 3315@ Cleveland, OH New York, NY 200 Punta Gorda, 18034 Wiles R@a&8uffalo, NY 14]
Q Akron, OH 44@2Houston, TX Coral Springs, FL
Awarded: June 22,1999 thru June 21, 2000 Jeff Berger
A Lowell H. Elsg&/i Ogrinc Harold Laub@ Diana Klingbdq IAlan Meis Lisa S. Shoop
Basis for Award: Best Price for Accqgptible le
Product/Product Deemed Suitable FOF Intg PH 800-947-992(
use. I FX 800-947-9003 PH 800-395-274@ PH 800-833-197C8 PH 941-575-8500 PH 800-669-1009
T FX 440-238-4546 FX 330-665-396f FX 800-833-1960f8 FX 941-575-2727 PH 954-979-034FX 800-347-2421
Y b
Items Circled Indicate Award
DESCRIPTION 8
1. Ink cassette/paper sets (for 100 prints), co
video, Sony UPC-1010 4.25 X 5.75 A6 papey Kige. NP
SUBSTITUTE (5 boxes/case) boxes NO BID 286.52/CS 285.00/CS 249.00/CS 295.00/CS 63.75/CS 69.95/CS 335.00/CS
Case pack if changed from above 5/CS 5 PK NONE LISTED 5 BX/CS NO CHANGE 1 NONE LISTED
Minimum Order Requirement NONE 1CS CS 1CS 1CS 5/Cases 1
2. Ink cassette/paper sets (for 100 prjnts), cdlor
video, Panasonic VW-VS 100AP. (5 boxg¢s/case)
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID 360.00/CS 400.00/CS 335.00/CS 87.15/CS NO BID
Casepack if changed from above 5 5-CS (VW-VS100A
5BX/CS NONE LISTED
Minimum Order Requirement 1 Box NONE LISTED 1CS 5/CS
3. Printer Paper, color, 85" X 11" shee[ts, Type A, Part A-
SPW, Model 15T180. 5 boxeg NO BID 66.01/CS NO BID 224.00/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand/Stock# Mitsubishi ASP A-SPW
Case Pack 4 MC/4BX

Minimum Order Requirement

1

NONE LISTED




|ts, Type

4. Printer Paper, color, 85" X 11" shee| \, Part

SU3-11C3. NO BID NO BID 516.00/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand/Stock# SU3-11C3H

Case Pack MC/4 BX

Minimum Order Requirement NONE LISTED

5. Ink Sheet Rolls, three color, Part SU3-11C3H,

Model 15T160 (SUP00IV?2) 5 boxegd NO BID 151.68 NO BID 516.00/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brandsstock# _ NO AWARD Mitsubishi SU3IC3 SU3-11C3H

Case Pack 1/CS MC/4

Minimum Order Requirement 1 NONE LISTED

6. Printer paper, color, 4" X 5" sheetqwith ink

roller, Hitachi VY-SX50P (50/BoOXx) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 46.00/cs NO BID NO BID
Brand/Stock# Hitachi VY-SX50P

Case Pack 50/BX

Minimum Order Requirement 1 BX

7. Printer paper, black & white, roll| Type Il, high 5Rolls
density, Sony UPP-21HD (5 rolls/carton) NO BID 168.53/CS NO BID 172.00/CS 185.00/CS 63.75/CS 198.95/CS 179.75
Brand/Stock: Sony UPP216HD Sony UPP-216HD | Sony UPP216HD UPP-216HD Sony UPP2I6HD | Sony UPP 216HD
Case Pack 5/CS 5/Rolls/BX 5 Rolls/CS 5 PK/CS 5 5 Rolls/Box
Minimum Order Requirement 1CS CS 1CS 1CS 5 5Rolls

8. Ink cassette/paper sets (forr 100 pfrints), dolor

video, sheet, 4 X 5.5, Nikon NP-M100, Spny UPC{1010 or

equal. (4 packs of 25/box) NO BID 229.21/CS 285.00/CS 50.00/CS 295.00/CS 63.75/CS 279.80/CS 335.00/CS
Brand/Stock# Sony UPC1010 Sony UPC 1010 UPC 1010 Sony UPC 1010 | Sony UPC-1010 | Sony UPC 1010 | Sony UPC-1010
Case Pack 4Packs of 25/Box 5 CS 5 Packs of 100 5 PKS/CS 4 5 Packs/CS
Minimum Order Requirement NONE 1CS NONE LISTED 1CS 1CS 2 1 Pack

9. Print Paper, color, 85 X 11, photodraphic grade,

Kodak Ektaherm XLS, Catalog #861 4364. 107.24/CS NO BID 57.00 per Pack 124.00/CS NO BID NO BID 65.35/CS NO BID
Case Pack 2100shect boxes NONE LISTED 2/PK 100




Minimum Order Requirement I One Case I 1 Pack 2PK/CS 2
10. Three color ribbon, Xtralife medlia, Kodakat/#807-6135 New #807-6135
Ektatherm XLS, Catalog #873-3925 312.40/CS NO BID NO BID 158.00/CS NO BID 182.15.CS NO BID
Case Pack 2 Ribbons/Cs 1Unit 1
Minimum Order Requirement One Case NONE LISTED 1
11. Print paper, black & white video|Sony #UpPP 210SE UPP210HD Boxof5rolls
(100 prints/roll) NO BID NO BID NO BID 169.00/CS 115.00/CS 236.90/CS 195.95/CS 126.25
Case Pack 5 Rolls/Box 5Rolls/CS 10 Rolls/CS 5 5 Rolls/BX
Minimum Order Requirement NONE LISTED 1CS 1CS 2 5 Rolls
12. Ink cassette/paper sets, colorvideo, for P00 460.00/CS of 5
prints. Sony #UPC2010 NO BID 308.00/CS 90.00/CS 94.00/CS 920.00/CS of 10 110.00/CS 97.50/CS 104.00/CS
Case Pack 5PK/CS 5 200 Print/Pack | 5 or 10 Packs NONE LISTED 1 1 Pack
Minimum Order Requirement 1CS NONE LISTED NONE LISTED 1 PACK 1/CS 1 Pack
13. Print paper, black & shite, thermfl. Sony fUPP 110S UPP-110S/74 BoxoflORolls
(5rolls/box) NO BID 28.96/CS 100.00/CS 67.77/CS 100.00/CS 86.88/CS 113.50/CS 79.50
Case Pack 4/CTN 10 10 Rolls/BX 10 Rolls/CS 10 Rolls/CS 10 10 Rolls /BX
Minimum Order Requirement 1/CTN 10PK/CS NONE LISTED g Case of 10 Rolls 1CS 4 10 Rolls
14. Print paper, black & white, thermal. Sonjy #UPP 5 Rolls/BX
110HD. (5 rolls/box) NO BID 15.00/CS 80.00/CS 69.00/CS 95.00/CS 87.19/CS 87.45/CS 79.75
Case Pack 5/CS 5 5 Rolls/Box 5 Rolls/CS 5 Rolls/BX 5 5 Rolls/BX
Minimum Order Requirement 1CS 1CS NONE LISTED 1CS 1BX 2/CS 5Rolls
15. Ink cassette/paper sets, color vidleo, for|50 VPM P90 STA
prints. Sony #VPM P50 STA NO BID 26.15/CS 39.00/PACK 90 Print

50.00/CS 145.00/CS NO BID 48.99/CS NO BID
Case Pack 1/CS NONE LISTED NONE LISTED 5/CS 1
Minimum Order Requirement 1CS 1 PK NONE LISTED 1CS 1

No Bids Fro®outhern Photo Supply % Hour Happy Photo Inc
Suncoast Marketing

Unique Photo IN




