Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Office
June Rosamond, Buyer
(813) 247-8029

Bid Number: 19-99 P Chem Stat Data Supplies Nashville Paleveda Personal Pride-Bids Professional Universal A Business ProData
A Productions Inc Business Forms Printing Printing Srv Office Systems Business Forms FormsInc Products
Bid Title: Carbonless Forms Printing C
K 15 Greentree 5412-D PO Box 22302 3422 E 7" Ave 1225 Tamiami 2720-G Blair 12180 28" St N P O Box 2485 123 W Seneca P O Box 3147
Opened: April 1, 1999 / Circle Pioneer Park Trail - A2 Stone Road Ave
Q Blvd Nashville Tampa St Petersburg FL | Lutz Brandon
Awarded:  9/22/99 U W Dury TN FL Pt Charlotte Tallahassee FL Tampa FL
A NY Tampa FL FL 33716 FL
Award Period:  9/22/99 - 9/22/00 N FL 37202 33605 33548 33509-3147
T 11590 33953 32301 33612
Page 1l of 2 pages I 33634
T
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD Y
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
(1) 2Part NCRForms 2500 - 4999 M $17.70 $67.41 $57.00 $99.40 $101.20 $38.00 $66.00 $89.80 NO BID NO BID
5000 - 9999 M $17.55 $64.86 $45.00 $93.70 $94.00 $34.35 $50.00 $59.89
10000 - 19999 M $17.52 $62.32 $38.00 $88.02 $91.00 $30.70 $39.00 $43.49
(2) 3Pat NCRForms 2500 - 4999 M $28.51 $102.64 $83.00 $144.00 $148.40 $55.00 $95.00 $116.82
5000 - 9999 M $28.44 $98.57 $66.00 $134.60 $136.50 $50.20 $70.00 $79.92
10000 - 19999 M $28.31 $94.12 $58.00 $128.88 $126.50 $45.40 $57.00 $63.18
(3) 4Pat NCRForms 2500 - 4999 M $39.62 $146.26 $107.00 $192.00 $201.20 $77.00 $120.00 $142.77
5000 - 9999 M $39.41 $141.43 $87.00 $186.30 $192.80 $68.90 $90.00 $103.34
10000 - 19999 M $39.35 $135.14 $78.00 $180.45 $186.00 $60.80 $75.00 $83.14
(4) 5Pat NCRForms 2500 - 4999 M $70.70 $208.59 $126.00 $255.80 $238.00 $92.00 $155.00 $166.22
5000 - 9999 M $70.50 $197.77 $103.00 $250.00 $227.00 $84.75 $120.00 $124.13
10000 - 19999 M $70.39 $189.51 $96.00 $244.08 $219.00 $77.50 $95.00 $103.82
(5) Additional Discount on Column 3
20 - 29999 M 0% 5% 3.25% 3.5% 1% 5% No Info See Notes NO BID NO BID
30 - 39999 M 0% 10% 4% 5% 1% 8% No Info See Notes




Bid No. 19-99, Page 2 of 2 Chem Stat Data Supplies Nashville Bus. Paleveda Personal Pride-Bids Professional Universal Bus. A Business ProData
Productions Inc Forms Printing Printing Svc Office Systems Forms Forms Products
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
(6) Additional Charge for Graphic Service, No Info Given $10 per new $25.00 per $30.00 per hour | $25.00 per hour | $20.00 per page N/C $15 - $25
When required: page 8 1/2x11 sheet typesetting depending on
complexity
(7) Additional Charge for Serial No Info Given $15 per M $4.00/M sets $25.00 per $45.00 per M $10.00 per M $15.00 per order | differswith each
Numbering crash Imprinting: thousand Sets - numbers quantity
(8) Additional Charge for Marginal No Info Given No Charge No Charge No Info Given $18.00 per M $12.00 per M Red margins None
Printing: sheets-margin N/C
(9) Additional Charge for Back Printing No Info Given NoteLine Items- | $60.00 per order | $57.00 per $65.00 per M $10.00 per M $65.00 flat differs with each
(Per M): 2 sided thousand charge quantity
(10) Additional Charge for RUSH Orders: No Info Given No charge 2-3 days $100 add 15% $58.00 15% Depends on day Differswith each
3-5 days $75 needed item and
5-7 days $50 N/C - $50.00 quantity
Plus NDA
Freight
(11) Forms Provided Would Be: No Info
Stubbed at Top X X X
Glued at Top X X X X X

Notes:

Date Supplies Inc gave 2 sided figures for all
the catagories listed above on page 1.....

Professional Systems has an exception - the one
year price. Aslong asthe paper market
remains steady prices will be the same. If paper
goes up we get a 30 day notification. We have
no control over paper prices.

Universal Business Forms changed all the
quantity groups - see attached form.

BASIS FOR AWARD: Best Price, Acceptable Product / Service and Delivery




