
 Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office Purchasing Office 
P.O. Box 3371 Christopher G. Back, Sr. Buyer
Tampa, FL  33601 (813) 247-8023

 BID TABULATION

Bid Number: 3-01

Bid Title: Rainwear

Opened: 02/05/01 @ 3:00 PM

Awarded: 04/13/01

Award Period: 04/13/01 - 04/12/02
Revised 4/13/01
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SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD 
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Loveline
Industries

385 Gerard
Avenue

Bronx,
NY 10451

Phone: (718)
402-3500

Superior
Specialty Co.

265 Kappa Dr.

Pittsburgh,
PA  15238

Phone: (800)
245-4277

Martin’s
Uniforms

P.O. Box 7455

Tampa, 
FL 33673

Phone: (813)
877-0511

AMFAK, Inc.
Safety Equip.
Headquarters

3160 S.W. 22
St.
(Coral Way)

Miami, 
FL  33145

Phone: (305)
446-5766

Hamilton
Uniforms

P.O. Box 357

Crosswicks,
NJ  08515

Phone: (609)
393-4000

Oaks
Wholesale
Dist.

954 Florida
Avenue

Rockledge, 
FL  32955

Phone: (321)
636-3376

Bay Industrial
Supply

P.O. Box
5084

Clearwater,   
FL 34618

Phone: (727)
796-1397

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

1.  Plastic Rain Hat Covers, protectors for
Sheriff's straw lawmen's hat, sizes: Small
through Extra Large, Debco or equal

6-1/2 - 6-7/8  (Small)
7 - 7-1/4  (Medium)
7-3/8 - 7-5/8  (Large)
7-3/4 - Up (X-Large)

600
ea 4.10 No Bid All

Items
3.20 7.37 2.09

NOTE 2
3.50 No Bid

Brand/Stock # Not Provided Brody Stolyn,
Martin’s
#26901

Rainfair
#2600-2797

B&S Mfg. Album Haico
#CRC-1

2.  Raincoats, PVC on Polyester, color:
yellow, medium weight, sizes: Small
through 3X-Large, River City No. 200C or
equal

500
ea 16.60 6.25  S-XL

6.88  2X
7.50  3X

6.40 5.94  S-XXL
6.44  3XL

NOTE 2
4.50 S-XL
4.60 2X-3X

10.45

Brand/Stock # Samson By
Loveline
#9610

Rivercity -
Martin’s
#32400

Rivercity 200C HS #16 Series Natwear -
NW7OC 

LBD
9204AH or
9204
HC/AH/BHC



2a.  Pricing for Item No. 2 complete with
"CROSSING GUARD" screen printed on
back (Lettering to be  4 inch block letters,
color: black.)

.20/ea. 10.95 7.00 7.44  S-XXL
7.94  3XL

5.40 S-XL
5.45 2X
5.50 3X

12.45



Bid No. 3-01, Page 2 of 2 Loveline
Industries

Superior
Specialty Co.

Martin’s
Uniforms

AMFAK, Inc. Hamilton
Uniforms

Oaks
Wholesale

Bay
Industrial

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7

3.  Raincoats, yellow, 50" length with badge
grommets, sizes: Extra Small through 4X-
Large, APPROVED PRODUCTS ONLY
Approved Products:  IPCO Airweave 3976
                                 Blauer #26976
                                 Rainfair Cool Air
                                 Natwear #9073-60

400
ea

NOTE 1
18.80 49.80  S-XL

54.78  2XL 
59.76  3XL
64.74  4XL

NOTE 4
26.50 33.27 27.50 S-XL

31.75 2X-3X
35.00 4X

No Bid

Brand/Stock # Samson
Brand by
Loveline
#261-CP

Lacrosse
#26916

Rainfair Cool
Air 
#2200-8997

NOTE 3
Rainfair Cool
Air

Not Provided

3a.  Pricing for Item No. 3 complete with
"SHERIFF" screen printed on back
(Lettering to be 4 inch block letters, color:
black.)

.20/ea. 53.75
NOTE 4
27.30 34.27 29.00 S-XL

32.00 2X-3X
36.00 4X

No Bid

Exceptions None None None Orders over
$2300.00 is
FOB
Destination
otherwise
added to
invoice

None

Basis for award: Award to the lowest bidder meeting specifications by line item.

NOTE 1: Not an approved product
NOTE 2: Minimum order: 12 dz.
NOTE 3: Per telecon with Sonja Fenick - 4/11/01 Bidding on New Style No. 2200-2997
NOTE 4: Per vendor on 3/19/01 -  style bid on is no longer being mfg. - New Style No. 2200-2997

would be a cost increase: Line Item 3 would now be 36.00/ea.
Line Item 3a would now be 38.00/ea. - Per fax received from vendor on 4/10/01
Documentation is in bid file - Award to second low bid meeting specs.


