P.O. Box 3371

Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff’'s Office

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Office
Christopher G. Back, Buyer
(813) 247-8023

Bid Number: 35-99 P Brandon Janitorial | Dade Paper Peninsular Paper Reliable Custodial | Colonial Paper LL Clean Ragold All American Poly | Pyramid School Unisource
A & Paper Sup. Company Company Maint & Supply Company, Inc. Company Corporation Products
Bid Title: Janitorial Paper Products C
K 333 Falkenburg 6918 Presidents PO Box 1197 8034 Wiles Road, PO Box 310 32 Alpine Court PO Box 49224 40 Turner Place 6510 N. 54" 6511 N. 54"
Opened: 08/06/99 at 3:00 PM / Road Ste. D-408 Dr. Suite Street Street
Q 146
Awarded: 09/15/99 U
A
Award Period: 09/15/99 - 09/14/00 N Tampa, Orlando, Tampa, Coral Springs, Silver Springs, Voorhees, Los Angeles, Piscataway, Tampa, Tampa,
T FL FL FL FL FL NJ CA NJ FL FL
Part] - Pagel of 3 | 33619 32809 33601 33067 34489 08043 90049 08854 33610 33610
T
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD Y 813-681-5036 800-226-1020 813-621-3091 954-973-0078 352-622-7243 800-709-9775 310-914-9709 732-752-3200 813-621-7688 800-555-2282
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
1 50# Brown Kraft Paper Bag, 1/6 BBL, 250 19.65/bale 16.17/bale, 19.08/bale, S&G 19.61/bale, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.59/bale,Duro No Bid
500/bale bales Duro 1/6 50#, S&G/Equal, Duro, 1/6 BBL, Stone & Gaylor 1/6, 50#, 500/bale
500/ bale 500/bale 50#, 500/ bale 500/bale
2. Trash Can Liners, Polyethylene, 15" x 9" X 500 9.95/cs, IBS 7.85/cs, GP 8.37/cs, Fortune No Bid 8.23/cs, Essex No Bid No Bid 13.90/cs, AAP NOTE 1 17.19/cs, Tyco
23", Light Duty, 10 gallon capacity, high cases S242406N, 9 Ibs., | Plastics, 9.331bs, HDN 2433, 12.5 Plastics 15923, 7.89/cs, Inteplast Plastics, 16.512
density case wt. 17.05 |bs/cs +/- .5%, 1000 6 Mic, 15" x 9" x 6 Mic, 24" x 24", Ib, 6 Mic, 24" x #BR2424L, 9.38 17.05Ib, 1.5 Mil, #S242406N Ib, 11IMC, 24" x
bags/cs 24" bag 1000 33", 1000/cs Ib, .24 mil, 6 Mic, 15" x 9" x 23", 9.11b, 6 Mic, 24" 24",1000/cs
dimension, /cs. 24" x 24", IM/cs 1000/cs x 24", 1000/cs
NO AWARD THISITEM 1000/cs
3. Trash Can Liners, Polyethylene, 40" x 48", 1500 13.45/cs, IBS 14.00/cs, GP 12.80/cs, Fortune 15.09/cs, Lonestar | 15.54/cs, No Bid No Bid 19.49/cs, AAP NOTE 1 23.25/cs, Tyco
Clear Heavy Duty, 44-45 gallon capacity, cases S404812N, 16 Plastics, 18.14 HDN 4048, 12.8 #404817 EssexPlastics 4048, 25 1b, 75 13.49/cs, Inteplast | Plastics, 25.25 Ib,
high density, case weight 25 Ibs/cs +/- .5%, Ibs., 12 Mic, 40" Ibs, 40" x 48" Ib, 10 Mic, 40" x CLR, 17 Mic, 40" | #BR4048X, Mil, 40" x 48", #S404816N 20MC, 40" x 48",
250 bags/cs X 48" bag clear, 14 Mic, 48", 250/cs x 48", 250/cs 22.16 1b, .67 Mil, 250/cs 20.7 Ib, 16 Mic, 250/cs
dimension, 250/cs 17 Mic, 40" x 40" x 48", 250/cs
NO AWARD THISITEM 250/cs 48", 250/cs
4. 6" x 12" Polyethylene bags, 2 mil, heat 30cases | NoBid No Bid NOTE 2 No Bid 20.73/cs, Fortune No Bid No Bid 38.00/cs, AAP NOTE 2 NOTE 2
sealable, 2000/cs. 11.65/cs, Elkay Plastics Custom, 612, 20 Ib, 2 Mil, 20.99/cs, KCL 6" 16.53/cs, RD
20F-0612, 9.6 1b., 19.2 Ib, .002 Mil, 6" x 12",2000/cs | x12",15.11b, Plastics #450,
2mil, 6" x 12", 6" x 12",2M / cs 2 Mil, 1000/ cs .002 Mil, 6" x
1000/cs 12", 1000/cs

NOTE 1. 64 cs. per palet, Full pallets only
NOTE 2. 1000 per case

NOTE 3. 9 boxes per case
NOTE 4. 1875 per case

NOTE 5. 5000 per case

NOTE 6. Pricing good for (6) months only

NOTE 7. USDA Accepted

NOTE 8. Does not meet specifications




Bid Number 35-99: Part | - Page 2 of 3 Brandon Janitorial Dade Paper Peninsular Paper Reliable Custodial Colonial Paper LL Clean Co. Ragold Corp. All American Poly Pyramid School Unisource
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
5. 8" x 12" Polyethylene bags, 2 mil, heat 100 No Bid No Bid NOTE 2 No Bid 27.64/cs, Fortune | NoBid No Bid 48.64/cs, AAP NOTE 2 NOTE 2
sealable, 2000/cs cases 14.14/cs, Elkay Plastics Custom, 812, 25.6 Ib, 8" x 27.99/cs, KCL 8" 16.87/cs, RD
20F-0812, 12.8 25.6 |Ib, .002 Mil, 12", 2000 /cs x 12", 20.21b, 2 Plastics #K 24,
Ibs., 2 mil, 8" x 8" x 12", 2M /cs Mil, 8" x 12", .002 Mil, 8" x
12", 1000/cs 1000/cs 12", 1000/cs
6. Disposable polyethylene gloves, USDA 36 cases | 45.00/cs, Large 40.30/cs, NOTE 2 NOTE 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.98/cs, Pacific 49.90/cs,
approved product, resistant to most chemicals, Glove 10/10/100 PD125/DG601L 4.09/cs, Royal 10.50/cs, Impact Poly #2430-Large, | Workwell
detergents and bx, (10,000) Large, poly, RDGP, 10/100/bx | #8600, 1.25 mil, 10/10/100/bx #70850, 10,000/cs
acids, one time use, size large, 10/10/100 1000/cs
10/10/100/bx
7. 6" x 6" Polyethylene zip-lock bags, 2 mil. 75cases | NoBid No Bid 9.95/cs, Elkay No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.98/cs, KCL 6 31.06/cs, RD
1000/cs F20606, 7.5 Ibs, 2 x6, 8.1 1b, 2 Mil, Plastics #A25,
mil, 6" x 6", 1000/ cs .002 Mil, 6" x 6",
1000/cs 1000/cs
8. Toilet tissue, roll white 11 |b. 1-ply, 1000 2500 26.50/cs, 26.08/cs, 26.59/cs, 27.85/cs, Atlas 1 26.21/cs, No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.99/cs, Atlas 31.06/cs,
sheets per roll, 96 rolls/cs., Wisconsin #1636 cases 9610001, 96 Wisconsin Wisconsin #1636, | ply 96, 96/cs Wisconsin #1636, #1000 1-ply, 96 Kimberly Clark
or equal rolls/cs Tissuel636, full szed4%2x 4% 96/cs rolls/cs #5102
96/1M , 96/1M 96/cs
28.00/cs, Atlas
APM, 96 rolls/cs
9. Paper towels, multifold, unbleached, 9-1/8" 1700 10.85/cs, 4825 11.00/cs, Fort 9.89/cs, 10.97/cs, Putney 9.74]cs, No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.99/cs, Encore 12.28/cs, Von
width, 4000/cs, Wisconsin #1830E or equal cases Encore, 4000/cs James #233-04, Wisconsin 1830, P 200 N, 4000/cs Wisconsin #1830, #4825, 4000/cs Drehle #548K,
4000/cs 4000/cs 4M/cs 4000/cs
10. Paper towels, blue, 10" x 10", 2240/cs., 250 23.00/cs, 15.25/cs, KC 16.19/cs, NOTE 4 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.33cs,
windshield towels, Scott #5400 or equal cases 29390FT)J, #5122 Dri Tone Kimberly Clark 18.85/cs, Kimberly Clark
2240/cs Wiper, 10.5x 9.5- | 5122, 2240/cs Disposable #5119
1 ply, 16/140/cs Product 2240/cs
WT1000B,
15/125/cs
11. Seat covers, tissue, white, 1-ply, flat 50cases | NOTES NOTE 5. 15.90/cs, Hospital | 16.51/cs, 15.33/cs, No Bid 19.56/cs, Hospeco | No Bid 14.48/cs, Hedlth 15.78/cs, Hospital
10/250/cs, Shieldor or equal 32.70/cs, Hospeco | 28.50/cs, Hospital | Specialty HG- Rochester Rochester #HG-2500, Gards #HG2500, Specialties
HG-5000, Speciaty HG- 2500, 10/250/cs Midland #25RA, Midland #25RA, 10/250/cs 10/250/cs #HG2500,
20/250/cs 5000, 20/250/cs 10/250/cs 2.5M/cs 2500/cs
12. Paper towels, roll, approx. 8" 50 cases | 11.25/cs, 12.25/cs, 264-01 14.39/cs, Ft. 12.30/cs, Putney 12.50/cs, No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.59/cs, SNS 13.06/cs, Ft.
width, unbleached 12 rolls/cs 812SNS, 12/350'/ Fort James/ James 263-01, Paper #8350N, 8" Wisconsin #1910, #8125, 12/cs James 264-01,
cs Equal, 12/350/cs 12/8" x 350' x 350", 12 /cs 12/cs 12/cs
rolls/cs
NOTE 1. 64 cs. per palet, Full palets only NOTE 3. 9 boxes per case NOTE 5. 5000 per case NOTE 7. USDA Accepted
NOTE 2. 1000 per case NOTE 4. 1875 per case NOTE 6. Pricing good for (6) months only NOTE 8. Does not meet specifications




Bid Number 35-99: Part | - Page 3 of 3 Brandon Janitorial Dade Paper Peninsular Paper Reliable Custodial Colonial Paper LL Clean Co. Ragold Corp. All American Poly Pyramid School Unisource
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
13. Wiper towels, 9.8" x 16.4", Kimberly Clark 270 41.40/cs 32.55/cs 33.3lcs NOTE 3 NOTE 3 49.17/cs, TheLL No Bid No Bid NOTE 339.98/cs, | 34.45/cs
Scottcloth #5930, 100/bx, 12 bx/cs cases 39.45/cs, 35.53/cs, Atlantic | Clean Mercantile #36
Disposable Mills #420, 011, 9/ bx/cs
Products Allwipe, | 9x 16.5, 100/bx,
9% x 16 Y%, 9 bx/cs
100/bx, 9 bx/cs
14. Sanitary Napkins, Maxi-pads, 4" box, for use 1000 27.90/cs, Hosp 4- 16.28 cs/ Hospital | 16.55/cs, Hospital | 20.01/cs, 17.63/cs, Stayfree | No Bid 18.02/cs, Hospeco | No Bid 15.83/cs, Hosp. 17.32/cs, Hospital
in dispensers, Individual Wrap, 250/cs, Hosp cases 147, 250/cs Specialty #147, Speciadty 147, Rochester #4, 250/cs #147, 250/cs Spec #4-147, Specialties
4-147 or equal 250/cs 250/cs Midland #4, 250/cs #147A, 250/cs
250/cs NOTE 8
21.05/cs,
Stayfree #4,
36/bags, 12/
bag/cs, 432/cs

NOTE 1. 64cs. per palet, Full pallets only
NOTE 2. 1000 per case

NOTE 3. 9 boxes per case
NOTE 4. 1875 per case

NOTE 5. 5000 per case

NOTE 6. Pricing good for (6) months only

NOTE 7. USDA Accepted

NOTE 8. Does not meet specifications




P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillshorough County Sheriff’s Office

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Office
Christopher G. Back, Buyer
(813) 247-8023

Bid Number: 35-99 P International Interboro MHMS G&M Calico Industries, Bay Industrial Jerry’s Vacuum | Supply, Inc. Resource One Don Swann
A Shaving System Packaging Corporation Enterprises Inc. Supplies Distributing
Bid Title: Janitorial Paper Products C Corporation
K
Opened: 08/06/99 at 3:00 PM / PO Box 5547 114 Bracken 142-A Whiteker 1405 S. Adams 9045 Junction P.O. Box 5084 945 N 14" Street - | PO Box 339 11625 1012 Winding
Q Road Road Drive Hwy 27 Walsingham Rd. Oaks Dr.
Awarded: 09/15/99 U
A
Award Period: 09/15/99 - 09/14/00 N Garden Grove, Montgomery, Lutz, Tallahassee, Annapolis Clearwater, L eesburg, Talevast, Largo, Palm Harbor,
T CA NY FL FL Junction, MD FL FL FL FL FL
Part Il - Pagel of 3 | 92645 12549-2600 33549 32301 20701-2005 33758 34748 34270 33778 34683
T
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD Y 714-891-3369 914-457-2700 813-948-0504 850-224-4002 800-638-0828 727-796-1397 352-360-0234 800-749-7311 800-234-3676 407-293-6111
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
1. 50# Brown Kraft Paper Bag, 1/6 BBL, 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.50/bale, No Bid 22.50/bale, Duro No Bid 23.74/bale, Duro No Bid No Bid
500/bale bales Durol/6, 50#, 1/6, 50#, 1/6, 50#, 500/bale
500/bale 500/bale
2. Trash Can Liners, Polyethylene, 15" x 9" X 500 No Bid 15.84/cs, #INT- 8.00/cs, Inteplast, 10.00/cs, IBS No Bid 10.50/cs, IBS 8.55/cs, 11.12/cs, IBS 8.77/cs, Essex 8.46/cs, Interplast
23", Light Duty, 10 gallon capacity, high cases 2424-H,17.05 Ib, 9.31b, 6 Mic, S242406N, 9 Ib, 5242406 N, 9 Ib, Maintenance Pro, 5242406N, 91b, 6 | BR2424L, 9.38 S24246N, 9.3 Ib,
density, case wt. 17.05 Ibs/cs +/- .5%, 1000 11 Mic 24"x 24", 1000/cs | 6 Mic, 1000/cs 6 Mil, 1000/cs 9.11b, 6 Mic, 24" Mil, 1000/cs Ib, 6 Mic, 24" x 6 Mic, 24" x 24",
bags/cs X 24", 1000/cs 24", 1000/cs 1M/cs
11.90/cs, #INT-
NO AWARD THISITEM 2424-Reg,12.26
Ib, 11 Mic
10.48/cs, #INT-
2424-R,9.491b,,
11 Mic, 1000/cs
3. Trash Can Liners, Polyethylene, 40" x 48", 1500 No Bid 18.84/cs, #INT- 13.58/cs, 12.60/cs, IBS No Bid 14.25/cs, IBS 16.23/cs, 15.04/cs, IBS 16.74/cs, Essex 14.96/cs,
Clear Heavy Duty, 44-45 gallon capacity, cases 4048-SuperEx- Inteplast/N4048X S404812N, 16 Ib, 5404812 N, 16 Ib, | Maintenace Pro, 5404812 N, 16 Ib, | BR4048X, 22.16 Interplast
high density, case weight 25 Ibs/cs +/- .5%, Hvy, 251b H, 1851b, 17 250/cs 250/cs 221b, 17 Mic, 40" | 250/cs Ib, 17 Mic, 40" x S404817N, 20.7
250 bags/cs Mic, 40" x 48", x 48", 250/cs 48", 250/cs Ib, 17 Mic, 40" x
16.74/cs, #INT- 250/cs 48", 250/cs
NO AWARD THISITEM 4048-XH, 20.76
Ib
14.48/cs, #INT-
4048-H, 18.13 b
4 6" x 12" Polyethylene bags, 2 mil, heat 30cases | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
sealable, 2000/cs.

NOTE 1. 64cs. per palet, Full pallets only
NOTE 2. 1000 per case

NOTE 3. 9 boxes per case
NOTE 4. 1875 per case

NOTE 5. 5000 per case

NOTE 6. Pricing good for (6) months only

NOTE 7. USDA Accepted

NOTE 8. Does not meet specifications




Bid Number 35-99: Part Il - Page2 of 3 International Interboro MHMS Corp. G&M Calico Industries Bay Industrial Jerry’s Vacuum | Supply Inc. Resource One Don Swann
Shaving Packaging Enterprises Supplies Distributing
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
5. 8" x 12" Polyethylene bags, 2 mil, heat 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
sealable , 2000/cs cases
6. Disposable polyethylene gloves, USDA 36 cases | NoBid 42.50/cs, #INT- No Bid No Bid NOTE 2 No Bid No Bid NOTE 7 No Bid 38.63/cs, Tradex,
approved product, resistant to most chemicals, PG-LG, 39.64/cs, Calico 10.40/cs, Galaxy 10/100/1M/cs
detergents and acids, one time use, size large, 10/10/100/cs G4EMBCL, 370L,10/100's,
10/10/100/bx 1000/cs 10/100/cs
7. 6" x 6" Polyethylene zip-lock bags, 2 mil. 75 cases | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.49/cs, Calico No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000/cs 50132, 4.81b, 2
Mil, 6" x 6",
1000/cs
8. Toilet tissue, roll white 11 |b. 1-ply, 1000 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.20/cs, Atlas No Bid 33.50/cs, Atlas 26.50/cs, 35.29/cs, Atlas 33.52/cs, Georgia- | 25.00/cs, Atlas-
sheets per roll, 96 rolls/cs., Wisconsin #1636 cases 10001PLY 96, 1000 1 Ply, 96/cs | AtlasyAPMA4.5, 1000-1ply, 96/cs PacificTS603, APM1000, 1000
or equal 96/cs 96/cs 1000 sheets, 96/cs | sheets, 96/cs
24.50/cs, Short
Sheet, 3.8 x 4.5,
AtlassAPM3.8,
96/cs
9. Paper towels, multifold, unbleached, 9-1/8" 1700 No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.40/cs, Encore No Bid 13.00/cs, Encore 11.20/cs, 13.74/cs, Encore 12.64/cs, Georgia- | 9.94/cs,
width, 4000/cs, Wisconsin #1830E or equal cases 4825, 4000/cs 4825, 4000/cs Renature, 4000/cs | 4825, 4000/cs Pacific MK596X, Wisconsin 1830,
16/250/cs 4000/cs
NOTE 6
10.25/cs,
Wisconsin 1830,
4000/cs
10. Paper towels, blue, 10" x 10", 2240/cs., 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00/cs, No Bid No Bid 29.62/cs,
windshield towels, Scott #5400 or equal cases Advantage, Ply-1, Kimberly 5102
2250/cs
11. Seat covers, tissue, white, 1-ply, flat 50 cases | NoBid No Bid No Bid NOTE 5 No Bid NOTE 5 31.99/cs, NOTE 5 15.96/cs, Hospeco | 15.43/cs, Hospital
10/250/cs, Shieldor or equal 34.99/cs, Hospeco 39.50/cs, Hospico | Advantage, 41.45/cs, Hospeco | HG-2500, Specialities,
HG-5000, 5000/cs HG-5000, 5000/cs | 20/pkg/250/cs HG-5000, 5000/cs | 10/250/cs HG2500, 2500/cs
12. Paper towels, roll, approx. 8" 50 cases | NoBid No Bid No Bid 12.50/cs, SNS No Bid 13.50/cs, SNS 12.25/cs, 14.37/cs No Bid 11.73/cs,
width, unbleached 12 rolls/cs 812SNS, 12/cs 812, 12/cs Renature, 12/cs Wisconsin 1910,
12/350/cs
NOTE 1. 64 cs. per palet, Full palets only NOTE 3. 9 boxes per case NOTE 5. 5000 per case NOTE 7. USDA Accepted
NOTE 2. 1000 per case NOTE 4. 1875 per case NOTE 6. Pricing good for (6) months only NOTE 8. Does not meet specifications




Bid Number 35-99: Part |1 - Page 3 of 3 International Interboro MHMS G&M Claico Industries Bay Industrial Jerry’s Vacuum | Supply Inc. Resource One Don Swann
Shaving Packaging Corporation Enterprises Distributing
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
13. Wiper towels, 9.8" x 16.4", 270 No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.60/cs No Bid 49.25/cs, No Bid 51.64/cs, No Bid 34.44/cs
Kimberly Clark Scottcloth cases Kimberly 5930 Kimberly #5930
#5930, 100/bx, 12 bx/cs
14. Sanitary Napkins, Maxi-pads, 4" box, for use 1000 16.00/cs, SPC No Bid No Bid 28.99/cs, HOSP No Bid 33.50/cs, Hosp 4- 26.25/cs, 33.84/cs, Hosp 4- 17.03/cs, Hospeco | 16.66/cs, Hospital
in dispensers, Individual Wrap, 250/cs, Hosp cases 14270, 250/cs 4-14, 250/cs 147 Hospeco/4-147, 147 4-147, 250/cs Specialities
4-147 or equal 250/cs #147A, 250/cs

NOTE 1. 64cs. per palet, Full pallets only
NOTE 2. 1000 per case

NOTE 3. 9 boxes per case

NOTE 4. 1875 per case

NOTE 5. 5000 per case
NOTE 6. Pricing good for (6) months only

NOTE 7. USDA Accepted
NOTE 8. Does not meet specifications




