
 Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office Purchasing Office
 P.O. Box 3371 Christopher G. Back, Buyer
 Tampa, FL  33601 (813) 247-8023

 BID TABULATION

Bid Number: 5-00

Bid Title: Disposable Single Patient Use
Resuscitators; Adult and Infant/Child

Opened: 01/05/00 @ 3:00 PM

Awarded: 02/01/00 

Award Period: 02/01/00 - 01/31/01
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SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
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Conney Safety
Products

3202 Latham
Drive
P.O. Box 44190

Madison,   
WI          53744

Phone:
(608) 271-3300

Fax:
(608) 271-3322
Bobbett Marino

Amzco Surgical
Devices

200 N. Main St.

Freeport,
NY         11520

Phone:
(516) 378-3140

Fax:
(516) 623-7679
Jauaid Ratcher 

Ragold
Coporation

PO Box 49224

Los Angeles,
CA          90049

Phone:
(310) 914-3302

Fax:
(310) 914-9709
Ricci Jones

Alliance
Medical

8624 Route C.
P.O. Box 147

Russellville,
MO         65074

Phone:
(573) 782-4411

Fax:
(800) 425-5633
Michelle
Collins

Safe-Tex, Inc.

P.O. Box 1897

Marco Island,
FL           34146

Phone:
(800) 723-3839

Fax:
(941) 642-7279
Katherine Olis

Ambu Inc.

611 N.
Hammonds
Ferry Rd.

Linthicum,
MD         21090

Phone:
(800) 262-8462

Fax:
(800) 262-8673
John Florian

Ever Ready
First Aid

385 Union Ave.

Brooklin,
NY 11211

Phone:
(800) 325-4655

Fax:
(718) 387-9310
Eva Silberstein 

Aero Prod.
Corp DBA/
Medicmaster
P.O. Box 1707

Sanford,
FL 32772

Phone:
(800) 292-2376

Fax:
(800) 642-7895
Lew San Felice

Advanced
Medical

3701 W.
International
Speedway Blvd.

Daytona Beach,
FL 32124

Phone:
(800) 553-2677

Fax: 
(888) 553-2677
Julia P. Onesto

Laerdal Medical
Corporation

167 Myers
Corners Road

Wappingers
Falls, NY
12590

Phone:
(800) 648-1851
Bill Lyon

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10

1.  Ambu SPUR disposable resuscitator, Adult, to
include:  Mask, compression bag, patient valve, valve
controlled oxygen reservoir and tubing, integral swivel
on patient valve, valve connected to bag, support
strap, holder bag.  All components are transparent and
latex free.  For Adults and Children with body weight
of more than 66 lbs.  Training of instructors.
Ambu #420-011-000 or equal.
Specifications:
Max Stroke Volume: 1500 ml
Vol. of reservoir bag: 2600 ml 

1100
ea.

15.84/ea. 14.16/ea. 15.82/ea 13.80/ea. 13.45/ea. 14.22/ea. 12.31/ea. 11.10/ea. 11.69/ea. NO BID

Brand/Stock No.:
Ambu

#420-011-000
Ambu

#420-011-000
Medline

#HCS5701
Ambu

#420-011-000
Ambu

#420-011-000
Ambu Spur

#420-011-000
Ambu

#420-011-000
Ambu

#420-011-000
Ambu

#420-011-000

Comments: With (1) mask Packed 6/cs #1533 No
Manufacturer

Warranty;
Defect Only

Packed 16/cs

TOTAL LINE ITEM 1: 17424.00 15576.00 17402.00 15180.00 14795.00 15642.00 13541.00 12210.00 12859.00 NO BID
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Ambu SPUR

Pack/
Qty.

Conney Safety
Products

Amzco Surgical
Devices

Ragold
Corporation

Alliance
Medical

Safe-Tex Inc. Ambu Inc. Ever Ready
First Aid

Aero Prod.
Corp. DBA/
Medicmaster

Advanced
Medical

Laerdal Medical
Corporation

 Description of Item(s) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10

2.   Ambu SPUR disposable resuscitator, Infant/Child,
to include: Mask, compression bag, patient valve,
valve controlled oxygen reservoir and tubing, integral
swivel on patient valve, valve connected to bag,
support strap, holder bag.  All components are
transparent and latex free.  For children with body
weight of 66 lbs. or less.  Training of instructors.
Ambu #430-014-000 or equal.
Specifications:
Max. Stroke Volume:         450 ml
Vol. of reservoir bag:       2600 ml

1100
ea.

21.55/ea. 21.31/ea. NO BID 15.00/ea. 15.23/ea. 21.38/ea. 18.50/ea. 17.70/ea. 18.18/ea. NO BID

Brand/Stock No.: Ambu 
#430-014-000

Ambu
#430-014-000

Ambu
#430-014-000

Ambu
#430-014-000

Ambu
#430-014-000

Ambu
#430-014-000

Ambu
#430-014-000

Ambu
#430-014-000

Comments: With (3) masks No
Manufacturer

Warranty;
Defect Only

Packed 16/cs.

TOTAL LINE ITEM 2: 23705.00 23441.00 NO BID 16500.00 16753.00 23518.00 20350.00 19470.00 19998.00 NO BID

TOTAL LINE (1) AND (2): 41129.00 39017.00 NO BID 31680.00 31548.00 39160.00 33891.00 31680.00 32857.00 NO BID

Basis for award: Award to the lowest bidder meeting specifications by line item.


