Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL. 33601

Purchasing Office

Susan Ferlita, Senior Buyer
(813) 247-8048

BID TABULATION
Bid Number: 5-99 P Loveline Safety Safety Sportmaster J.H. Hamilton Safety Superior Carlwood Oaks Martin’s Central
A Industries Equipment Co. | Products Churchwell Uniforms Equipment Specialty Safety, Inc. Wholesale Uniform Public
Bid Title: Rainwear C Dist. Safety
K 385 Gerard 6507 N P.O. Box 1688 | P.O. Box 5000 | P.O.Box 1019 | P.O. Box 357 Rt. 2-1851 N | 256 Kappa P.O. Box P.O. Box
Opened: 1/6/99 @ 3:00 PM / Avenue Hamney Road Power Line Drive 1528 954 7455 Safeco, Inc.
Q Road Rockledge
Awarded: 1/11/99 - SF U Avenue
A Bronx, NY Tampa, FL Eaton Park, FL. | Pittsburgh, PA | Jacksonville, Crosswicks, Pompano Pittsburgh, Largo, FL Tampa, FL
Award Period: 1/15/99 through 1/14/00 N 10451 33615 33840 15206 FL 32201 NJ 08515 Beach, FL PA 15238 34649 Rockledge, 33673
T 33069 FL 32955
Page 1 of 2 1
T
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD Y
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 7 8 9 10 11 12
1. Plastic Rain Hat Covers, protectors for 600 | 7.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.43 No Bid All
Sheriff's straw lawmen's hat, sizes: Small ea Items
through Extra Large, Debco or equal
6-1/2 - 6-7/8 (Small)
7 -7-1/4 (Medium)
7-3/8 - 7-5/8 (Large)
7-3/4 - Up (X-Large)
Brand/Stock # Not provided Martin’s
#26901
2. Raincoats, PVC on Polyester, color: 500 | 17.80 3.99 S-XL 4.06 S-XL 6.88 S-XL 493 S-XL 6.98 S-XL 4.25 9.36 4.55 S-XL 5.00 S-XL 6.65 S-XL
yellow, medium weight, sizes: Small ea 4.152X 4.402X-3X 7.152X 5.192X 7.49 2X-3X 4.752X 5.502X 7.322X
through 3X-Large, River City No. 200C or 440 3X 7.43 3X 5393X 4.99 3X 6.00 3X 7.98 3X
equal
Brand/Stock # Loveline Rivercity 200C Rivercity 200C | Rivercity 200C | NS #16500 Rivercity Plastex 608- Rivercity Natwear Martin’s
#261-C or Rainfair Series 200C 800-size 200C #NW70C #32400
70802
2a. Pricing for Item No. 2 complete with 18.25 5.50 all sizes No Bid 5.93 S-XL 7.98 S-XL 5.50 10.61 5.80 S-XL 6.00 S-XL 8.90
"CROSSING GUARD" screen printed on 6.19 2X 8.49 2X-3X 6.00 2X 6.50 2X (12¢a
back (Lettering to be 4 inch block letters, 6.39 3X 6.24 3X 7.00 3X minimum
color: black.) order req)




Bid No. 5-99, Page 2 of 2 Loveline Safety Safety Sportmaster JH. Hamilton Safety Superior Carlwood Oaks Martin’s
Industries Equipment Co. Products Churchwell Uniforms Equipment Specialty Safety, Inc. Wholesale Uniform
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12
3. Raincoats, yellow, 50" length with badge | 400 | 29.80 28.15S-XL No Bid No Bid 28.69 33.21 S-XL No Bid No Bid 29.45 XS-XL | 27.50 S-XL. | 40.15S-XL
grommets, sizes: Extra Small through 4X- ea 30.40 2X 36.53 2X 31.752X-3X | 29.502X 44.172X
Large, APPROVED PRODUCTS ONLY 32.39 3X 39.853X 34.054X 30.00 3X 48.18 3X
Approved Products: IPCO Airweave 3976 33.854X 49.81 4X - 32.004X 52.20 4X
Blauer #26976
Rainfair Cool Air
Natwear #9073-60
Brand/Stock # Not provided | IPCO Natwear Rainfair Cool Natwear Rainfair
Airweave 976 9073-60 Air #9073-60 Cool Air
Martin’s
#26916 (M)
#26946 (F)
3a. Pricing for Item No. 3 complete with 30.45 29.40 S-XL No Bid No Bid 29.14 34.21 S-XL No Bid No Bid 29.90 XS-XL 42.40
"SHERIFF" screen printed on back 32.202X 37.53 2X 32.202X-3X (12ea
(Lettering to be 4 inch block letters, color: 33.60 3X 40.85 3X 34.504X minimum
black.) 35.004X 50.81 4X order req)
Exceptions Brand names | Must purchase | None None None None None None Minimum FOB Minimum
not provided in quantities of order of 50 Destination order
with bid 50 in coats on orders requirement
response combined sizes (combined over $2500, | on screen
per model sizes) for silk | less than printing
(item #) screening will be plus
freight

NOTE TO FILE: Item 3a awarded based on the cost for sizes S-XL, as these are the items with the heaviest usage.




