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P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Office

Susan Ferlita, Senior Buyer

(813) 247-8048

3" belt, Don Hume, Style D-407-V*

Bid Number: 7-99 Law Enforcement Harrison Uniform Qaks Wholesale OMB Police Supply | Don Hume Jones Equipment
Supply Distributors Leathergoods Co.
Bid Title: Leathergoods 2960 Edison 10376 Mastin
1814 Beck Avenue Avenue 954 Florida Avenue P.O. Box 351 P.O. Box 4708
Opened: 2/1/99 at 3:30 PM Overland Park, KS
Panama City, FL Jacksonville, FL. Rockledge, FL 66212 Miami, OK 74355 Hollywood, FL
Awarded: 2/9/99 - SF 32405 32254 32955 33083
Award Period: 2/15/99 - 2/14/00
Page 1 of 2
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6
1. Gunbelt, 3", Tiara finish with polished brass 1 41.22 41.75 No Bid No Bid 42.63
buckle, Mixson, Style 743 Min order 12
48 - 56 + 10%
58 - 60 + 20%
2. Polished nickel buckle ONLY, for Mixson Style | 5.00 5.50 No Bid No Bid 4.00
743 belt Min order 36 NOTE 1
3. Handcuff case, Tiara finish with velcro closure, 17.00 No Bid No Bid 17.60
for 3" belt, Mixson, Style HC-1 Min order 12
4. Belt keepers, Tiara finish with velcro closure, for | 3.75 No Bid No Bid 4.28
3" belt, Mixson, Style K-2 Min order 72
5. Handcuff case, plain black finish with velcro No Bid 15.56 30.30 No Bid
closure for 2-1/4" belt, Don Hume Style C304V
6. Badge holder, for large star badge, plain black 6.10 No Bid No Bid 6.22
finish, for 2-1/4" belt, Mixson, Style 103 Min order 36
7. Belt, plain black finish, 1-1/2" nickel or polished 13.35 13.50 No Bid No Bid 18.19
brass snaps, Mixson, Style 351 Min order 12
48 - 56 + 10%
58 - 60 + 20%
8. Holster, black clarino finish, for 3" belt, Don No Bid 54.26 102.50 No Bid
Hume, Style H738-SH*
9. Automatic Clip Holder, black clarino finish, for No Bid No Bid 20.04 37.85 No Bid




Mixson items must
be ordered
minimum 12 at one
time, except keepers
which must be
minimum 72.

BID NO. 7-99, PAGE 2 OF 2 Law Enforcement Harrison Uniform Oaks Wholesale OMB Police Supply Don Hume Jones Equipment
Supply Co. Distributors Leathergoods Co.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6
10. Pepper Spray Holster, black clarino finish, for 3" No Bid No Bid 16.53 31.25 No Bid
belt, velcro closure, Don Hume, Style C-309-V
(to fit Aerko Punch II M-3A 2 oz. canister, with
trigger delivery)
11. Pepper Foam Holster, plain black finish, for 2- No Bid No Bid 11.91 22.50 No Bid
1/4" belt, velcro closure, Don Hume, Style C-309-
F (to fit MSI MK-XIII 2.8 oz. canister)
12. Pepper Foam Holster, black clarino finish, for 3" No Bid \ No Bid 16.53 31.25 No Bid
belt, velcro closure, Don Hume, Style C-309-F (to
fit MST MK-XIII 2.8 oz. canister)
Exceptions Minimum Order None listed Minimum Order None listed None listed Minimum Order
Requirement - all Requirements Requirements - all

Mixson items,
except keepers - 12
pieces each item.
Keepers - 36 pieces.
Oversized belts: 48
-56+10%, 58 &
over + 20%

NO BID - Central Public Safety

NOTE 1 - Item 2 awarded overall with Item 1.




