
 

NOTE 1:   55 case min              NOTE 5: 25 case min    NOTE   9: Sample received 7/16/01    NOTE 12: 142 case min. for prepaid freight                NOTE 15: Cost is .0705392 per oz. 
NOTE 2:   60 case min              NOTE 6: 50 case min     NOTE 10: 36 case min. for prepaid freight and pricing;   NOTE 13: Min. order is 210 cases  NOTE 16: Cost is .06133 per oz. 
NOTE 3: 125 case min                                              NOTE 7: Not an Approved Product  Chase products can be combined to meet 36 cs.                    NOTE 14: 35 case min. order 
NOTE 4: Dilution ratio 1:4 (cost per gal. $0.68)             NOTE 8: Can also be leased #92013   NOTE 11: Does not meet specs.; is a liquid product 
300 cs. annually yield  - 4400 gals. of  solution            .    

  
   
  
   
  Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office             Purchasing Department 
  P.O. Box 3371              Christopher G. Back, Senior Buyer 
  Tampa, FL 33601              (813) 247-8023 
           BID TABULATION 

Bid Number: 8-01 
 
Bid Title:   Janitorial Chemicals  
 
Opened: July 16, 2001 @ 3:00 P.M. 
 
Awarded: 08/09/01 
 
Award Period: 08/09/01 – 08/08/02 
Page  1  of  2 - Part I 
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD 
AWARDED BY LINE ITEM TO LOWEST BIDDER 
MEETING SPECIFICATIONS 
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Theochem Laboratories 
 
 
7373 Rowlett Park Dr. 
 
 
Tampa,    FL      
 
33610 
 
 
 
Jeanne K. Wood 

Bay Industrial Supplies 
 
 
P.O. Box 5084 
 
 
Clearwater,   FL 
 
33578 
 
 
(727) 796-1397 

Unisource 
 
 
6511 N. 54th Street 
 
 
Tampa, FL 
 
33610 
 
 
(813) 246-7347 
Linda Cortez 

Dade Paper Co. 
 
 
6918 Presidents Dr. 
 
 
Orlando, FL 
 
32809 
 
 
(800) 226-1020 
Robert E. Worch, Jr. 

Peninsular Paper Co., Inc. 
 
 
5101 E. Hanna Ave. 
 
 
Tampa, FL 
 
33610 
 
 
(813) 621-3091 
Richard S. Clarke, Sr. 

Jerry’s Vacuum and Janitorial 
Suppplies, Inc. 
 
945 North 14th St.-Hwy 27 S 
 
 
Leesburg, FL 
 
34748 
 
 
(352) 360-0234 
Jerry David Hoffman 

  DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)   1  2  3  4  5  6 
 
1.   Mild All Purpose neutral cleaner, pleasant scent, PH 7.0 – 
8.0             

1000 
gals. 

 
NO BID 

 
3.42 gal. 

NOTE 1 
3.02 gal. 

NOTE 7 
3.32 gal. 

 
3.14 gal 

 
2.64 gal. 

 
      Brand/Product: 

  Theochem 0445 
Rinse No More 

All Star (Unisource) 
Liqui-Terge APC 

Midlab/ 
#GC532 

Theochem/  
Lacto 128  

Theochem/  
Rinse No More 

      Case pack:   Not Listed 4/1 gal 4/1 gal. 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 

      Dilution Ratio:   1.64 oz. per gal 1:128 oz per gal. Varies per Application 1:128 or 1 oz per gal. 1:64 oz. per gal. 

Comet - 23.50 cs. 
 
 
2.  Powered abrasive cleanser, general purpose - Comet, Ajax 
or equal                                                                                                                                                

400 
cs. 

 
 

NO BID Ajax - 17.62 cs. 

 
NOTE 2 
16.75 cs. 

 
 

17.94 cs. 

 
 

13.22 cs. 

 
 

12.58 cs. 

Comet 02255PG  
 

     Brand/Product: 

  

Ajax CPC 14278 

 
 

Colgate/Ajax #14278 

 
 

Ajax/#14278 

 
Theochem/  
Time Saver 

 
Theochem/  

Time Saver Cleaner 

     Case Pack:   24/21 oz. 24/21 oz. 24/21 oz. 12/21 oz. 24/21 oz. 
 
 

7.18 cs. 

NOTE 3 
6.16 cs. 

 
3.21 cs. 

 
5.24 cs. 

 
4.69 cs. 

 
 
 
3.  Bleach, chlorine, 5.25% 

500 
cs.  

 
NO BID 

1.196 gal. 1.026666  gal. .8025 gal. .873333 gal. 1.1725 gal. 

 
    Brand/Product: 

  Austin/ 
2069 KEM 

Austin/ 
Austin A-1 

Austins Bleach/ 
Austin A-1  

Austin/ 
A-1 

Austin’s/ 
Austin’s Bleach 

    Case Pack:   6/1 gal. 6/1 gal. 4/1 gal. 6/1 gal. 4/1 gal. 



 

NOTE 1:   55 case min              NOTE 5: 25 case min    NOTE   9: Sample received 7/16/01    NOTE 12: 142 case min. for prepaid freight                 NOTE 15 : Cost is .0705392 per oz  
NOTE 2:   60 case min              NOTE 6: 50 case min     NOTE 10: 36 case min. for prepaid freight and pricing;   NOTE 13: Min. order is 210 cases                 NOTE 16: Cost is .06133 per oz. 
NOTE 3: 125 case min                                              NOTE 7: Not an Approved Product                    Chase products can be combined to meet 36 cs.                   NOTE 14: 35 case min. order 
NOTE 4: Dilution ratio 1:4 (cost per gal. $0.68)             NOTE 8: Can also be leased #92013   NOTE 11: Does not meet specs.; is a liquid product 
300 cs. annually yield  - 4400 gals. of  solution     
 

 

Page 2 of  2, Bid # 8-01 - Part I  Theochem Laboratories Bay Industrial Supplies Unisource Dade Paper Co. Peninsular Paper Co., Inc. Jerry’s Vacuum & Janitorial 

        DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)  1  2 3 4 5 6 
 
4.  Glass Cleaner, general purpose, ammoniated base, non- 
aerosol/streaking 

1100 
cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
16.18 cs. 

NOTE 4 
10.80 cs. 

 
11.20 cs. 

 
7.95 cs. 

 
7.98 cs. 

 
     Brand/Product: 

  Theochem 597 Shine O Glass All-Star (Unisource)/ 
Blue-X U17956 

Midlab/ 
GC520 

Theochem/  
Mirror Image 

Theochem/  
Mirror Image 

     Case Pack:    6/1 gal. 4/1 gal  4/1 gal. 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 
 
5.  Hand cleaner, gel type, rinses clean with water, PH 8.0-
9.0, Go-Jo pumice or equal 

150 
cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
51.18/cs. 

NOTE 5 
36.91/cs. 

 
25.80/cs. 

 
35.25 cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
    Brand/Product:   

Go-Jo/ 
 #1135 

GoJo/ 
 Pumice #1135 

NOTE 7 , Kimberly Clark/ 
#91757 Sanituff w/grit 

GoJo/ 
Original 1135-6  

    Case pack:   6/4.5# 6/4.5# 2/3.5L 6/4.5#  
  
   Cost for dispensers:    

12.62 ea. 
 

No Charge 
NOTE 8 
10.35 ea. 

 
No Charge with Soap 

 

 
6.  Isopropyl Alcohol Gel, topical hand sanitizer, Go -Jo Purell 
or equal  

300 
cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
36.87 cs. 

NOTE 6 
26.18 cs. 

 
29.28 cs. 

 
24.95 cs. 

NOTE 12 
19.50 cs. 

 
 
     Brand/Product: 

   
 

Go Jo #9651246 

 
 

GoJo/ Purell #9651-24 

NOTE 7 
Kimberly Clark/ 

#93063 Sani-Fresh 

 
GoJo/  
Purell   

 
Kutol/ 

Instant Hand Sanitizer 

     Case pack:   24/4 oz. 24/4.25 oz. 24/4oz 24/4.25 oz 24/4 oz. 

 
7.  Phenol Disinfectant & deodorant aerosol spray 

275 
cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
32.50 cs. 

NOTE 6 
17.63 cs. 

 
25.48 cs. 

 
16.75 cs. 

 
16.22 cs. 

 
     Brand/Product: 

  Chase/ 
 #5160 

All-Star (Unisource)/ 
SpraFect U15861 

Chase/ 
Phenol Disinfectant 

Theochem/  
Envisol 

Theochem/  
Envisol 

     Case pack:   12/20 oz. 12/20 oz 12/16 oz 12/20 oz. 12/20 oz 

     Fluid ounces per can:   20 oz. 20 oz. 16 oz. 20 oz. 20 oz - Net 15 oz. 
 
8.  Furniture Polish, aerosol, with lemon oil, Theochem 
Lemon Glo or equal 

100 
cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
28.75 cs. 

NOTE 5 & 16 
14.72 cs. 

 
25.60 cs. 

 
17.19 cs. 

 
16.22 cs. 

 
    Brand/Product: 

   
Theochem #2090 

All-Star (Unisource) 
Super Shine U17566 

Midlab/ 
Lemon Oil Furniture Polish 

Theochem/  
Lemon Bright 

Theochem/  
Lemon Bright 

    Case pack:   12/20 oz. 12/20 oz 12/20 oz. 12/20 oz. 12/20 oz 

    Fluid ounces per can:   20 oz 20 oz - Net 19 oz. 20 oz. 20 oz. 20 oz. - Net 15 oz. 

EXCEPTIONS:   NO YES NO NO YES 

Addendum No. 1:    NO YES NO NO YES 
     

   



 

NOTE 1:   55 case min              NOTE 5: 25 case min    NOTE   9: Sample received 7/16/01    NOTE 12: 142 case min. for prepaid freight                NOTE 15: Cost is .0705392 per oz. 
NOTE 2:   60 case min              NOTE 6: 50 case min     NOTE 10: 36 case min. for prepaid freight and pricing;   NOTE 13: Min. order is 210 cases  NOTE 16: Cost is .06133 per oz. 
NOTE 3: 125 case min                                              NOTE 7: Not an Approved Product  Chase products can be combined to meet 36 cs.                    NOTE 14: 35 case min. order 
NOTE 4: Dilution ratio 1:4 (cost per gal. $0.68)             NOTE 8: Can also be leased #92013   NOTE 11: Does not meet specs.; is a liquid product 
300 cs. annually yield  - 4400 gals. of  solution            .    

  Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office             Purchasing Department 
  P.O. Box 3371               Christopher G. Back, Senior Buyer 
  Tampa, FL  33601               (813) 247-8023 

Bid Number: 8-01 
 
Bid Title:   Janitorial Chemicals  
 
Opened: July 16, 2001 @ 3:00 P.M. 
 
Awarded: 08/09/01 
 
Award Period: 08/09/01 – 08/08/02 
Page  1 of  2 -  Part II 
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD 
AWARDED BY LINE ITEM TO LOWEST BIDDER  
MEETING SPECIFICATIONS  
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Jerry’s Vacuum and Janitorial 
 
 
945 North 14th Street - Hwy 27  
 
 
Leesburg, FL 
 
 
34748 
 
 
ALTERNATE BID 

Colonial Paper Company. 
 
 
P.O. Box 310 
 
 
Silver Springs, FL 
 
 
33489-0310 
 
(352) 622-4171 
Hugh D. Price 

AFP Industries, Inc. 
 
 
4436 SW 74th Ave. 
 
 
Miami, FL 
 
 
33155 
 
(800) 962-4041 
Vivian C. Castellanos 

Pyramid School Products 
 
6510 North 54th Street 
 
 
 
Tampa, FL 
 
 
33610-1908 
 
(813) 621-7688 - Fax 
Kenneth D. Miller 

  

        DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)   7  8  9  10  11  12 

1.  Mild All Purpose neutral cleaner, pleasant scent, PH 7.0 - 
8.0 

1000  
gals. 

 
2.97 gal. 

 
3.65 gal. 

 
2.98 gal. 

 
2.96 gal. 

  

 
    Brand/Product: 

 Theochem/  
Lacto 128 

Pecks/ 
Neutrakleen #582G01-4 

Theochem/  
Lacto 128 

Theochem/  
Lacto #128 

  

    Case pack:  4/1 gal Not Listed 4/1 gal. 4/1 gal.   

   Dilution Ratio: 
 

1:128 1:512 or 1/4 oz. 1 oz. per gal. 1 oz. per gal.   
 
2.   Powered abrasive cleaner, general purpose  - Comet, 
Ajax, or equal 

400  
cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
20.31 cs. 

 
12.58 cs. 

 
12.50 cs. 

  

 
     Brand/Product:   

Comet/ 
#PGCOM 

Theochem/  
Time Saver Cleanser 

Theochem/  
Time Saver   

 
    Case pack: 

   
24/21 oz 

 
24/21 oz. 

 
24/21 oz. 

  

 
 

NO BID 

 
 

5.33 cs. 

 
 

NO BID 

NOTE 7 &13 
5.98 cs. 

 
 
 
3. Bleach, chlorine, 5.25 %  

500 
cs  

  
.888333 gal. 

 
 .996666 gal. 

  

 
   Brand/Product: 

  Austin’s /  
#372 A-1 

 Sunbelt Chemicals/ 
5 

  

   Case Pack:   6/1 gal      6/1 gal.   



 

NOTE 1:   55 case min              NOTE 5: 25 case min    NOTE   9: Sample received 7/16/01    NOTE 12: 142 case min. for prepaid freight                      NOTE 15: Cost is .0705392 per oz             
NOTE 2:   60 case min              NOTE 6: 50 case min     NOTE 10: 36 case min. for prepaid freight and pricing;   NOTE 13: Min. order is 210 cases      NOTE 16: Cost is .06133 per oz. 
NOTE 3: 125 case min                                              NOTE 7: Not an Approved Product                    Chase products can be combined to meet 36 cs.                   NOTE 14: 35 case min. order 
NOTE 4: Dilution ratio 1:4 (cost per gal. $0.68)             NOTE 8: Can also be leased #92013   NOTE 11: Does not meet specs.; is a liquid product 
300 cs. annually yield  - 4400 gals. of  solution            .   

 
Page 2 of  2, Bid #8-01 - Part II  Jerry’s Vacuum Janitorial Colonial Paper Company AFP Industries, Inc. Pyramid School Products   

        DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S)  7 8 9 10   
 
4.   Glass Cleaner, general purpose, ammoniated base, non-
aerosol/streaking 

1100  
cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
14.06 cs. 

 
7.78 cs. 

 
7.75 cs. 

  

 
     Brand/Product: 

  Peck’s #500811G01-6/ 
Pepco 811 

Theochem/  
Mirror Image 

Theochem #1277/ 
Mirror Image 

  

     Case Pack:    6/1 gal 4/1 gal. 4/1 gal.   
 
5.  Hand cleaner, gel type, rinses clean with water,   PH 8.0-
9.0, Go- Jo pumice or equal 

150  
cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
36.08 cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
39.99 cs. 

  

 
     Brand/Product: 

  Go-Jo #GJ1111/  
Pumice Hand Cleaner 

  
Go-Jo 1135 

  

    Case Pack:   6/4.5#  6.45#   
    Cost for Dispensers: 

  
15.00 ea.  4.99 ea. 

  
 
6.   Isopropyl Alcohol Gel, topical hand sanitizer, Go-Jo 
Purell or equal 

300 
cs. 

NOTE 7 & 12 
19.00 cs. 

 
27.00 cs. 

 
NO BID 

 
28.59 cs. 

  

     Brand/Product: 
 

NOTE 9  Inopak Ltd./  Dermagel Go-Jo #9651-24/ 
Purell  

 
Go-Jo #9651   

      Case Pack  24/4 oz. 24/4 oz.  24/4.25 oz.   

 
7.   Phenol Disinfectant & deodorant aerosol spay 

275 
 cs. 

 NOTE 10 
   22.98 cs. 

NOTE 7 & 11 
15.16 cs. 

 
16.28 cs. 

NOTE 14 
15.69 cs. 

  

 
      Brand/Product: 

 Chase/ 
Phenol Disinfectant 

ABC #LA514-4/ 
Phenolic Disinfectant 

Theochem/  
Envisol 

Chase #4104 (Champion)/ 
Spray-Pac 

  

      Case Pack:  12/16 oz. 4/1 gal. 12/20 oz. 12/20 oz.   

      Fluid ounce per can:  16 oz 4/128 oz. 20 oz. - 15 oz. net 20 oz. - 16.5 oz. net   
 
8.   Furniture Polish, aerosol, with lemon oil, Theochem 
Lemon Glo or equal 

100  
cs. 

NOTE 10 & 15 
14.39 cs. 

NOTE 7 & 11 
19.09 cs 

 
16.48 cs.  

NOTE 14 
14.97 cs. 

  

 
     Brand/Product:  

 Chase/ 
Spray Pak Furniture Polish 

ABC #LA73/ 
Lemon Oil Furn. Polish  

Theochem/  
Lemon Bright 

Chase #4109 (Champion)/ 
Spray-Pac 

  

     Case Pack:  12/17 oz. 12/32 oz. 12/20 oz. 12/20 oz.   

     Fluid ounces per can:  17 oz. 32 oz. 20 oz. - 16 oz. net 20 oz. - 17 oz. net   

EXCEPTIONS:   YES NO NO YES   

Addendum No. 1:  YES YES NO NO   

    


