Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL. 33601

Purchasing Office
Susan Ferlita, Senior Buyer
(813) 247-8048

BID TABULATION
Bid Number: 8-99 P Oaks Wholesale Dist. Martin’s Uniform OMB Police Supply Central Public Safety Jones Equipment Co.
A
Bid Title: Uniform Brass C 954 Florida Avenue P.O. Box 7455 10376 Mastin 3810-A Osborne Avenue P.O. Box 4708
K
Opened: 2/9/99 @ 3:30 PM / Rockledge, FL 32955 Tampa, FL 33673 Overland Park, KS 66212 | Tampa, FL 33614 Hollywood, FL 33083
Q
Awarded: 2/11/99 - SF U
A
Award Period: 2/22/99 - 2/21/00 N
T
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T
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD Y
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5
Rhodium Gold Rhodium Gold Rhodium Gold Rhodium Gold
1. Collar Insignia, Clutch Back, 1/2" 3.17/ea 3.17/ea 3.88/ea 3.88/ea 3.95/ea 3.95/ea 2.19/ea 2.19/ea
Blackinton Style No. 5 to read
"H.C.S." Note 3 Note 3
2. Collar Insignia, Clutch Back, 1/2" 3.80/ea 3.88/ea 3.88/ea 3.95/ea 3.95/ea 4.32/ea 4.32/ea
Blackinton Style No. 5 in three
(3) letter configurations, to Note 2 Note 2 Note 3 Note 3
include (but not limited to) the
following: "C.M.T.", "E.R.T.",
"UR.T.", "C.AL", "E.T.O.",
"T.H.I.", ||K_9n
3. Insignia, Clutch Back, 7/16" Plain 5.50/ea 5.50/ea 8.41/ea 8.41/ea 5.74/ea 5.74/ea 5.97/ea 5.97/ea
Wheel Center, Winged Wheel,
Blackinton No. A 1101 Note 2 Note 2 Note 4 Note 4
** Awarded on a coin toss for a tie bid.
4. Insignia, Motormen's Wheel, 6.50/ea 6.50/ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15/16" Clutch Back, Ga-Rel No.
1618 Note 1 Note 1

NOTE 1 - Minimum order 24 pieces.
NOTE 2 - Minimum order 12 pieces.

NOTE 3 - Must be ordered in even numbers, minimum order 14 pieces each finish.
NOTE 4 - Minimum order 7 pieces each finish.



Bid No. 8-99, Page 2 of 2 Oaks Wholesale Martin’s Uniform OMB Police Supply Central Public Safety Jones Equipment Co.
Distributors
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 5
5. Badges, Full Color State Seal, Large Small Large Small Large Small Large Small
Sheriff's Green Lettering, Flat
Style (Not Curved), Pin Back (1-
3/4" Pin), Half Ball on Star Point,
Blackinton B1753 Large,
Blackinton B1752 Small ‘
Rhodium Plate: | 12a 11.05 11.00 8.50 10.15 8.25 10.17 8.24
Deputy, Corporal, Crossing
Guard or Detective
Gold Plate: 12.43 11.05 11.00 8.50 10.15 8.25 10.17 8.24
Sergeant, Lieutenant, Captain,
Major, Colonel or Sheriff
6. Badges, Plain State Seal, Large Small Large Small Large Small Large Small
Sheriff's Green Lettering, Flat
Style (Not Curved), Pin Back (1-
3/4" Pin), Half Ball on Star Point,
Blackinton B1753 Large,
Blackinton B1752 Small
Rhodium Plate: | 1243 11.05 11.00 8.50 10.15 8.25 10.17 8.24
Reserve II or Parking
Enforcement
Gold Plate: 1243 11.05 11.00 8.50 10.15 8.25 10.17 8.24
Reserve II or Parking
Enforcement
Nickel Brass Nickel Brass Nickel Brass Nickel Brass
7. Whistles, Acme Thunderer 60-1/2 No Bid No Bid 3.68 3.68 No Bid No Bid \ 3.24 3.54
8. Spare Clutch Back Fasteners, No Bid .07/ea 7.50/C .08/ea
Brass Finish
Exceptions Minimum order None Noted None Noted None Noted Minimum order
requirements requirements.
Delivery - 45 days not a
problem except when
Blackinton closes 2 weeks
in July. A delay may be
expected on orders caught
in that time frame.
NO BIDS - SA-SO Company Security Supply Law Enforcement Supply

NOTE 1 - Minimum order 24 pieces.
NOTE 2 - Minimum order 12 pieces.

NOTE 3 - Must be ordered in even numbers, minimum order 14 pieces each finish.
NOTE 4 - Minimum order 7 pieces each finish.




