Hillsborough County Sheriff’s Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

BID TABULATION

Purchasing Department
Rosalyn Mcintosh., Buyer
(813) 247-8023

NOTE 2.
NOTE 3.

50 case minimum.
100 case minimum.

NOTE 5. 150 case minimum.

NOTE 6. Not an approved product.

NOTE 8. 35 case minimum.
NOTE 9. 15 case minimum.

NOTE 11. 36 case minimum.

NOTE 12. 96 case minimum.

Bid Number: 9-99 P Bay Industrial Industrial Chemical Peninsular Péper Osceola Supply Maintenance Warehouse American Chemical
A Supplies Specialist .
Bid Title: Janitorial Chemicals C : \
K - .
Opened: March 25, 1999 / P.O. Box 5084 1012 Woodcrest Ave P.O.Box 1197 495 Fortune Bivd. 9208 Palm River Rd 1775 5" Ave North
Q ~ o Suite 305
Awarded: April 6, 1999 - RM u Clearwater, FL 34618 Clearwater, FL 33756 Tampa, FL 33501 Havana, FL 32333 Tampa, FL 33619 St. Petersburg, FL 33713
A *
Award Period: 4/12/99-4/11/00 N o
T William Portman Sandra Dohn Richard Ciarﬁe, Jr - | Robbin Wiseman Suzanne Gomez Scoft Zirkie
Page 1 of 3 Partl |
T (727) 796-1397 Ph (800) 236-0310 Ph (813) 621-3091 Ph | (800) 562-0292 Ph (813) 335-1244 Ph (?27’) 822-8151 Ph
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD. Y (727) 796-0378 Fx (727) 446-2165 Fx (850) 580-8001 Fx (800) 859-8889 Fx
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5
1000 NOTE 2 NOTE 2
1. Mild All Purpose neutral cleaner gal NO BID 3.12 gal 3.15 gal NO BID 5.34 gal
Theochem Theochem Zep #113090
Brand/Product Lacto 128 Lacto 128 All Purpose Cleaner
Case pack 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 4/1 gal
Dilution Ratio 1:128 1:128 1:40
|| 400 NOTE 2 NOTE 2
2. Powered abrasive cleanser &3] 18.00 cs 12.75 ¢cs 12.75 ¢cs 22.50/cs 24.30/cs
Theochem Theochem Proctor & Gamble Comet
Brand/Product Ajax #14278 Time Saver Cleaner Time Saver Comet #112509
Case Pack 24/21 oz 24/21 oz 24/21 oz 24/21 oz 24/21 oz
NOTE 1. One dispenser per case. NOTE 4. 45 case minimum. NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order. NOTE 10. 175 case minimum. NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.

NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would

exceed next low bidder.




Page 2 of 3, Bid # 9-99, Part | Bay Industrial ICS Osceola Maintenance Warehouse | American Chemical |
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 4 5 6
400 - - | NOTE 6
3. Bleach, chlorine cs 8.50/cs NO BID .36/ 5.50/cs NO BID NO BID
Brand/Product Bleach Austin A-1 Osceola
Case Pack 6/gal 6/gal ‘ 6/gal
1100 NOTE 3 NOTE 3 NOTE 6 ,
4, Glass Cleaner cs 26.80/cs 8.60 8.92/cs NO BID 17.96/cs 8.88/cs
Ajax Theochem Theochem Zep
Brand/Product #04174CPL Mirror Image Mirror Image Enforcer Window Cleaner | East Glass
Case Pack 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 4/1 gal
500 NOTE 1 NOTES NOTE 6 & 7
5. Antimicrobial Lotion Soap cs 75.00/cs NOBID 43.00/cs . 49.65/cs 29.98/cs NO BID
Provon Provon w/Triclosan | Osceola/Softcare Zep-Triclosan
Brand/Product GoJo #4152 #4152-10 Mediclean Antibacterial Liquid
Case Pack 10/1 ltr 10/1 1tr 12/1000 ml Agal/cs
6. Hand cleaner, gel type, rinses 150 NOTE 5
clean with water cs 39.50/cs NO BID 32.56/cs NO BID 31.55/cs NO BID
GoJo GoJo w/Pumice GoJo w/Pumice
Brand/Product #1115 #1135 #117905
Case pack 6/4.5# 6/4.5# 4/16 oz
Cost for dispensers 12.00 (Black) No Charge N/A
300 NOTE 5
7. Isopropyl Alcohol Gel cS 32.00/cs NO BID 23.08/cs 23.15/cs 25.24/cs NO BID
GoJo GoJo Softcare GoJo #117940
Brand/Product Purell #9651 #1HS9651-24 Sani-Gel Purell Instant Hand Santi.
Case pack 24/4.25 oz 24/4.25 oz 24/40z 12/80z
NOTE 1. One dispenser per case. NOTE 4. 45 case minimum. NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order. NOTE 10. 175 case minimum. NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.

NOTE 2. 50 case minimum.
NOTE 3. 100 case minimum.

NOTE 5. 150 case minimum.
NOTE 6. Not an approved product.

NOTE 8. 35 case minimum.
NOTE 9. 15 case minimum.

NOTE 11. 36 case minimum.
NOTE 12. 96 case minimum.

NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would
exceed next low bidder.




Page 3 of 3, Bid # 9-99,Part | Bay Industrial ICS | Peninsular ?éer | Osceola Supply Maintenance Warehouse
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 1 2 3 4 5 6
8. Phenol Disinfectant & deodorant 275 NOTE 2 NOTE 2 NOTE 6 NOTE 2
aerosol spray cs 35.50/cs 17.59/cs 18.19/cs 26.80/cs NO BID 17.66/cs
Chase Theochem Theochem Sanikleen Theochem
Brand/Product #5160 Envisol Envisol Disinfectant Spray Envisol
i Case pack 12/20 oz 12/15 oz 12/15 oz 12/20 0z 12/15 oz
Fluid ounces per can 20 oz 15 0z 15 0z 20 oz 15 0z
100 NOTE 4 NOTE 4 NOTE 2
9. Furniture Polish, aerosol ] 27.25/cs 16.12/cs 16.65/cs NO BID NO BID 16.20/cs
Chase #5136 Theochem Theochem Theochem
Brand/Product Furniture Polish Fiurniture Polish Lemon Glo Furniture Polish
Case pack 12/20 oz 12/16 oz 12/16 oz 12/16 oz
Fluid ounces per can 20 0z 16 0z 16 0z 16 0z
EXCEPTIONS NO NO NO NO NO NO
Addendum No. 1 NO NO YES NO NO YES

NOTE 4. 45 case minimum.
NOTE 5. 150 case minimum.
NOTE 6. Not an approved product.

NOTE 1. One dispenser per case.
NOTE 2. 50 case minimum.
NOTE 3. 100 case minimum.

NOTE 10. 175 case minimum.
NOTE 11. 36 case minimum.
NOTE 12. 96 case minimum.

NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order.
NOTE 8. 35 case minimum.
NOTE 9. 15 case minimum.

NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.
NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would
exceed next low bidder.




Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Purchasing Department
Rosalyn Mcintosh, Buyer
(813) 247-8023

BID TABULATION

L

P /s Vacuum -Janitorial | 1. Supply Inc Colonial Paper Co. Edcor Safety Pyramlid School Grainger
Bid Number: 9-99 A . o . Products
C
Bid Title: Janitorial Chemicals K 5 ‘
/ | P.O. Box 339 PO Box 310 ‘ 3230 Roanoke 6510 N. 54" Street 1820 Tampa East Blvd
Opened: March 25, 1999 Q o ~ \
U Tallevast, FL 34270 | Silver Springs, FL. | Kansas City MO Tampa, FL 33610 Tampa, FL 33619
Awarded: April 6, 1999 - RM A 34489 f 64111 « \
N - \ - .
Award Period: 4/12/99 - 4/11/00 T Terry Gummerson Hugh Price Bob Niemeyer -Kenneth Miller David Thompson
Page 1 of 3 Partll T .
Y (941) 351-4661 Ph (800) 821-5554 Ph (813) 621-6446 Ph (813) 622-7223 Ph
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD. (941) 359-4892 Fx (813) 960-0123 Fx 813) 621-7688 Fx (813) 622-7876 Fx
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 7 8 10 11 12
1000 NOTE 2 NOTE 6 NOTE 2 NOTE 6 NOTE 2
1. Mild All Purpose neutral cleaner gal 3.07/gal 5.68/gal 3.08/gal 4.09/gal 3.06/gal 4.97/gal
Theochem Betco Theochem Advantage Plus Theochem Ball
Brand/Product Lacto 128 AF315 Lacto 128 Neutral Det. LA013 #1428 FSPMA Jump Start
Case pack 4/1 gal Not Listed 4/1 gal Not Listed 4/1 gal 4/1 gal
Dilution Ratio 1:128 50z/128 1:128 3:128 1:128 1:128
400 NOTE 2 NOTE 2 NOTE 2
2. Powered abrasive cleaner cs 12.78/cs 16.62/cs 12.72/cs NO BID 12.88/cs 27.45/cs
Theochem Theochem Theochem
Brand/Product Time Saver Cleaner Time Saver Time Saver Cleaner Timesaver #126 Comet
Case pack 24/21 oz 24/21 oz 24/21 oz 24/21 oz 24/21 oz

NOTE 10. 175 case minimum.
NOTE 11. 36 case minimum.
NOTE 12. 96 case minimum.

NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.
NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would
exceed next low bidder.

NOTE 4. 45 case minimum.
NOTE 5. 150 case minimum.
NOTE 6. Not an approved product.

NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order.
NOTE 8. 35 case minimum.
NOTE 9. 15 case minimum.

NOTE 1. One dispenser per case.
NOTE 2. 50 case minimum.
NOTE 3. 100 case minimum.




Page 2 of 3, Bid #9-99,Part || | . Supply Colonial Paper Co Edcor Safety. Pyramid School Grainger
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 7 8 9 10 11 12
400 NOTE 8 NOTE 6 NOTE 6 & 10
3. Bleach, chlorine cs 4.75/cs 7.58 cs 4.75/cs NO BID 4.29/cs 14.14/cs
Austins James Austin Chem Lab
Brand/Product Austins A-1 Bleach Not Listed A-1 #2069 Clorox
Case Pack 6/1 gal 6/1 gal 6/1 gal 6/1 gal 6/1 gal
1100 NOTE 3 NOTE 3 NOTE 6 NOTE 3
4, Glass Cleaner cS 8.80/cs 19.96 8.73/cs 12.32/cs 8.72/cs 16.24/cs
Theochem Betco Theochem Advantage Plus Theochem Ball
Brand/Product Mirror Image Deep Blue-RTU Mirror Image Glass&Multi Clner Mirror Image #1277 Sun Up
Case Pack 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 4/1 gal 4/1gal
500 NOTE 6
5. Antimicrobial Lotion Soap cS NO BID NO BID 29.85/cs NO BID NO BID 52.13/cs
GoJdo GoJo
Brand/Product #7188-10/7108-12 4152-10
Case Pack Not Listed 10/1 Mtr
6. Hand cleaner, gel type, rinses 150 NOTE 9
clean with water. cs 42.36/cs 53.82/cs ‘ NO BID NO BID 42.00/cs
GoJo w/Pumice GoJo w/Prumice GoJ ‘:W[Pumice‘{ \ GoJo w/Pumice
Brand/Product #1135 #915-06 o #0915
Case Pack 6/4.5# 6/4.5# 6/4.5#
Cost for Dispensers None None
300
7. Isopropy! Alcohol Gel cs 51.75/cs 22.92 NO BID NO BID 29.09/cs
Brand/Product . GoJo GoJo GoJo
Santi-Gel #5635 = #9657-12 Purell #9651-24 Purell #9651
Case Pack 24/407 L 12/cs 800 ml 24/4 oz 24/4 oz

NOTE 4. 45 case minimum.
NOTE 5. 150 case minimum.
NOTE 6. Not an approved product.

NOTE 1. One dispenser per case.
NOTE 2. 50 case minimum.
NOTE 3. 100 case minimum.

NOTE 10. 175 case minimum.
NOTE 11. 36 case minimum.
NOTE 12. 96 case minimum.

NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.
NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would
exceed next low bidder.

NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order.
NOTE 8. 35 case minimum.
NOTE 9. 15 case minimum.




Colonial Paper.Co.

Page 3 of 3, Bid # 9-99,Part Il Jerrys’ Vacuum-Janitorial I. Supply Edcor Safety Grainger
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 7 8 9 10 12
8. Phenol Disinfectant & deodorant 275 NOTE 2 NOTE 6 NOTE 2 ﬁ@T&‘ﬂ
aerosol spary cs 17.68 33.62/cs 17.80/cs NO BID 14.54/cs 24.48/cs
Theochem Betco Theochem Ball
Brand/Product Envisol AF86 Gly Bet Envisol | Ball-Phene
Case Pack 12/15 oz 12/14 oz 12/15 oz | 1212002
Fluid ounce per can 15 0z 14 oz 15 0z
100 NOTE 4 NOTE 4 NOTE 6
9, Furniture Polish, aerosol cs 16.22/cs 25.30/cs 16.29/cs NO BID 24.56/cs
Theochem Theochem Theochem Johnson Wax
Brand/Product Lemon Glo Lemon Glo Furnit. Polish #5030 Pledge
Case Pack 12/16 0z 12/16 oz 12/16 oz _|en8oz
Fluid ounces per can 16 0z 16 0z 16 0z
EXCEPTIONS YES NO NO NO NO NO
Addendum No. 1 YES NO YES YES YES NO

NOTE 1. One dispenser per case.
NOTE 2. 50 case minimum.
NOTE 3. 100 case minimum.

NOTE 4. 45 case minimum.
NOTE 5. 150 case minimum.
NOTE 6. Not an approved product.

NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order.
NOTE 8. 35 case minimum.
NOTE 9. 15 case minimum.

NOTE 10. 175 case minimum.
NOTE 11. 36 case minimum.
NOTE 12. 96 case minimum.

NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.
NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would
exceed next low bidder.




Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office Purchasing Department

P.O. Box 3371 Rosalyn Mcintosh,Buyer
Tampa, FL 33601 (813) 247-8023
BID TABULATION
Bid Number: 9-99 P Zep Manufacturing Sa-So State Chemical Mig Co Mutual Wholesale Co. Dade Paper Company
A
Bid Title: Janitorial Chemicals C :
K P.O. Box 310579 1341 W. Mockingbird Lane 12716 Carte Drive 330 N Ingraham Avenue 6918 Presidents Drive
Opened: March 25, 1999 / Suite 1200E P.O. Box 330
Q
Il Awarded: April 6, 1999 - RM ] Tampa, FL 33680 Dallas, TX 75247 Tampa, FL 33618 Lakeland, FL 33802 Orlando, FL 32809
A
Award Period: 4/12/99 - 4/11/00 N
T Eric E. Layton Bill Rayburn Mark Polster Brian Chapman Scott Meltz
Page 1 of 3 Partlll |
T
Y (813)621-3946 Ph (800) 527-2450 Ph (800) 852-5669 Ph (800) 962-5925 X 3121 Ph (407) 859-1020 Ph
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD. (813)626-8632 Fx (800) 752-4294 Fx (216) 931-7222 Fx (941) 683-6186 Fx (407) 857-8247 Fx
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 13 14 15 16 17
1000 NOTE 6 NOTE 6
1. Mild All Purpose neutral cleaner gal 4.38/gal NO BID 10.40/gal 2.79/gal NO BID
Zep State Chemical Betco
Brand/Product ZC Neutral Butyl Cleaner PH7 #138
Case Pack 8/gal cs
Dilution Ratio 1:128 Not Listed 1:128
400 NOTE 2
2. Powered abrasive cleaner cs 49.94/cs 30.13/cs NO BID NO BID 16.60/cs
Zep Ajax
Brand/Product O Bright Ajax Ajax 42-78
Case Pack 24/32 oz 24/21 oz 24/21 oz
NOTE 1. One dispenser per case. NOTE 4. 45 case minimum. NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order. NOTE 10. 175 case minimum. NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.
NOTE 2. 50 case minimum. NOTE 5. 150 case minimum. NOTE 8. 35 case minimum. NOTE 11. 36 case minimum. NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would
NOTE 3. 100 case minimum. NOTE 6. Not an approved product. NOTE 9. 15 case minimum. NOTE 12. 96 case minimum. exceed next low bidder.




Page 2 of 3, Bid # 9-99,Part Il Zep Manufacturing Sa So State Chemical Mutual Wholesale Co. Dade paper Co.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 13 14 15 16 17
400
Bleach, chlorine cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand/Product
Case Pack
1100 NOTE 6 NOTE 12
Glass Cleaner cs 34.08/cs 39.43/cs 66.42/cs 10.36/cs 8.60/cs
Zep Ajax State Chemical Betco Midlab
Brand/Product Vue Glass Cleaner Multi-Surface Cleaner Clr (F248) Deep Blue #108 GC520 Ammoniated
Case Pack 8/gal 4/1 gal 6/1 gal 4/1 gal 4/1 gal
1000 NOTE 6 NOTE 6
Antimicrobial Lotion Soap cS NO BID 73.36/cs 76.80/cs NO BID NO BID
Lysol - Lysol I.C. State Chemical
Brand/Product Antimicrobial Lotion Soap Hands on Defense
Case Pack 4/1 gl Pour Bottles 8/500 ml
Hand cleaner, gel type, rinses 150 NOTE 6 NOTE 6 NOTE 14
clean with water cS 60.40/cs 68.22/cs 124.80/cs 32.15/cs NO BID
Zep GoJo State Chemical Betco
Brand/Product Reach Orange Pumice Hand Clner Citro Blast Winning Hand
Case Pack 8/qgal 6/4.5 # Not listed 6/4.5#
Cost for dispensers 1.90 ea 19.32 ea Not listed 26.00 ea
300 NOTE 6 NOTE 6 NOTE 6
Isopropyl Alcohol Gel cS 38.92/cs 53.04/cs 53.60/cs 19.10/cs 33.99/cs
Zep GodJo Purell State Chemical Betco Kimberly Clark
Brand/Product Instant Hand Sanitizer Purell Original Hand Sanitizer Sanibel #176 #91551
Case Pack 24/4 oz 24/4.25 oz 24/4 oz 24/4 oz 24/8 oz

NOTE 4. 45 case minimum.

NOTE 10. 175 case minimum.

NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.

NOTE 1. One dispenser per case.
NOTE 2. 50 case minimum.
NOTE 3. 100 case minimum.

NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order.
NOTE 8. 35 case minimum.
NOTE 9. 15 case minimum.

NOTE 5. 150 case minimum.
NOTE 6. Not an approved product.

NOTE 11. 36 case minimum.
NOTE 12. 96 case minimum.

NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would
exceed next low bidder.



|| Page 3 of , Bid #9-99,Part il Zep Manufacturing Sa So State Chemical Mutual Wholesale Co Dade Paper Go.
Il DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) 13 14 15 16 17
| 8. Phenol Disinfectant & deodorant 275 NOTE 6 NOTE 13
aerosol spray cS 37.58/cs NO BID 108.80/cs 31.50/cs 21.01/cs
Zep State Chemical Betco Midlab
Brand/Product Zepynamic-A-Disinfectant Fresh Squeezed TB Plus #TB93 DS411
| Case Pack 12/24 oz 12/16 oz 12/16 oz 12/20 oz
Fluid ounces per can 24 0z 16 0z 16 0z 20 0z
100 NOTE 6 NOTE 6 NOTE 13
9. Furniture Polish, aerosol cs 28.16/cs 50.00/cs 48.00/cs 25.85/cs 18.15/cs
Zep Amrep State Chemical Betco Midlab
Brand/Product Sheen Misty Furniture Polish Lemon Sense PH60 SP731
Case pack 12/20 oz 12/19 oz 12/18 oz 12/17 oz 12/20 oz
1 Fluid ounces per can 20 oz 19 0z 18 0z 17 oz 20 0z
EXCEPTIONS NO NO NO NO NO
Addendum No. 1 NO NO NO NO YES

NOTE 4. 45 case minimum.
NOTE 5. 150 case minimum.
NOTE 6. Not an approved product.

NOTE 10. 175 case minimum.
NOTE 11. 36 case minimum.
NOTE 12. 96 case minimum.

NOTE 13. 48 case minimum.
NOTE 14. Cost of dispensers would
exceed next low bidder.

NOTE 1. One dispenser per case.
NOTE 2. 50 case minimum.
NOTE 3. 100 case minimum.

NOTE 7. 1 free dispenser per 25 case order.
NOTE 8. 35 case minimum.
NOTE 9. 15 case minimum.




