P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

BID TABULATION

PURCHASING SECTION

Carolyn Hendrickson
(813) 247-8054

Bid Number: 11-99 P Sirchie Finger print Ray O’Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
A Lab
Description: Fingerprint Supply Annual C
Contract K 100 Hunter Place PO Box 1070 PO Box 4708 PO Box 288 14865 W. 105" Street PO Box 16 45 N. Lawn Avenue
/ Youngsville, NC 27596 Danville, IL 61834 Hollywood, FL 33083 Wake Forest, NC 27588 Lenexa, KS 66215 Martinez, CA 94553 Elmsford, NY 10523
Opened: January 28, 1999 Q
U
Partial Award: April 14, 1999 A
N Mark Leath Ray O’Herron Millard E. Jones George Fodell Terry Kliethermes Caroline Rudge Peter Picara
Thru: April 13, 2000 T
Extended Thru April 12, 2001 I
T 919-554-2244 PH 800-223-2097 PH 800-426-7072 PH 800-255-6499 PH 800-227-6020 PH
Items Shaded I ndicate Award Y 919-554-2266 FX 888-223-3235 FX 919-556-6176 FX 913-888-1066 FX 925-686-6696 FX
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
1. Fingerprint ink, 4 ounce size, Ace 8719, NOTE 1
Sirchie 231T, Lightning 2-0012, Criminal
Resear ch 41-335, Lynn Peavy 5570 or equal.
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 20 12 4 Each 50 66
Brand/M odel Sirchie 231T Sirchie 231T Sirchie 231T ACE #8719 Lynn Peavey 5570 Kinderprint 8-0064 Faurot 248
$/Each 66 ea 3.50 5.75 6.10 4.88 4.15 6.25 4.00
2. Fingerprint Ink Rollers, 4" unified, Sirchie
FPRA400, Ace 4242, Delta 180, Lightning 2,0015,
CRP 42-350, Lynn Peavy 5587 or equal.
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 4 4 2 Each
Brand/M odel Sirchie FPR 400 Sirchie FPR400 Sirchie FPR400 ACE#4242 Lynn Peavey 5587 Sirchie FPR400
$/Each 4ea 6.90 8.75 7.27 11.21 10.50 9.95 NO BID
3. Fingerprint Ink Rollers, 3", Sirchie Easy-Grip
FPT262A or equal. 2
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net Sirchie Easy-Grip 2 2 2
Brand/M odel Sirchie FPT262A FPT262A Sirchie FPT 262A Sirchie #FPT262A Sirchie FPT262A Faurot #251
$/Each 2ea 6.70 8.75 9.33 8.46 NO BID 9.95 17.00
4. Fingerprint Inking Slab, stainless steel, 5" x
12", Sirchie FPT 260 or equal.
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 2 2 2 Each 5x 10 2
Brand/Model NO AWARD AT Sirchie FPT 260 Sirchie FPT260 Sirchie FPT260 ACE 5965 Lynn Peavey 5585 Kinderprint 8-0067 Faurot 255
$/Each THISTIME 2ea 10.31 12.50 12.89 10.31 10.00 9.47 9.00

EVALUATING SAMPLES

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 2 of 11
Bid Number 11-99

Sirchie Fingerprint

Ray O’'Herron Co.

Jones Equipment

Fingerprint Equip. Lab

Lynn Peavy Company

Kinderprint Co.

Faurot, Inc.

DESCRIPTION

5. Fingerprint Cardholder, for standard 8" x 8"
fingerprint record cards, all steel assembly, vinyl
covered aluminum frame, with mounting brackets
for desk/table top mounting, Sirchie FPT 264 or
equal.

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

2ea

$25.00 Net
Sirchie FPT 264
13.46

2
Sirchie FPT 264
16.00

2
Sirchie FPT 264
16.83

2
Sirchie FPT 264
15.26

Each
Lynn Peavey 5302
15.00

Kinderprint 8-0065
15.87

2
Faurot 300Y
19.00

6. Magnetic Latent Print Kits, consisting of 1
each black magnetic powder, 1 ounce size: 1 each
silver/gray magnetic powder, 1 ounce size; 1 each
magnetic powder applicator. Lighting Powder
Model 1-0120, Delta 155, Ace 3721, Lynn Peavy
5620, Sirchie 159L or equal.

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

$25.00 Net
Sirchie 159L
19.00

10
Sirchie 159L
39.00

6
Sirchie 159L
40.55

1
ACE 3721
32.44

Each
Lynn Peavey 5620
35.00

lea
LIT 1-0120
29.95

Faurot 300Y
45.00

7. Porelon Finger print Pads, Desk Model, with
brackets, Sirchie FPT268 NO SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

52 ea

$25.00 Net
15.95

20
16.95

17.40

18.27

NO BID

50
Sirchie FPTZ68
18.00

NO BID

8. Porelon finger print Pads, Pocket M odel,
Sirchie FPT267 NO SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

$25.00 Net
15.95

20
16.95

17.40

18.27

NO BID

1
Sirchie FPT267
20.95

NO BID

9. Réfillsfor above, Sirchie #FPT268A NO
SUBSTITUTION

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

$25.00 Net
10.37

25
12.95

12.97

13.56

NO BID

15.25

NO BID

10. Porelon Fingerprint Pads, Pocket Model, Ace
#6301 NO SUBSTITUTION

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

$25.00
15.95

NO BID

NO BID

15.05

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.
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Bid Number 11-99

Sirchie Fingerprint

Ray O’'Herron Co.

Jones Equipment

Fingerprint Equip. Lab

Lynn Peavy Company

Kinderprint Co.

Faurot, Inc.

DESCRIPTION

11. Refillsfor above, Ace #6303R NO
SUBSTITUTION

Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

$25.00 Net
10.37

NO BID

NO BID

11.17

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

12. Sef-contained "inkless' thumbprint pads,
Identicator Perfect Ink PI-5NO SUBSTITUTE
Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

NO BID

20
29.90

NO BID

NO BID

Each
Lynn Peavey 9610
(Perfect Ink PI-5)
5.95

Ink P1-5
26.25

NO BID

13. Sdf-contained "inkless' thumbprint pads,
Sureprint 2X2, Sirchie PMP100S, Delta 2X2,
Lynn Peavy 5148 or equal.

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

1000 ea

$25.00 Net
Sirchie PMP100S
2.68

100
Sirchie PM P100S
10.50

6
Sirchie PMP100S
12.50

2
ACE 6304AS
10.00

100
Lynn Peavey 5148
3.25

500
Sirchie PMP100S
11.75

NO BID

14. Patrol Latent Print Kits, to contain: 1
leatherette (or other acceptable) carrying case, 1
black latent powder, 1 transparent lifting tape, 1
zephyrus/perfect brush*, 1 backing sheet pad (50
sheets), and instruction booklet. Ace Model 4303,
Delta Model 150, Sirchie MFC100, Lynn Peavy
5600 or equal. * Note: Came hair brushesare
not acceptable.

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

150 ea

$25.00 Net
Sirchie MFC100
14.00

25
Sirchie MFC100
25.75

6
Sirchie MFC100
27.50

1
ACE 4303
20.63

50
Lynn Peavey 5600
15.75

50
Sirchie MFC100
25.00

Faurot 654
39.00

15. Latent Fingerprint Powder, 1 gallon size, Ace
#3616B_NO SUBSTITUTION

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

$25.00 Net
162.38

NO BID

NO BID

162.38

NO BID

NO BID

Faur ot 296G
60.00

16. Latent Fingerprint Powder, 1 gallon size,
Lynn Peavey #5480 or Delta 308

Minimum Order Quantity NO AWARD AT
Brand/M odel THISTIME
$/Each EVALUATING SAMPLES

8ea

$25.00 Net
Sirchie BPP09128
75.00

4
Sirchie BPP09128
195.00

NO BID

NO BID

Each
Lynn Peavey 5480
76.00

148.00

8
Faur ot 296G
60.00

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 4 of 11 Sirchie Fingerprint Ray O'Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
Bid Number 11-99

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
17. Latent Fingerprint Powder, 2 ounce size Ace
#3616, Delta 300, Lynn Peavey 5571, Sirchie 101L
or equal $25.00 Net 25 5 Each lea 100
Minimum Order Quantity Sirchie 101L Sirchie 101L-107L ACE 3616 Lynn Peavey 5571 Lynn Peavey 5571 Faur ot 296
Brand/M odel 100 ea 225 6.25 NO BID 4.22 2.65 36.50 3.25
$/Each
18. Magnetic Latent Print Powder, 1 ounce,
Sirchieor equal. M114L Regular Black, M 115L
Midnight Black, M116L White, M117L Gray, 25
M118L Red Sirchie 4
Minimum Order Quantity =~ NO AWARD $25.00 Net M114L/M115L/M116L/ 6 ACE 3722,3724,3726, Each lEa 1
Brand/M odel EVALUATING SAMPLES As Specified/Sir chie M117L/M118L Sirchie - As Specified 3723,3729 Lynn Peavey 55571 Sirchie Faurot 30011
$/Each 2.98 6.75 6.35 5.07 4.00 6.98 5.00
19. Magnetic Latent Print Powder, 1 ounce,
Sirchieor equal. M119L Silver Each
Minimum Order Quantity NO AWA RD $25.00 Net 25 6 4 Lynn Peavey #55574 1
Brand/M odel EVALUATING SAMPLES Sirchie M 119L Sirchie M 119L SirchieM119L ACE 3725 (Silver)Dual-Use Sirchie M 119L Faurot 30011
$/Each 3.75 7.50 7.23 5.77 4.30 7.98 5.00
20. Fingerprint Brushes, general purpose,
fiberglass, bristle length approximate 2", overall
length approximate 7", handle may be metal or
wood, must be supplied with protective plastic
container with cap.
Lightning 1-0200, Delta 100, Sirchie 122L or
equal
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 25 6 3 50 1Ea 1
Brand/Model Sirchie 1221 Sirchie 1221 Sirchie 1221 ACE 1563 Lynn Peavey 55391 Sirchie 1221 Faur ot 206
$/Each 3.95 9.95 9.59 8.21 4.25 10.12 5.00
21. Fingerprint Brushes, kit size, fiberglass,
bristle length approximate 2", overall length
approximate 6", handle may be metal or wood,
must be supplied with protective plastic container
with cap. Sirchie 122L. 1 or equal
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 25 6 3 75 5
Brand/Model Sirchie122L | Sirchie122L 1 Sirchie122L1 ACE 1563A Lynn Peavey 55392 Sirchie122L 1 Faurot 2066
$/Each 75ea 3.95 8.95 8.72 7.46 4.00 9.12 5.00

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 5 of 11 Sirchie Fingerprint Ray O'Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
22. Feather Duster, for powder application,
Sirchie Model 123L, Delta 101, CRP 9-149, Lynn
Peavey 5537 or equal
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 25 6 4 50
Brand/M odel Sirchie 123L Sirchie 123L Sirchie 123L ACE 1561 Lynn Peavey 5537 Kinderprint 1-3004 Faur ot 207
$/Each 3.50 6.90 9.59 5.44 4.25 6.95 5.00
23. Accelerant pads, Full Sheet Size (16" X20"),
Lynn Peavy #5425 or equal
Minimum Order Quantity Each
Brand/M odel Lynn Peavey 5425 Lynn Peavey 5425
$/Each COIN TOSS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51.00 51.00 NO BID
24. Physical Developer, 1 liter size, Forensic
Resear ch #P4593T, Lightning Powder #1-2729,
Lynn Peavey 5087, Sirchie LPD100 or equal
Sizeif not same as above 1 Quart
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 10 2 1 Each 1Ea 1
Brand/M odel Sirchie LPD100 Sirchie LPD100 Sirchie LPD100 Sirchie LPD100 Lynn Peavey 5087 Sirchie LPD 100 Faurot PD1L
$/Each 30.12 39.50 41.27 36.51 40.00 39.99 46.00
25. Ninhydrin Spray, aerosol, 16 ounce volume
Sirchie 201C or Equal
Sizeif not same as above
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 10 12 2
Brand/M odel Sirchie 201C Sirchie 201C Sirchie 201C ACE 1421 Sirchie 201C Faurot 204
$/Each 12 ea 12.53 16.00 17.75 13.31 NO BID 16.66 25.00
26. Ninhydrin Spray, aerosol, 6 ounce volume
Sirchie 202C or Equal
Sizeif not same as above
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 10 12 3.
Brand/M odel Sirchie 202C Sirchie 202C Sirchie 202C ACE 1421A Faurot 204.6
$/Each 6.55 8.25 8.50 6.56 NO BID 8.56 21.00
27. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Transparent, 1" x
360", Ace 4751, Sirchie 144.5L or equal
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 50 9 1Ea
Brand/M odel Sirchie 144.5L Sirchie 144.5L ACE 4751 Kinderprint 1-1100 Faurot 335-1
$/Each 2.28 3.20 NO BID 244 NO BID 2.95 3.75

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 6 of 11 Sirchie Fingerprint Ray O'Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
28. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Frosted, 1" x 360",
Ace 4797, Sirchie 145.5L or equal
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 50 8
Brand/M odel Sirchie 145.5L Sirchie 145.5L ACE 4797 Kinderprint 1-0100 Faurot 335D1
$/Each 2.28 3.20 NO BID 2.63 NO BID 2.95 3.75
29. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Transparent, 1-
12" x 360", Ace 4752, Delta 210, Sirchie 144L
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 50 50 7 500
Brand/M odel Sirchie 144L Sirchie 144L Delta ACE 4752 Lynn Peavey 5563 Kinderprint 1-1150 Faurot 335
$/Each 900 ea 2.00 4.20 2.37 3.15 2.54 3.16 3.75
30. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Frosted, 1-1/2" x
360", Ace 4798, Delta 200, Sirchie 145L
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 50 50 6 Each 1Ea
Brand/M odel Sirchie 145L Sirchie 145L Delta ACE 4798 Lynn Peavey 5565 Kinderprint 1-0150 Faurot 335D
$/Each 2.00 4.50 2.37 3.46 2.49 3.90 3.75
31. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Transparent, 2" x
360", Ace 4753, Delta 210, sirchie 144L. 2
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 50 50 5 Each 1Ea. Min.
Brand/M odel Sirchie 14412 Sirchie 14412 Delta ACE 4753 Lynn Peavey 5564 Kinderprint 1-1200 Faurot 335.2
$/Each 2.37 5.25 2.97 3.85 2.94 4.90 3.95
32. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Frosted, 2" x 360",
Ace 4799, Delta 201, Sirchie 145L 2
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 50 50 4 Each
Brand/M odel Sirchie 145L. 2 Sirchie 145L 2 Delata ACE 4799 Lynn Peavey 5566 Kinderprint 1-0200 Faurot 335D2
$/Each 2.37 6.20 2.97 4.55 2.75 4.90 3.95
33. Transparent Lifters, 5 mil thick, with clear
adhesive 1" x 1-1/2", Ace SA1 (100/box) NO
SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/M odel 2
$/Each NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
34. Transparent Lifters, 5 mil thick, with clear
adhesive 2" x 4", AceHA1 (100/box) NO
SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/M odel 1
$/Each NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 7 of 11 Sirchie Fingerprint Ray O'Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
Bid Number 11-99

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
35. Transparent Lifters, 5 mil thick, with clear
adhesive 4" x 4", Ace PA1 (100/box) NO
SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/M odel 1
$/Each NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID
36. Transparent Lifters, 2" x 2", Lightning 1- 20
2022 (100/box) NO SUBSTITUTION NO BID 15.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
37. Transparent Lifters, 2" x 4", Lighting 1-2024 20
(100/box), NO SUBSTITUTION NO BID 26.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38. Transparent Lifters, 4" x 4", Lightning 1- 20
2044 (100/box), NO SUBSTITUTION NO BID 40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 41.75 NO BID
39. Fingerprint reprint Labels, 100/box. Sirchie
FPT1091, or equal
Quantity/box 100 100
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 3
Brand/M odel Sirchie FPT1091 25 ACE 20901
$/Box 1.70 Sirchie FPT 1091 NO BID 7.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID
40. Fingerprint Reprint Labels, 100/box, Identicator LE-42 650/box
Indenticator LE-42 - NO SUBSTITUTION (Lynn Peavey 9740) VENDOR
Minimum Order Quantity 25 Each DID NOT RENEW Iden. LE42
$/Box NO BID 21.90 NO BID NO BID 25.00 19.50 36.00
41. Hard Evidence Pouches, Lightning Powder
#1-4620, Sirchie CNS2001 or equal, 20/pack
Quantity/box 20 10 20 20 20/Pk
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net Lightning Powder 20 1 20/Pk
Brand/M odel Sirchie CNA2001 1-4620 Lightning 1-4620 ACE CP3002 Lynn Peavey 5479 Kinderprint 1-6102 Faurot 202HE
$/Pack 50.00 62.95 69.95 59.81 60.00 59.95 60.00
42. Slab & roller solvent cleaner, spray,
16 ounce non-fluor ocar bon aer osol, Sirchie 234T
or equivalent
Minimum Order Quantity NO AWARD AT $25.00 Net 10 12 2 6 Min.
Brand/Stock # THISTIME Sirchie 234T Sirchie 234T Sirchie 234T Sirchie 234T Sirchie 234T Faurot 341
$/Each EVALUATING SAMPLES | 6ea 8.14 10.50 10.90 9.56 NO BID 10.88 7.00

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 8 of 11 Sirchie Fingerprint Ray O'Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
Bid Number 11-99

DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
43. Waterlessskin cleaner, 16 ouncejar, Ace
7001, Sirchie FPT 249, Lynn Peavy 5578, CRP
46-379, Lightning 2-0044 or equal $25.00 Net 10 12 5 Each 1 Each
Minimum Order Quantity 16 oz 16 oz 160z 16 oz 120z 16 oz
Size Container - Packaging/Case Each Open per Request 12 12 Single Unit 12/cs
Brand/M odel NO AWARD AT THISTIME Sirchie FPT 249 Sirchie FPT 249 Sirchie FPT249 ACE 7001 Lynn Peavey 5578 Kinderprint 8-0051 Faurot 839
$/Each EVALUATING SAMPLES 4.25 5.25 5.75 4.31 4.50 3.95 4.00
44. Waterless skin cleaner, 128 ounce pump
container, citrus scent, contains aloe, lanolin and
jojoba, without pumice, Loctite “ Fast Orange
Liquid Hand Cleaner” or equal $25.00 Net 1 1 Each 8
Minimum Order Quantity 128 oz 128 oz 1Gal 4%Ib.
Size Container-Packaging/Case Each Each 1Ea 1
Brand/Stock # NO AWARD AT THISTIME Sirchie FPT248GS Sirchie FPT 248GS Sirchie FPT 248GS Faurot 839.45
$/Each EVALUATING SAMPLES 8ea 25.00 NO BID NO BID 22.31 NO BID 25.97 27.00
45. Ink cleaner towelettes, Sirchie FPT 254
(100/box) or equal
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 25BX 6 BX 3 Box 1 Box 124
Packaging/Box 100/bx 100 100 100 100 100 100
Brand/Model Sirchie FPT 254 Sirchie FPT254 Sirchie FPT254 Ace 7701 Lynn Peavey 5580 Kinderprint 1-4070 Faurot 839C
$/Box 124 bx 5.65 11.00 12.00 8.25 6.25 9.75 9.75
46. Ink cleaner towelettes, Sirchie FPT 255
(1000/case) or equal
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 5 1Case 1 1000 40
Packaging/Case 1000/cs Open per Request 1000 1000 1000 1000
Brand/M odel Sirchie FPT255 Sirchie FPT 255 Sirchie FPT255 Ace 7702 Kinderprint 1-4071 Faurot 849D
$/Case 40 cs 47.95 99.00 110.00 77.00 NO BID 85.00 95.00
47. Latent Fingerprint Development Chemicals:
A. Amido Black, 1 liter, pre-mixed, ECPI 2627 or
equal.
Packaging lea
Minimum Order Quantity NO AWARD 1 each
Brand/Product # EVALUATING SAMPLES LIT 1-0046 Faurot ABPM
$EA lea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.95 34.00

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 9 of 11 Sirchie Fingerprint Ray O'Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
B. Amido Black, Destain, 1 liter, pre-mixed,
ECPI 2661 or equal.
Packaging
Minimum Order Quantity NO AWARD
Brand/Product # EVALUATING SAMPLES Faurot/ABD
$EA lea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 34.00
C. Coomassi Blue, 1 liter, pre-mixed, ECPI 2662
or egual.
Packaging
Minimum Order Quantity NO AWARD . B
aurot
:/:Ea:dlpmd”d # EVALUATI NG SAMP 2ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.00
D. Coomassi Blue, destain, 1 liter, pre-mixed,
ECPI 2664 or equal.
Packaging
Minimum Order Quantity NO AVWARD
Brand/Product # EVALUATING SAMPLES Faurot/CBD
$/EA 2ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.00
E. Small Particulate Reagent, black, 1 liter, pre-
mixed, ECPI 2632 or equal.
Packaging 1500 mL 3/500 ML Bottles 3/Pk
Minimum Order Quantity NO AVWARD $25.00 Net 1 3Each
Brand/Product # EVALUATING SAMPLES Sirchie SPR100 ACE 2555 LIT 102763 Faurot/SPRBPM
$/EA lea 20.00 NO BID NO BID 22.46 NO BID 31.95 14.00
F. Small Particulate Reagent, White, 1 liter, pre-
mixed, ECPI 2630 or equal.
Packaging 1500 mL 3/500 ML Bottles 3/Pk
Minimum Order Quantity NO AWARD $25.00 Net 1 3 Each
$/EA 20.00 NO BID NO BID 24.46 NO BID 31.95 14.00
G. Luminol Reagent, 6 vilesto make 8 ounces
each, ECPI 2638 or equal.
Packaging 16 oz 160z Config. 6/Set
Minimum Order Quantity NO AWARD $25.00 Net 1 1 Set
Brand/Product # EVALUATING SAMPLES Sirchie Luminol 16 Sirchie Luminol 16 Sirchie DCB300 Faurot CRR 6/8
$/EA 5ea 38.00 NO BID NO BID 49.26 NO BID 24.95 37.00

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 10 of 11 Sirchie Fingerprint Ray O'Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
H. “RAM” Mixture, liquid dye stain, 1 liter, pre-
mixed, ECPI 2658 or equal.
Packaging
Minimum Order Quantity NO AWARD
Brand/Product#  EVALUATING SAMPLES Faur /RAVPM
$/EA 2ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.00
I. Sudan Black, 1 liter, pre-mixed, ECPI 2628 or
equal.
Packaging 1
Minimum Order Quantity NO AVWARD Each
Brand/Product #  EVALUATING SAMPLES LIT 1-0033 Faurot SB
$/Ea lea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.95 18.00
J. Adhesive-side Powder, 2 ounce, ECPI 2346 or
equal.
Packaging 50 grams 50 grams 1 Each
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 1 1 Each
Brand/Product # Sirchie ASP50 ACE ADH100 LIT 1-2722 Faurot ADH SP
$/EA 5ea 16.95 NO BID NO BID 19.96 NO BID 24.95 12.00
48. SharpsContainers, plastic with lid, with
styrofoam block inside.
A. 8" x 3/4", Lynn Peavy #5000 or equal.
Packaging 12 each 10 Each Each 1 Each
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 2 12 200
Brand/Product # SirchieECT2 ACE HSC100 Lynn Peavey 5000 Peavy 5000 Faurot 5000
$/EA 200 ea 9.95 NO BID NO BID 12.76 $0.50 8.58 9.95
B. 12" x 3", Lynn Peavy #5002 or equal.
Packaging 12 each 8 Each Each 1Ea
Minimum Order Quantity $25.00 Net 2 6 150 Each.
Brand/Product # SirchieECT3 ACE HSC1003 Lynn Peavey 5002 Peavy 5002 Faurot 5002
HEA 150 ea 16.50 NO BID NO BID 13.20 1.50 16.32 16.75

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



will not be accepted
unless authorized by
Sirchiein advance.
Products returned
unused and within
seven days of
authorization will be
subject to arestocking
charge of 20% of the
original invoice price.
Special orcdered or
non-inventoried
products are not
returnable under any
conditons. Shipping
and Handling charges
on retruned goods will
be pre-paid.

productsto be
returned to
manufacturer.

returned within 30
daysfor full refund.

electrical devices &
special orderscarry a
30 day money back
guarantee from the
date of purchase* If
you are not satisfied
with an item, simply
return it tousfor afull
refund, credit or
exchange.

* Polaroid Products
are consider ed special
orders.

Page 11 of 11 Sirchie Fingerprint Ray O'Herron Co. Jones Equipment Fingerprint Equip. Lab Lynn Peavy Company Kinderprint Co. Faurot, Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
Warranty Statement Per Maniufacturers NONE LISTED All Productsare Per Manufacturers All productsare All electrical devices NONE LISTED
Warranty. warranted by the Warranty. warranted against carry their own specific
Manufacturersto be manufacturer defects warranties. Extended
of current for oneyear from date warrantiesare
manufacture and free of purchase. available for most
of defects. electrical items. Some
items carry a one year
warranty from date of
purchase.
Return Policy Returns & exchanges NONE LISTED Obvioudly defective NONE LISTED Any item may be All items other than NONE LISTED

BASISFOR AWARD: Best Price, Acceptable Delivery, on Approved Product.

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office
P.O.Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

BID TABULATION

PURCHASING SECTION
Carolyn Hendrickson
(813) 247-8054

Bid Number: 11-99 P Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doj€e'sInc. Delta Latent Products Sureprint Inc.
A
Description: Fingerprint Supply Annul C
Contract K PO Box 4275 7750 9™ Street SW 1140 Adams St. #20 PO Box 500 3221 W. St. Brides PO Box 16633
/ Seminole, FL 33772 Vero Beach, FL 32968 Kansas City, KS 66103 Ocoeg, FL 34761 Orlando, FL 32812 Plantation, FL 33318
Continued Q
U
A
N Beatrice Levy Kevin Von Hartmann Mike Canfiels Donald Oster meyer Gregory Taylor Lynn Jacobs
T
I
T 727-393-8516 PH 800-562-5697 PH 800-953-3274 PH 407-880-8149 PH 800-780-45611 PH 954-370-9088 PH
Items Shaded I ndicate Award Y 727-393-8472 FX 561-569-2955 FX 913-342-2128 FX 407-880-8150 FX 800-780-5327 EX 954-370-0267 FX
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
1. Fingerprint ink, 4 ounce size, Ace 8719,
Sirchie 231T, Lightning 2-0012, Criminal
Resear ch 41-335, Lynn Peavy 5570 or equal.
Minimum Order Quantity 6 None
Brand/M odel ACE 8719 Sirchie 231T E.C.P.I 2504
$/Each 66 ea 6.50 5.13 4.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. Fingerprint Ink Rollers, 4" unified, Sirchie
FPRA400, Ace 4242, Delta 180, Lightning 2,0015,
CRP 42-350, Lynn Peavy 5587 or equal.
Minimum Order Quantity 6 None
Brand/M odel ACE 4242 Sirchie FPR 400 ECPI 2513
$/Each 4ea 14.95 8.06 10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Fingerprint Ink Rollers, 3", Sirchie Easy-Grip
FPT262A or equal.
Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/Model Sirchie FPT 262A
$/Each 2ea NO BID 8.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Fingerprint Inking Slab, stainless steel, 5" x
12", Sirchie FPT 260 or equal.
Minimum Order Quantity 3 None
Brand/M odel ACE 5965 Sirchie FPT 260 2511
$/Each 2ea 13.75 11.14 9.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 2 of 11
Bid Number 11-99

Security Supply

Lawmens & Shooters

Evidence Coll & Prot

Doje'sInc.

Delta Latent Products

Sureprint Inc.

DESCRIPTION

10

11

12

13

5. Fingerprint Cardholder, for standard 8" x 8"
fingerprint record cards, all steel assembly, vinyl
covered aluminum frame, with mounting brackets
for desk/table top mounting, Sirchie FPT 264 or
equal.

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

2ea

3
ACE 8014
18.50

Sirchie FPT 264
14.54

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

6. Magnetic Latent Print Kits, consisting of 1
each black magnetic powder, 1 ounce size: 1 each
silver/gray magnetic powder, 1 ounce size; 1 each
magnetic powder applicator. Lighting Powder
Model 1-0120, Delta 155, Ace 3721, Lynn Peavy
5620, Sirchie 159L or equal.

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

6
ACE 3721
43.25

Sirchie 159L
33.98

NONE
E.C.P.I.2217HB
25.00

NO BID

1
Delta #155
21.00

NO BID

7. Porelon Finger print Pads, Desk Model, with
brackets, Sirchie FPT268 NO SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

52 ea

NO BID

14.68

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

8. Porelon finger print Pads, Pocket Model,
Sirchie FPT267 NO SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

NO BID

14.68

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

9. Réfillsfor above, Sirchie #FPT268A NO
SUBSTITUTION

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

NO BID

10.89

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

10. Porelon Fingerprint Pads, Pocket Model, Ace
#6301 NO SUBSTITUTION

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

21.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 3 of 11
Bid Number 11-99

Security Supply

Lawmens & Shooters

Evidence Coll & Prot

Doje'sInc.

Delta Latent Products

Sureprint Inc.

DESCRIPTION

10

11

12

13

11. Refillsfor above, Ace #6303R NO
SUBSTITUTION

Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/Mod€l

$/Each

15.95

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

12. Sef-contained "inkless' thumbprint pads,
I denticator Perfect Ink PI-5NO SUBSTITUTE
Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

12
4.50

NO BID

Identicator P1-5 2525
6.35

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

13. Sef-contained "inkless' thumbprint pads,
Sureprint 2X2, Sirchie PMP100S, Delta 2X2,
Lynn Peavy 5148 or equal.

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

1000 ea

Inenticator P110
5.93

Sirchie PM P100S
10.49

NO BID

NO BID

50
Delta-Sureprint
3.80

100
Sureprint Signature
Security
2.95

14. Patrol Latent Print Kits, to contain: 1
leatherette (or other acceptable) carrying case, 1
black latent powder, 1 transparent lifting tape, 1
zephyrus/perfect brush*, 1 backing sheet pad (50
sheets), and instruction booklet. Ace Model 4303,
Delta Model 150, Sirchie MFC100, Lynn Peavy
5600 or equal. * Note: Camel hair brushesare
not acceptable.

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

150 ea

3
ACE 4303
27.50

Sirchie MFC100
23.10

None
E.C.P.l. 2212
20.00

NO BID

1
Delta 150
12.45

NO BID

15. Latent Fingerprint Powder, 1 gallon size, Ace
#3616B_NO SUBSTITUTION

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

216.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

16. Latent Fingerprint Powder, 1 gallon size,
Lynn Peavey #5480 or Delta 308

Minimum Order Quantity

Brand/M odel

$/Each

8ea

1
Forensic Res & Sply102A
125.60

NO BID

None
E.C.P.l. 2314
75.00

2
Doje’'s Catalog#103
80.00

1
Delta 308
62.00

NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 4 of 11 Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doje'sInc. Delta L atent Products Sureprint Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
17. Latent Fingerprint Powder, 2 ounce size Ace
#3616, Delta 300, Lynn Peavey 5571 or equal
6 None 1 1
Minimum Order Quantity Forensic Res. & Sply 101 E.C.P.I. 2310 (2 oz Black) Doje's Catalog #101 Delta 300
Brand/M odel 100 ea 4.75 NO BID 2.95 275 2.35 NO BID
$/Each
18. Magnetic Latent Print Powder, 1 ounce,
Sirchieor equal. M114L Regular Black, M 115L
Midnight Black, M116L White, M117L Gray,
M118L Red None
Minimum Order Quantity E.C.P.l. 241-Black, 2440 1
Brand/Model Sirchie White, 2430 Gray Doj€' s Catalog #104A
$/Each NO BID 5.34 3.05 2.75 NO BID NO BID
19. Magnetic Latent Print Powder, 1 ounce,
Sirchieor equal. M119L Silver
Minimum Order Quantity None 1
Brand/Model ACE 3725 SirchieM119L E.C.P.l. 2417 Doje's Catalog #108
$/Each 8.25 6.05 3.00 2.90 NO BID NO BID
20. Fingerprint Brushes, general purpose,
fiberglass, bristle length approximate 2", overall
length approximate 7", handle may be metal or
wood, must be supplied with protective plastic
container with cap.
Lightning 1-0200, Delta 100, Sirchie 122L or
equal
Minimum Order Quantity 6 None 1 1
Brand/M odel Forensic Res. & Sply 401 Sirchie 122 E.C.P.I. 2490 Doj€e's Catalog #503 Delta 100
$/Each 5.25 8.05 3.90 8.95 3.83 NO BID
21. Fingerprint Brushes, kit size, fiberglass,
bristle length approximate 2", overall length
approximate 6", handle may be metal or wood,
must be supplied with protective plastic container
with cap. Sirchie 12211 or equal
Minimum Order Quantity 6 None 1 1
Brand/M odel Forensic Res. & Sply 103 Sirchie 122L | #2490K Doj€e's Catalog #503 Delta 100-S
$/Each 75ea 7.95 7.32 3.90 8.95 3.88 NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 5 of 11 Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doje'sInc. Delta L atent Products Sureprint Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
22. Feather Duster, for powder application,
Sirchie Model 123L, Delta 101, CRP 9-149, Lynn
Peavey 5537 or equal
Minimum Order Quantity 4 None 1 1
Brand/M odel ACE 1561 Sirchie 123LR #2480 Doj€'s Catalog #505 Delta 101
$/Each 7.25 5.34 3.90 6.95 3.95 NO BID
23. Accelerant pads, Full Sheet Size (16" X20"), Not as Specified
Lynn Peavy #5425 or equal Evaluating for Future Use
Minimum Order Quantity Forensic Res. & Sply
Brand/M odel Accelerator, 1 Gal.
$/Each 16.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24. Physical Developer, 1 liter size, Forensic
Resear ch #P4593T, Lightning Powder #1-2729,
Lynn Peavey 5087, Sirchie LPD100 or equal
Sizeif not same as above
Minimum Order Quantity 1Lt 1
Brand/Model Forensic Res. PA4593T Sirchie E.C.P.I. 2622 (Part A & B) Doj€'s Catalog #206
$/Each 42.80 34.75 52.95 32.00 NO BID NO BID
25. Ninhydrin Spray, aerosol, 16 ounce volume
Sirchie 201C or Equal
Sizeif not same as above
Minimum Order Quantity 3
Brand/M odel Ace 1421 Sirchie
$/Each 12 ea 17.75 13.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26. Ninhydrin Spray, aerosol, 6 ounce volume
Sirchie 202C or Equal
Sizeif not same as above
Minimum Order Quantity 3
Brand/M odel ACE 1421A Sirchie
$/Each 8.75 7.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Transparent, 1" x
360", Ace 4751 or equal
Minimum Order Quantity 12 None
Brand/M odel ACE 4751 Sirchie Remco E.C.P.| #2100
$/Each 3.25 245 2.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 6 of 11 Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doje'sInc. Delta L atent Products Sureprint Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
28. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Frosted, 1" x 360",
Ace 4797 or equal
Minimum Order Quantity 12 None
Brand/M odel ACE 4797 Sirchie Remco E.C.P.l. #2010
$/Each 3.50 2.46 2.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
29. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Transparent, 1-
1/2" x 360", Ace 4752 or Delta 210
Minimum Order Quantity 12 None 1 1
Brand/Model ACe 4752 Sirchie Remco E.C.P.1. #2150 Doje's Catalog #124 Delta 210
$/Each 900 ea 4.50 3.31 3.10 3.50 2.02 NO BID
30. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Frosted, 1-1/2" x
360", Ace 4798 or Delta 200
Minimum Order Quantity 12 None 1 1
Brand/Model Forensice Res. & Sply 107 Sirchie Remco E.C.P.1. #2015 Doje's Catalog #123 Delta
$/Each 3.15 3.63 3.10 3.50 2.02 NO BID
31. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Transparent, 2" x
360", Ace 4753 or Delta 210
Minimum Order Quantity 12 None 1 1
Brand/M odel ACE 4753 Sirchie 144L.2 Remco E.C.P.1. #2200 Doje's Catalog #122 Delta
$/Each 5.50 4.04 4.00 4.30 2.39 NO BID
32. Fingerprint Lifting Tape, Frosted, 2" x 360",
Ace 4799 or Delta 201
Minimum Order Quantity 12 None 1 1
Brand/Model Forensic Res. & Sply. 121 Sirchie 145L 2 Remco E.C.P.1 #2020 Doje's Catalog #121 Delta
$/Each 4.30 4.75 4.00 4.30 2.39 NO BID
33. Transparent Lifters, 5 mil thick, with clear
adhesive 1" x 1-1/2", Ace SA1 (100/box) NO
SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/M odel 6
$/Each 12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34. Transparent Lifters, 5 mil thick, with clear
adhesive 2" x 4", AceHA1 (100/box) NO
SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/M odel 3
$/Each 30.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 7 of 11 Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doje'sInc. Delta L atent Products Sureprint Inc.
Bid Number 11-99

DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
35. Transparent Lifters, 5 mil thick, with clear
adhesive 4" x 4", Ace PA1 (100/box) NO
SUBSTITUTION
Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/M odel 2
$/Each 47.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36. Transparent Lifters, 2" x 2", Lightning 1- 1
2022 (100/box) NO SUBSTITUTION NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.95 NO BID NO BID
37. Transparent Lifters, 2" x 4", Lighting 1-2024 1
(100/box), NO SUBSTITUTION NO BID NO BID NO BID 28.00 NO BID NO BID
38. Transparent Lifters, 4" x 4", Lightning 1- 1
2044 (100/box), NO SUBSTITUTION NO BID NO BID NO BID 43.00 NO BID NO BID
39. Fingerprint reprint Labels, 100/box. Sirchie
FPT1091, or equal 650 500
Quantity/box None 500 1 Min.
Minimum Order Quantity Indenticator LE-42 E.C.P.Il. 1 Min. Signature Security
Brand/M odel 1000/bx #2542 Lightning 2-0039 | dentitabs
$/Box NO BID 16.60 23.00 19.95 NO BID 17.95
40. Fingerprint Reprint Labels, 100/box, NOTE 2
Indenticator LE-42 - NO SUBSTITUTION 650/box Identicator L E-42
Minimum Order Quantity 10 E.C.P.I. #2542
$/Box 19.95 NO BID 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
41. Hard Evidence Pouches, Lightning Powder
#1-4620 or equal, 20/pack
Quantity/box 20 20
Minimum Order Quantity None 1
Brand/M odel ACE CP3002 Loctite E.C.P.I. #2600 Lightning #1-4620
$/Pack 79.75 NO BID 59.00 69.95 NO BID NO BID
42. Slab & roller solvent cleaner, spray,
16 ounce non-fluor ocar bon aer osol, Sirchie 234T
or equivalent
Minimum Order Quantity
Brand/Stock # Sirchie
$/Each 6ea NO BID 8.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 8 of 11 Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doje'sInc. Delta L atent Products Sureprint Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
43. Waterlessskin cleaner, 16 ouncejar, Ace
7001, Sirchie FPT 249, Lynn Peavy 5578, CRP
46-379, Lightning 2-0044 or equal 6 None 1
Minimum Order Quantity 16 oz 16 oz 16 oz
Size Container - Packaging/Case Jar 24/cs 12/cs
Brand/M odel ACE 7001 Sirchie Vibra Clean #2506 Lightning #2-0044
$/Each 5.75 4.34 3.25 4.95 NO BID NO BID
44. Waterless skin cleaner, 128 ounce pump
container, citrus scent, contains aloe, lanolin and
jojoba, without pumice, Loctite“ Fast Orange
Liquid Hand Cleaner” or equal
Minimum Order Quantity None
Size Container-Packaging/Case 4/cs
Brand/Stock # Sirchie Vibra Clean #2507
$/Each 8ea NO BID 24.50 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
45. Ink cleaner towelettes, Sirchie FPT 254
(100/box) or equal
Minimum Order Quantity 3 None 1 1
Packaging/Box 100/bx 100/bx 100/bx 100/box
Brand/M odel ACE 7701 Sirchie #2514 Lightning #2-0050 Delta 178 - Nice-Pak Prods.
$/Box 124 bx 12.00 8.79 5.50 9.95 4.94 NO BID
46. Ink cleaner towelettes, Sirchie FPT 255
(1000/case) or equal 1
Minimum Order Quantity 1 None 1 1000/Case
Packaging/Case 1000/cs 10-100 Packs/cs 10/cs Delta #178 - Nice Paek Ink
Brand/M odel ACE 7702 Sirchie #2514 Lightning #2-0051 Remover Towelettes
$/Case 40 cs 110.00 86.59 55.00 90.00 48.00 NO BID
47. Latent Fingerprint Development Chemicals:
A. Amido Black, 1 liter, pre-mixed, ECPI 2627 or
equal. 1Lt.
Packaging 1 1Lt Liter/Bottle
Minimum Order Quantity Forensic Res. & Sply None 1
Brand/Product # Amido Black E.C.P.I. #2627 Doj€'s Catalog #202
$EA lea 25.12 NO BID 32.00 25.60 NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 9 of 11 Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doje'sInc. Delta L atent Products Sureprint Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
B. Amido Black, Destain, 1 liter, pre-mixed,
ECPI 2661 or equal.
Packaging 1Lt Liter
Minimum Order Quantity None 1
Brand/Product # E.C.P.I. #2661 Doj€' s Catalog #202A
$/EA lea NO BID NO BID 14.95 11.95 NO BID NO BID
C. Coomassi Blue, 1 liter, pre-mixed, ECPI 2662
or egual.
Packaging 1Lt. Liter
Minimum Order Quantitiy None 1
E.C.P.I. #2662 Doje's Catalog #203

Brand/Product # 2ea NO BID NO BID 24.95 19.95 NO BID NO BID
$EA
D. Coomassi Blue, destain, 1 liter, pre-mixed,
ECPI 2664 or equal.
Packaging 1Lt Liter
Minimum Order Quantity None 1
Brand/Product # E.C.P.I. #2664 Doj€' s Catalog #203A
$/EA 2ea NO BID NO BID 14.95 11.95 NO BID NO BID
E. Small Particulate Reagent, black, 1 liter, pre- NOTE 2
mixed, ECPI 2632 or equal. 1Gal
Packaging 1 1Lt. Liter
Minimum Order Quantity Forensic Res. & Sply None 1
Brand/Product # Sprint Sirchie 500M L -SPR100 E.C.P.I. #2632 Doje’ s Catalog #119
$/EA lea 35.15 24.25 12.95 10.35 NO BID NO BID
F. Small Particulate Reagent, White, 1 liter, pre- NOTE 2
mixed, ECPI 2630 or equal. 1Gal
Packaging 1 1Lt. Liter

Forensic Res. & Sply None 1
Minimum Order Quantity Sprint Sirchie 500ML SPR 200 E.C.P.I. #2630 Doje' s Catalog #120
Brand/Product # 35.15 24.26 12.95 10.35 NO BID NO BID
$EA
G. Luminol Reagent, 6 vilesto make 8 ounces
each, ECPI 2638 or equal.
Packaging 6 Pack
Minimum Order Quantity Sirchie Luminol 16 - Makes 6 Vials 1
Brand/Product # 160 oz. None #2638 Doje' s Catalog #811
$EA S5ea NO BID 50.05 35.00 28.00 NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 10 of 11 Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doje'sInc. Delta L atent Products Sureprint Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
H. “RAM” Mixture, liquid dye stain, 1 liter, pre-
mixed, ECPI 2658 or equal.
Packaging 1Lt. Liter
Minimum Order Quantity None 1
Brand/Product # E.C.P.I. #2658 Doje's Catalog #196
$/EA 2ea NO BID NO BID 26.95 21.50 NO BID NO BID
I. Sudan Black, 1 liter, pre-mixed, ECPI 2628 or
equal.
Packaging 1Lt. Liter
None 1
Minimum Order Quantity E.C.P.I. #2628 Doje's Catalog #237
Brand/Product # lea NO BID NO BID 18.95 15.20 NO BID NO BID
$/Ea
J. Adhesive-side Powder, 2 ounce, ECPI 2346 or VENDOR DID NOT
equal. RENEW
Packaging 2 Ox. 20z
Minimum Order Quantity None 1
Brand/Product # Sirchie ASP50 E.C.P.. Doje's Catalog #145
$/EA 5ea NO BID 21.54 12.95 10.35 NO BID NO BID
48. SharpsContainers, plastic with lid, with
styrofoam block inside.
A. 8" x 3/4", Lynn Peavy #5000 or equal. )
Packaging Pack of 12
Minimum Order Quantity None
Brand/Product # E.C.P.l. #1907
$/EA 200 ea NO BID NO BID 8.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
B. 12" x 3", Lynn Peavy #5002 or equal. 18" x 3"
Packaging 6 Pack
Minimum Order Quantity None
Brand/Product # E.C.P.l. #1918
$EA 150 ea NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



Page 11 of 11 Security Supply Lawmens & Shooters Evidence Coll & Prot Doje'sInc. Delta L atent Products Sureprint Inc.
Bid Number 11-99
DESCRIPTION 8 9 10 11 12 13
Warranty Statement Asper manufacturer. Lawmen’s & Shooters Satisfaction Guarenteed. All itemsbid are same 90 day warranty - products | NONE LISTED
Supply will replace products | Products may bereturned specified or equal to. satisfaction guaranteed.
that arefound to be defective | within 60 days for full ECPI items suggested are Replacement or refund,
up to oneyear at no cost to refund or credit. offered from same customer s choice.
the customer. manufacturer asJoj€'s
product line.
Doj€' sisadistributor for
Lightning Powder Co. The
Lightning itemsbid are
“Lightning Powder
Company” products.
Return Policy No penalty on defective Returns and/or Exchanges Telephone approval to All productsareguaranteed | Telephone authorization NONE LISTED

product.

will not be accepted unless
authorized by Lawmen’s &
Shooters Supply. Return of
stock items authorized by
Lawmen’s & Shooters
Supply returned unused
within seven days, will be
subject to a 20%
RESTOCKING FEE.
Returns of Defective
Products will be made within
oneyear at NO COST tothe
customer.

receive R.M.A.
Must notify E.C.P.I. within
60 days of delivery.

asdelivery. Oxidizersare
dated and will be accepted
asareturn within
reasonable time frame.

required.

BASISFOR AWARD: Best Price, Acceptable Delivery, on Approved Product.

NOTE 1. Please all shipping cost @ $650.00 for entire ordered as marked.
NOTE 2. Fingerprint reprint labels, Identicator LE-42 box contains 650 labels.
NOTE 3. Forensic Rescarch & Supply Sprint (SPR) is sold in gallon containers, It is dual surface black & white & is luminescent.



